

Exhibit A

COMPENSATION BY PROJECT CATEGORY⁶

Nortel Networks Inc., *et al.*
(Case No. 09-10138 (KG))

November 1, 2012 through November 30, 2012

Project Category	Total Hours	Total Fees
Case Administration	288.40	\$175,034.50
Claims Administration and Objections	44.00	25,163.00
Employee Matters	1,424.20	799,842.00
Intellectual Property	14.00	9,618.00
Fee and Employment Applications	111.40	58,332.50
Litigation	240.10	157,434.50
Real Estate	29.30	20,654.00
TOTAL	2,151.40	\$1,246,078.50

⁶ Note: This Application includes certain fees incurred during a period related to a previously submitted fee application, but not entered into the Cleary Gottlieb accounting system until the period covered by this Application.

MATTER: 17650-004 CASE ADMINISTRATION

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Bussigel, E.A.	09/28/12	Meeting J.Bromley, J.Opolsky re presentation, meeting graphics re same	1.00	630.00	32906978
Kim, J.	10/03/12	E-mails re: various case issues (.3).	.30	213.00	32808598
Bromley, J. L.	10/03/12	Em K. Hailey re foreign affiliate issues (.30)	.30	328.50	32727569
Kim, J.	10/04/12	Review settlement agreement (.3).	.30	213.00	32801410
Bromley, J. L.	10/04/12	Ems K. Hailey, Ray, R. Eckenrod re foreign affiliate issues filing and side letters (.40)	.40	438.00	32727727
Kim, J.	10/05/12	E-mails to M. Fleming re: staffing (.1).	.10	71.00	32808618
Bromley, J. L.	10/05/12	Em K.Hailey re foreign affiliate issues (.30)	.30	328.50	32727952
Kim, J.	10/08/12	Team meeting (1.0).	1.00	710.00	32801767
Bromley, J. L.	10/08/12	Call/mtg with Hailey, R. Eckenrod re foreign affiliate (.30).	.30	328.50	32728175
Kim, J.	10/09/12	Review correspondence re: agreements (.5).	.50	355.00	32802845
Bromley, J. L.	10/09/12	Conference Call with Hailey, R. Eckenrod re: foreign affiliate issues (.50); mtg with K. Hailey, R. Eckenrod re same (.70).	1.20	1,314.00	32728430
Kim, J.	10/11/12	Review settlement agreement (.3), T/C w/ L. Schweitzer re: settlement agreement (.2), t/c w/ R. Ryan re: settlement agreement (.2).	.70	497.00	32804232
Kim, J.	10/12/12	E-mails with M. Fleming re: staffing (.2).	.20	142.00	32804270
Kim, J.	10/16/12	T/C w/ M. Fleming re: case issue (.1).	.10	71.00	32804383
Kim, J.	10/17/12	E-mail to S. Doody (Allen & Overy) re: settlement agreement (.1), e-mails to K. Hailey, S. Delahaye, R. Narula, T. Ross (NNI) re: corporate document (.3).	.40	284.00	32804418
Kim, J.	10/18/12	Work re: settlement agreement (1.2).	1.20	852.00	32804512
Kim, J.	10/19/12	E-mails with M. Fleming re: staffing (.1).	.10	71.00	32804564
Kim, J.	10/22/12	E-mail to L. Barefoot re: bankruptcy issue, review correspondence.	.40	284.00	32807477
Kim, J.	10/24/12	E-mails re: various case issues (.6).	.60	426.00	32807561
Kim, J.	10/25/12	Review settlement agreement and e-mail to R. Ryan re: same (.4).	.40	284.00	32807597
Kim, J.	10/30/12	Correspondence re: case issue (.2).	.20	142.00	32808778

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Kim, J.	10/31/12	Review correspondence re: case issue (.8).	.80	568.00	32808815
Bromley, J. L.	11/01/12	Ems on case matters with various team members.	.50	547.50	32654176
Kim, J.	11/01/12	E-mails re: case issue (.4)	.40	284.00	32821284
Croft, J.	11/01/12	Emails re motion with L Schweitzer and K Hailey.	.20	138.00	32612645
Hailey, K.	11/01/12	T/c re: subsidiary issues A. Stout (NNI), L. Guerra (1.30); other emails, t/cs and review of subwinddown documents (1.50); emails re motion with J. Ray (NNI) (.20).	3.00	2,520.00	32844215
Lipner, L.	11/02/12	Reviewed purchase orders and agreements in connection with demand (2.5); Correspondence w J. Davison re same (.2).	2.70	1,782.00	32636161
Bromley, J. L.	11/02/12	Ems on case matters with various team members.	.50	547.50	32654164
Schweitzer, L.	11/02/12	J Ray (NNI), J Bromley e/ms (0.3). K Hailey t/c (0.2).	.50	520.00	32645162
Kim, J.	11/02/12	E-mails re: bankruptcy issue (.3)	.30	213.00	32821302
Croft, J.	11/02/12	Emails re motion filing deadline with K Hailey.	.20	138.00	32612863
Fleming, M. J.	11/02/12	Emails with B. Tunis re: staffing.	.10	69.00	32824464
Hailey, K.	11/02/12	Various emails, t/cs and review of NNI subsidiary issues documents with local counsel, A. Stout (NNI), R. Eckenrod re subsidiary issues (3.50); review foreign affiliate documents and emails with R. Eckenrod re same (1.00); t/cs and emails with L. Schweitzer and J. Croft re share certificate motion (.50).	5.00	4,200.00	32844344
Uziel, J.L.	11/02/12	Update case calendar (0.3); Email same to team (0.1); Emails to J. Bromley, L. Scwheitzer and R. Cooper re: hearing agenda (0.2)	.60	294.00	32678204
Eckenrod, R.D.	11/02/12	review of settlement agreement and motion re: foreign affiliate (1.7); preparation of documents re: foreign affiliate (3);	4.70	3,102.00	32595986
Eckenrod, R.D.	11/03/12	Preparation of documents re: foreign affiliate.	2.70	1,782.00	32595988
Opolsky, J. R.	11/04/12	Reviewing docket and summarizing the same for team.	.10	56.50	32667139
Hailey, K.	11/04/12	Emails with R. Eckenrod and Felix Xie re asset sale.	.50	420.00	32844376
Bromley, J. L.	11/05/12	Ems on case issues with H. Zelbo, L. Schweitzer, M. Kennedy (Chilmark), Davis Polk and tc Hodara (Akin) re same.	.50	547.50	32651169

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Schweitzer, L.	11/05/12	Telephone call M. Kennedy (Chilmark) regarding case issues.	.60	624.00	32688958
Kim, J.	11/05/12	E-mails to S. Doody (Allen & Overy) re: settlement agreement (.2), revise settlement agreement (.3)	.50	355.00	32821331
O'Keefe, P.	11/05/12	Circulated Nortel Networks news alert to L. Barefoot (.10)	.10	31.00	32656966
Lipner, L.	11/05/12	T/c w/J. Kim re closing cd's(.1); t/c w/J. Kim re same (.1); correspondence w/J. Kim re same (.1); Reviewed cd paths re same (.2); Correspondence w B. Short (N) re closing cd's (.2).	.70	462.00	32873056
Opolsky, J. R.	11/05/12	Review chp. 11 docket and summarizing for team.	.10	56.50	32667290
Bussigel, E.A.	11/05/12	Email T.Ross (NNI) re tax issue	.20	126.00	32652006
Diaba, L. S.	11/05/12	Research re: case issues	1.30	819.00	32833993
Hailey, K.	11/05/12	Emails, t/cs with local counsel, R. Eckenrod, A. Stout (NNI), local accountants re subsidiary issues and review of documents re same (1.90); review of and comment on documents re foreign affiliate and emails with R. Eckenrod re same (1.00); emails with R. Narula re case issue and review of same (.50); emails with A. Stout (NNI) and R. Eckenrod re foreign affiliate (.9).	4.30	3,612.00	32844716
Uziel, J.L.	11/05/12	Update case calendar and email same to team (0.1)	.10	49.00	32680380
Eckenrod, R.D.	11/05/12	EMs to client and K. Hailey re: foreign affiliate.	.80	528.00	32638356
Kim, J.	11/05/12	Prepare Closing documents and prepare in CD format to send to client per L. Lipner.	1.50	382.50	32675942
Kim, J.	11/05/12	Notebook received mail memos on electronic database.	1.00	255.00	32676134
Roll, J.	11/05/12	Searched electronic databases per J. Opolsky.	.50	127.50	32691210
Lashay, V.	11/05/12	Maintenance and updating electronic document database.	.80	212.00	32620411
Bromley, J. L.	11/06/12	Various ems on case matters.	.30	328.50	32651458
Schweitzer, L.	11/06/12	Miscellaneous e-mails regarding case issues.	.20	208.00	32689946
Kim, J.	11/06/12	E-mail to L. Taylor re: settlement agreement (.3)	.30	213.00	32821885

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Hailey, K.	11/06/12	Various emails, t/cs re subsidiary issues and review of documents re same (3.9); t/cs and emails with A. Stout (NNI) and R. Eckenrod re foreign affiliate (1.00); emails with T. Ross (NNI) re case issues (.50); review docs for tax claims (1.10).	6.50	5,460.00	32845008
Eckenrod, R.D.	11/06/12	EMs to K. Hailey, client and Beijing office re: foreign affiliate.	.70	462.00	32663173
Kim, J.	11/06/12	Managing and updating electronic database.	3.50	892.50	32678998
Roll, J.	11/06/12	Managing and updating electronic database.	.10	25.50	32691228
Cheung, S.	11/06/12	Circulated monitored docket online.	.50	75.00	32670347
Lipner, L.	11/07/12	T/c w/J. Davison re demand(1.1); preparation re same (.2).	1.30	858.00	32873095
Ilan, D.	11/07/12	Finalize notice letters; communications Megan St. Ledger; review email to team	2.50	1,975.00	32782070
Bromley, J. L.	11/07/12	Various ems on case matters	.40	438.00	32669213
Schweitzer, L.	11/07/12	Telephone calls M. Kennedy (Chilmark), Zelbo regarding case issues.	.40	416.00	32690037
Schweitzer, L.	11/07/12	Telephone call, e-mails F. Hodara (Akin) regarding same.	.30	312.00	32690042
Abularach, N.	11/07/12	Non-working travel time from New York to Delaware and Delaware to NY to/from hearing on LTD Discovery matters (50% of 3.5 or 1.7)	1.70	1,207.00	32680425
Opolsky, J. R.	11/07/12	Revising research re: case issues (.4); reviewing and summarizing chp.11 docket (.1).	.50	282.50	32667376
Diaba, L. S.	11/07/12	Reviewing case; research re: case issues.	4.00	2,520.00	32838815
Reeb, R.	11/07/12	Prepare documents relating to subsidiary issues.	2.50	1,575.00	32864726
Hailey, K.	11/07/12	Emails, t/cs with A. Stout, local counsel, R. Eckenrod re subsidiary winddowns and review of documents re same.	1.20	1,008.00	32845439
Kim, J.	11/07/12	Search electronic database per J. Opolsky.	.80	204.00	32679038
Whatley, C.	11/07/12	Docketed papers received.	1.80	270.00	32670047
Cheung, S.	11/07/12	Circulated monitored docket online.	.50	75.00	32670719
Ilan, D.	11/08/12	cfc Chris Hunter and corres re Overture	.50	395.00	32782179
Schweitzer, L.	11/08/12	E-mails J. Ray, M. Kennedy (Chilmark), etc. regarding case issues requests.	.10	104.00	32914787

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Schweitzer, L.	11/08/12	Kim e-mail regarding case issues.	.10	104.00	32914797
Opolsky, J. R.	11/08/12	Reviewing chp. 11 docket and summarizing same for team.	.10	56.50	32667750
Reeb, R.	11/08/12	Prepare documents relating to subsidiary issues.	1.30	819.00	32864728
Reeb, R.	11/08/12	Weekly call to discuss subsidiary issues.	.50	315.00	32864733
Reeb, R.	11/08/12	Meet with Kara Hailey to discuss subsidiary issues.	.20	126.00	32864742
Hailey, K.	11/08/12	Subsidiary issues call with A. Stout (NNI) and L. Guerra (1.00); emails, tcs and review of documents with local counsel, A. Stout (NNI), R. Eckenrod, R. Reeb re subsidiary windowns (1.50).	2.50	2,100.00	32845570
Kim, J.	11/08/12	Managing and updating electronic database.	3.90	994.50	32679178
Roll, J.	11/08/12	Managing and updating electronic database.	.10	25.50	32696561
Whatley, C.	11/08/12	Docketed papers received.	1.00	150.00	32670057
Cheung, S.	11/08/12	Circulated monitored docket online.	.50	75.00	32675515
Bromley, J. L.	11/09/12	Call with A. Pisa (Milbank); tc Randy Bennett (Rueter Scorgall); ems J.Ray (NNI), Torys re case matters with L. Schweitzer, H. Zelbo, J. Ray, Chilmark.	.70	766.50	32677312
Schweitzer, L.	11/09/12	J. Ray (NNI) e-mails regarding various case matters.	.20	208.00	32914405
Schweitzer, L.	11/09/12	M. Blythe (Linklaters) e-mails regarding case issues.	.10	104.00	32914452
Schweitzer, L.	11/09/12	E-mails S. Bomhof (Torys), etc. regarding case issues.	.10	104.00	32914494
Kim, J.	11/09/12	Email re: employee claim (.1)	.10	71.00	32817447
Fleming, M. J.	11/09/12	Email to J. Opolsky re: professional retention.	.10	69.00	32707052
Fleming, M. J.	11/09/12	T/c with J. Opolsky re: professional retention.	.10	69.00	32707106
Fleming, M. J.	11/09/12	T/c with L. Schweitzer re: staffing.	.10	69.00	32715906
Fleming, M. J.	11/09/12	T/c with J. Croft re: staffing.	.10	69.00	32715960
Fleming, M. J.	11/09/12	T/c with A. O'Donahue re: staffing.	.10	69.00	32715963
Lipner, L.	11/09/12	Correspondence w/L. Schweitzer re case management.	.20	132.00	32854741

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Opolsky, J. R.	11/09/12	Review and summary of chp. 11 and chp. 15 dockets (.2); t/c w/ D. Stein re: professional retention (.1); t/c w/ M. Fleming re: the same (.1).	.40	226.00	32703234
Diaba, L. S.	11/09/12	Nortel Team meeting.	1.20	756.00	32834020
Reeb, R.	11/09/12	Prepare documents relating to subsidiary issues.	.30	189.00	32864830
Hailey, K.	11/09/12	Emails, tcs and review of documents with local counsel, A. Stout (NNI), R. Eckenrod, R. Reeb re subsidiary issues (1.9); review and revision of documents re: foreign affiliate (1.00).	2.90	2,436.00	32846477
Uziel, J.L.	11/09/12	Update case calendar (0.2); Email same to team (0.1)	.30	147.00	32683151
Roll, J.	11/09/12	Corr. w/ H. Zelbo re case issues.	.10	25.50	32696573
Whatley, C.	11/09/12	Docketed papers received.	.30	45.00	32680746
Cheung, S.	11/09/12	Circulated monitored docket online.	.50	75.00	32741613
Zahoroda, Y.	11/09/12	Docket update.	.30	45.00	32677052
Fleming, M. J.	11/10/12	Emails with J. Opolsky and M. Bunda re: professional retention.	.20	138.00	32722066
Fleming, M. J.	11/11/12	Emails to J. Opolsky re: professional retention.	.20	138.00	32722112
Opolsky, J. R.	11/11/12	Emails to M. Fleming re: professional retention.	.10	56.50	32703446
Schweitzer, L.	11/12/12	Davis Polk e-mails regarding case issues.	.10	104.00	32914944
Schweitzer, L.	11/12/12	E-mails Ray (NNI), Kennedy (Chilmark), etc. regarding case issues.	.60	624.00	32914954
Fleming, M. J.	11/12/12	Office conference with A. O'Donahue re: case background.	1.10	759.00	32719465
Fleming, M. J.	11/12/12	T/c with R. Ryan re: staffing.	.10	69.00	32720307
Fleming, M. J.	11/12/12	T/c with J. Croft re: staffing.	.10	69.00	32720313
Opolsky, J. R.	11/12/12	Review and summary of chp. 11 docket.	.10	56.50	32703897
Uziel, J.L.	11/12/12	email to team re: case calendar	.10	49.00	32828516
Whatley, C.	11/12/12	Docketed papers received.	.20	30.00	32689895
Cheung, S.	11/12/12	Circulated monitored docket online.	.50	75.00	32741663
Lashay, V.	11/12/12	Updating and maintaining electronic production database.	.30	79.50	32678025
Lipner, L.	11/13/12	Correspondence w/T. Maziarz re demand (.1).	.10	66.00	32855173

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Bromley, J. L.	11/13/12	Ems Torys, others re case issues; ems on case matters with L. Schweitzer, H. Zelbo, J. Ray (NNI), Chilmark (.30)	.30	328.50	32839617
Schweitzer, L.	11/13/12	Work on case issues.	1.50	1,560.00	32915298
Kim, J.	11/13/12	Review letter re: products (.1), emails to L. Schweitzer, T. Ross, J. Croft and t/c w/ J. Croft re: same. (.5)	.60	426.00	32817562
Croft, J.	11/13/12	Drafting letter re contract counterparty	.50	345.00	32691991
Fleming, M. J.	11/13/12	Emails to J. Croft re: staffing.	.20	138.00	32780391
Fleming, M. J.	11/13/12	T/c with J. Kim re: staffing.	.20	138.00	32780415
Fleming, M. J.	11/13/12	T/c with R. Ryan re: staffing.	.10	69.00	32780491
Fleming, M. J.	11/13/12	Emails to R. Ryan and J. Kim re: staffing.	.20	138.00	32780501
Fleming, M. J.	11/13/12	Emails to J. Opolsky re: professional retention.	.20	138.00	32780522
Fleming, M. J.	11/13/12	T/c with J. Croft re: staffing.	.10	69.00	32780534
Opolsky, J. R.	11/13/12	Emails to M. Fleming, N. Forrest, P. Brooks (Towers) re: professional retention (.2); review and summary of chp. 11 docket (.1).	.30	169.50	32777024
Hailey, K.	11/13/12	Emails, t/c with A. Stout (NNI) and local counsel re subsidiary issues and review of documents re same (1.50); conf. call with local counsel, local accountants and A. Stout re foreign affiliate and revising of letter re same (.50); conf. call with A. Stout (NNI) re subsidiary issues open issues (.50)	2.50	2,100.00	32698660
Uziel, J.L.	11/13/12	Review hearing agenda (0.2); Email to team re: same (0.1)	.30	147.00	32828553
Kostov, M.N.	11/13/12	Communication w J. Opolsky re coverage (.2)	.20	113.00	32750240
Kim, J.	11/13/12	Correspondence with L. Peacock re: case issues.	.20	51.00	32712465
Kim, J.	11/13/12	Manage and update electronic database.	4.80	1,224.00	32712477
Roll, J.	11/13/12	Weekly workstream updates per M. Fleming.	.20	51.00	32844442
Whatley, C.	11/13/12	Docketed papers received.	2.00	300.00	32697437
Cheung, S.	11/13/12	Circulated monitored docket online.	.50	75.00	32741765
Lipner, L.	11/14/12	T/c w/J. Davison (N) and T. Maziarz (N) re demand letter (1.5); Correspondence w/D. Herrington re same (1.4); Correspondence w/J. Davison re same (.2); Reviewed relevant documentation (.2).	3.30	2,178.00	32850673

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Martin, J.	11/14/12	Extensive research re: case issues.	7.50	2,625.00	32698909
Streatfeild, L.	11/14/12	Extensive work reviewing research re: case issues and providing comments and redrafting; reviewing chart; further comments; finalising and circulating to team.	5.30	4,399.00	32725053
Bromley, J. L.	11/14/12	Emails on various case matters with L. Schweitzer, H. Zelbo, J. Ray (NNI), Chilmark (.50)	.50	547.50	32839874
Schweitzer, L.	11/14/12	Telephone call regarding case issues.	.10	104.00	32915474
Schweitzer, L.	11/14/12	Review new pleadings, correspondence.	.60	624.00	32915651
Fleming, M. J.	11/14/12	Email to R. Ryan re: staffing.	.10	69.00	32742210
Fleming, M. J.	11/14/12	Email to J. Croft re: staffing.	.10	69.00	32742216
Fleming, M. J.	11/14/12	Email to M. Bunda re: staffing.	.10	69.00	32747524
Fleming, M. J.	11/14/12	Email to L. Schweitzer re: staffing.	.10	69.00	32747541
Hailey, K.	11/14/12	Emails, tcs with local counsel, R. Eckenrod, A. Stout (NNI) re subsidiary issues.	1.20	1,008.00	32842405
Uziel, J.L.	11/14/12	Email to L. Schweitzer re: omnibus hearing (0.1); Email to MNAT (A. Cordo and T. Minott) re: hearing agenda (0.1); Update case calendar (0.2); Email to L. Schweitzer and J. Bromley re: hearing agenda (0.2)	.60	294.00	32828712
Kim, J.	11/14/12	Notebook received mail memos.	5.70	1,453.50	32712464
Roll, J.	11/14/12	Organized case files and updated litigator's notebook	3.80	969.00	32787033
Whatley, C.	11/14/12	Docketed papers received.	1.50	225.00	32718306
Lashay, V.	11/14/12	Maintain and update electronic database.	.40	106.00	32693927
Lashay, V.	11/14/12	Maintain and update electronic database.	.60	159.00	32698917
Zahoroda, Y.	11/14/12	Docket update.	.30	45.00	32728619
Lipner, L.	11/15/12	Correspondence w/T. Maziarz re demand (.4).	.40	264.00	32855237
Schweitzer, L.	11/15/12	Telephone call K. Callahan (US Trustee) regarding case issues.	.10	104.00	32716206
Schweitzer, L.	11/15/12	Telephone call F. Hodara (Akin).	.10	104.00	32716209
Schweitzer, L.	11/15/12	Telephone call H. Zelbo.	.10	104.00	32716221
Schweitzer, L.	11/15/12	Croft e-mails regarding supplier issue.	.10	104.00	32716237

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Kim, J.	11/15/12	Review letter re: product (.2), email to J. Croft re: same. (.1)	.30	213.00	32817768
Croft, J.	11/15/12	Drafting letters to purchasers re notice, including emails with J Kim and L Schweitzer re same and reviewing purchase agreements re same (2.2); calls and emails with K Hailey re motion (.2); email to Canadian Debtors, including reviewing their comments re same (.3).	2.70	1,863.00	32722989
Fleming, M. J.	11/15/12	Emails re: staffing meeting.	.30	207.00	32748070
Fleming, M. J.	11/15/12	Reviewed 2014 statement.	.40	276.00	32772891
Fleming, M. J.	11/15/12	Email to J. Opolosky re: professional retention.	.10	69.00	32772924
Fleming, M. J.	11/15/12	Email to L. Schweitzer re: professional retention.	.20	138.00	32772937
Fleming, M. J.	11/15/12	T/c with J. Croft re: professional retention.	.10	69.00	32772952
Fleming, M. J.	11/15/12	Email to J. Opolsky re: professional retention.	.20	138.00	32772963
Fleming, M. J.	11/15/12	Email to L. Schweitzer and client re: retention.	1.00	690.00	32772970
Lipner, L.	11/15/12	Correspondence re case mgmt w J. Uziel (.1).	.10	66.00	32855412
Hailey, K.	11/15/12	Emails with A. Stout, local counsel and discussions with J. Bromley, J. Ray and R. Eckenrod re subsidiary issues (1.00); t/c with J. Croft re share certificates (.1).	1.10	924.00	32718920
Uziel, J.L.	11/15/12	Emails to L. Schweitzer, J. Bromley, A. Cordo (MNAT) and T. Minott (MNAT) re: hearing agenda (0.3), Update case calendar (0.1); Draft calendar email to team (0.1)	.50	245.00	32828870
Kim, J.	11/15/12	Organize and update electronic database.	5.20	1,326.00	32712455
Roll, J.	11/15/12	Corr. w/ M. Fleming re workstreams	.10	25.50	32787286
Roll, J.	11/15/12	Review of notice documents and related process	.50	127.50	32787291
Roll, J.	11/15/12	Organize and update electronic database.	2.70	688.50	32787362
Lashay, V.	11/15/12	Update electronic database.	1.50	397.50	32706357
Zahoroda, Y.	11/15/12	Docket update.	.20	30.00	32728994
Bromley, J. L.	11/16/12	Emails on case matters with L. Schweitzer, H. Zelbo, J. Ray, Chilmark (.40)	.40	438.00	32840921
Schweitzer, L.	11/16/12	Conference Croft, etc.	.50	520.00	32841165
Schweitzer, L.	11/16/12	Telephone call Bromley.	.40	416.00	32841281
Schweitzer, L.	11/16/12	Review case decision.	.30	312.00	32842039

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Croft, J.	11/16/12	Updating letters to purchasers and coordinating service of same, including with J. Roll (1.3); meeting with L Schweitzer re same (.2).	1.50	1,035.00	32728667
Opolsky, J. R.	11/16/12	Review proceedings.	.30	169.50	32777124
Hailey, K.	11/16/12	Emails, t/c and conf. calls with R. Eckenrod, R. Reeb, A. Stout, L. Guerra, local counsel and local accountants re subsidiary winddowns and review of documents re same.	3.20	2,688.00	32841329
Uziel, J.L.	11/16/12	Calendar email to team	.10	49.00	32828896
Eckenrod, R.D.	11/16/12	T/c with client and K. Hailey re: wind-down entities (1.3); EMs to K. Hailey re: wind-down entity (.2); EM to local counsel re: wind-down entity (.5); EM to F. Xie re: amounts owed (.3)	2.30	1,518.00	32723565
Kim, J.	11/16/12	Notebook memos on Case admin notebook.	1.00	255.00	32733332
Roll, J.	11/16/12	Prepared All Service letters for mailing per J. Croft (1.5); added documents to litigator's notebook and organized case files (1.7).	3.20	816.00	32742061
Whatley, C.	11/16/12	Docketed papers received.	1.00	150.00	32731559
Zahoroda, Y.	11/16/12	Docket update.	.20	30.00	32729106
Eckenrod, R.D.	11/17/12	EM re: amounts owed (.1); EM to local counsel re: wind-down entity (.7); revisions to documents for EM to K. Hailey re: settlement (1)	1.80	1,188.00	32723577
Bromley, J. L.	11/18/12	Emails Hailey, R. Eckenrod, J. Ray re revised foreign affiliate issues (.50).	.50	547.50	32841870
Hailey, K.	11/18/12	Conf. call with Felix Xiu, R. Eckenrod and others re liquidation (.9) and review of emails re same (.1); emails with local counsel, R. Eckenrod re sub wd (.50).	1.50	1,260.00	32742423
Eckenrod, R.D.	11/18/12	EMs to K. Hailey, J. Bromley, client and UCC counsel re: settlement agreement (.8); t/cs with K. Hailey and others re: amounts owed (.9); prep re same (.7)	2.40	1,584.00	32726254
Eckenrod, R.D.	11/18/12	EM to local advisors re: discussion of tax matters	.10	66.00	32726256
Brod, C. B.	11/19/12	Telephone call and conference Schweitzer (.30); telephone call Schweitzer (.10); e-mail Schweitzer, Flow, Zelbo (.20).	.60	657.00	32849058
Lipner, L.	11/19/12	O/c w/D. Herrington re demand letter (.8) Preparation re same (.7); Correspondence w/J. Davison re same (.2).	1.70	1,122.00	32857497

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Bromley, J. L.	11/19/12	Ems LS, Chilmark, others re mediation issues (.40)	.40	438.00	32842848
Schweitzer, L.	11/19/12	Ray e-mails regarding case matters.	.30	312.00	32843651
Schweitzer, L.	11/19/12	Coleman e-mails.	.10	104.00	32843674
Schweitzer, L.	11/19/12	Comms, e-mails Ryan, Zelbo, Brod, Kennedy regarding mediation issues.	1.20	1,248.00	32843859
O'Keefe, P.	11/19/12	Phone call with M. Kahn regarding Epiq's Nortel Restructuring website	.10	31.00	32737544
O'Keefe, P.	11/19/12	Circulated Nortel Netwroks newswire alerts to L. Barefoot	.10	31.00	32737561
Opolsky, J. R.	11/19/12	Review of CCAA proceedings (.1); revising summary re: the same (.1); review and summary of chp. 11 and chp. 15 dockets (.3).	.50	282.50	32777130
Reeb, R.	11/19/12	Prepare documents relating to subsidiary wind-down.	.80	504.00	32864924
Hailey, K.	11/19/12	Conf. call with client Eckenrod re sub tax assessments (.50); conf. call with A. Stout, R. Eckenrod re liquidation and emails re same (.40); various emails, comms. with local counsel, R. Reeb, R. Eckenrod, A. Stout re sub winddowns and review of documents re same (1.00); conf. call with F. Xiu, R. Eckenrod and Lynne re liquidations and repayment(.3) and emails re same (.5).	2.70	2,268.00	32742463
Uziel, J.L.	11/19/12	Update case calendar (0.1); Email to J. Ray re: same (0.1)	.20	98.00	32834309
Eckenrod, R.D.	11/19/12	T/C w/ client and K. Hailey re: tax issues.(.5); prep re: same (.1)	.60	396.00	32760854
Eckenrod, R.D.	11/19/12	T/c with client and K. Hailey re: amounts owed (.3); EM to local counsel re: settlement motion (.2); EMs to K. Hailey and local advisors re: wind-down items (.5); EM to client re: local advisor invoicing (.2); t/c with counterpart re: amounts owed (.6); EM to J. Bromley and K. Hailey re: amounts owed (.6)	2.40	1,584.00	32760856
Kim, J.	11/19/12	Send K. Hailey emails to VFR and send doc id numbers to J. Opolsky per J. Opolsky.	.50	127.50	32769954
Kim, J.	11/19/12	Add VFR'd emails and other memos to notebook per J. Opolsky.	.60	153.00	32769978
Roll, J.	11/19/12	Saved letters to desksite per J. Croft	.20	51.00	32787432

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Roll, J.	11/19/12	Added document to litigator's notebook per J. Opolsky	.10	25.50	32787433
Whatley, C.	11/19/12	Docketed papers received.	1.00	150.00	32741901
Zahoroda, Y.	11/19/12	Docket update.	.20	30.00	32746098
Brod, C. B.	11/20/12	Review case doc (.30); telephone call and conference Lanzkron (.20); mark-up discussion (.50); review case doc, amended Order (.30); follow-up with Lanzkron (.10); e-mail Lanzkron (.10).	1.50	1,642.50	32849698
Lipner, L.	11/20/12	T/c w/J. Davison (N) re demand letter (1.5); Preparation re same (.5); Correspondence w/D. Herrington re same (.2); Correspondence w purchaser counsel re same (.2).	2.40	1,584.00	32857558
Bromley, J. L.	11/20/12	Call re: employee issues (.40); various ems on case matters with L. Schweitzer, J. Ray, H. Zelbo, others (.40).	.80	876.00	32842917
Schweitzer, L.	11/20/12	Telephone call Ray regarding various case matters.	.70	728.00	32779325
Schweitzer, L.	11/20/12	E-mails Lanzkron regarding case doc draft.	.10	104.00	32779369
Fleming, M. J.	11/20/12	Email re: amended agenda.	.10	69.00	32773897
O'Keefe, P.	11/20/12	Circulated Nortel Netwroks newswire alerts to L. Barefoot	.10	31.00	32747576
Lipner, L.	11/20/12	Correspondence re case issue (.3); Correspondence re claim (.3).	.60	396.00	32857660
Bussigel, E.A.	11/20/12	T/c D. Ilan, and others re case issue.	.30	189.00	32772742
Reeb, R.	11/20/12	Prepare documents relating to subsidiary wind-down.	1.80	1,134.00	32864928
Reeb, R.	11/20/12	Call to discuss wind-down and related preparation.	.80	504.00	32864938
Hailey, K.	11/20/12	Call with John Ray re subsidiary winddowns (1.00); various emails, comms calls re subsidiary winddowns with local counsel, A. Stout, R. Eckenrod and R. Reeb re same (2.20); distribution comm. with R. Eckenrod, A. Stout and review of documents re same (1.00)	4.20	3,528.00	32842810
Uziel, J.L.	11/20/12	Email to L. Scwheitzer re: hearing agenda (0.1); T/C with A. Cordo re: same (0.1)	.20	98.00	32837872

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Eckenrod, R.D.	11/20/12	T/c with local advisors and K. Hailey re: wind-down entity (.2); EMs to local advisors re: wind-down entity (.5); comm with client and K. Hailey re: wind-down (.5)	1.20	792.00	32760857
Kostov, M.N.	11/20/12	Review of invoice (EPIQ) (.2)	.20	113.00	32799979
Kim, J.	11/20/12	Organize memos in the notebook.	3.40	867.00	32773923
Whatley, C.	11/20/12	Docketed papers received.	.20	30.00	32771339
Cheung, S.	11/20/12	Circulated monitored docket online.	.50	75.00	32768739
Zahoroda, Y.	11/20/12	Docket update.	.20	30.00	32746182
Martin, J.	11/21/12	Redrafting elements of note.	.30	105.00	32750791
Bromley, J. L.	11/21/12	Emails on case matters with L. Schweitzer, H. Zelbo, J. Ray, Chilmark (.50)	.50	547.50	32845738
Fleming, M. J.	11/21/12	Non-working travel to DE (50% of 1.0 or .50).	.50	345.00	32779287
Fleming, M. J.	11/21/12	Non-working travel from DE (50% of .70 or .40).	.40	276.00	32779490
Fleming, M. J.	11/21/12	Attended hearing and related preparation.	4.80	3,312.00	32779510
Fleming, M. J.	11/21/12	Emails to J. Opolsky re: retention.	.30	207.00	32779520
O'Keefe, P.	11/21/12	Circulated Nortel Networks newswire alerts to L. Barefoot	.10	31.00	32768782
Opolsky, J. R.	11/21/12	Emails to M. Fleming and K. Ponder re: retention (.2); review and summarize chp. 11 (.1)	.30	169.50	32853412
Hailey, K.	11/21/12	Emails with F. Xie re foreign affiliate debt.	.50	420.00	32843685
Uziel, J.L.	11/21/12	Emails to L. Schweitzer and M. Fleming re: employee issues (0.2); Preparation for hearing (0.1); Hearing on motion (2.3)	2.60	1,274.00	32841302
Eckenrod, R.D.	11/21/12	EM to client re: employee issues wind-down entity	1.10	726.00	32760859
Roll, J.	11/21/12	Organized case documents and updated litigator's notebook.	1.30	331.50	32849672
Cheung, S.	11/21/12	Circulated monitored docket online.	.50	75.00	32769903
Bromley, J. L.	11/22/12	Ems K. Hailey on foreign affiliate issues (.20); ems Stam on foreign affiliate issues (.10)	.30	328.50	32840241
O'Donohue, A. K	11/23/12	Research case issue at request of R. Ryan.	3.90	1,618.50	32778179
Schweitzer, L.	11/23/12	E-mails regarding Canadian hearing.	.10	104.00	32836815

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Hailey, K.	11/23/12	Emails with local counsel re subsidiary winddowns.	1.00	840.00	32771882
Hailey, K.	11/24/12	Emails with local counsel re subsidiary winddowns.	.50	420.00	32771787
Schweitzer, L.	11/25/12	Review of miscellaneous correspondence.	.40	416.00	32836974
Hailey, K.	11/25/12	Emails with local counsel re subsidiary winddowns.	.50	420.00	32771742
Eckenrod, R.D.	11/25/12	Draft EM re: region amounts owed	.30	198.00	32817211
Opolsky, J. R.	11/26/12	Reviewing and summarizing chp. 11 docket (.1); t/c re: retention (.3); emails to J. Croft re: staffing (.1); emails to M. Fleming re: retention (.1).	.60	339.00	32778077
Lipner, L.	11/26/12	Correspondence w/J Davison re demand letter (.2).	.20	132.00	32851219
Bromley, J. L.	11/26/12	Ems on various case matters (.50).	.50	547.50	32858839
Schweitzer, L.	11/26/12	Ray e-mails regarding various case matters.	.10	104.00	32845988
Schweitzer, L.	11/26/12	Conference Croft A. Cerceo regarding claims objection issue.	.20	208.00	32846001
Schweitzer, L.	11/26/12	Case issues e-mail.	.10	104.00	32846155
Schweitzer, L.	11/26/12	Review new pleadings, correspondence including fee apps.	.60	624.00	32846752
Croft, J.	11/26/12	Reviewing notice and emails with J. Opolsky and J. Kim re same (.3).	.30	207.00	32777870
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Emails to J. Opolsky re: retention.	.20	138.00	32810620
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Reviewed dockets.	.20	138.00	32810879
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	T/c with L. Schweitzer re: staffing.	.10	69.00	32836850
Hailey, K.	11/26/12	Various emails and comms with A. Stout, R. Eckenrod, R. Reeb and local counsel re subsidiary winddowns and review of documents re same.	1.00	840.00	32822163
Uziel, J.L.	11/26/12	Update case calendar (0.1); Email to J. Ray re: same (0.1)	.20	98.00	32842890
Eckenrod, R.D.	11/26/12	EM to local advisors, K. Hailey and client re: wind-now entity (.4); EM to client re: wind-down entity (.4); EM to local advisors re: wind-down entity (.9); EM to M. Steecker re: case issues (.4); EM to client re: wind-down entity (.2); preparation for OM re: amounts owed (.1).	2.40	1,584.00	32822913

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Kim, J.	11/26/12	Distribute Hearing transcript and add to the notebook.	.50	127.50	32841351
Whatley, C.	11/26/12	Docketed papers received.	.30	45.00	32787957
Cheung, S.	11/26/12	Circulated monitored docket online.	.50	75.00	32815820
Lashay, V.	11/26/12	Plan year metadata overlay into review database	.30	79.50	32766755
Lashay, V.	11/26/12	Document processing through LAW; Data import to review database and image project; Database maintenance	.70	185.50	32771393
Lipner, L.	11/27/12	Correspondence w/T. Maziarz re demand letter (.3); Reviewed client work re same (.2).	.50	330.00	32852016
Schweitzer, L.	11/27/12	Conference regarding case issues.	.30	312.00	32786288
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Emails to J. Opolsky re: retention.	.20	138.00	32825296
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Reviewed agenda.	.10	69.00	32825330
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Call with D. Abbott, A. Cordo and J. Opolsky re: case issues.	.30	207.00	32825340
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	T/c with J. Kim re: staffing.	.10	69.00	32825375
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Edited email re: case issue.	.80	552.00	32825391
O'Keefe, P.	11/27/12	Circulated Nortel Networks newswire alerts to L. Barefoot	.10	31.00	32811987
Opolsky, J. R.	11/27/12	Reviewing retention documents (1.1); emails to M. Fleming re: the same (.4); Email to L. Schweitzer and D. Abbott re: retention (.4); reviewing and summarizing chp. 11 docket (.2); email to K. Ponder re: retention (.1).	2.20	1,243.00	32811120
Hailey, K.	11/27/12	Various emails and t/cs with team and local counsel re subsidiary winddowns and review of documents re same.	1.50	1,260.00	32801903
Eckenrod, R.D.	11/27/12	review of case issues (.2); prep for OM re: amounts owed and other wind-down matters (1.4); EMs to client re: wind-down entity (.6); review of steps re: wind-down entity for EMs to client and local advisors (.6)	2.80	1,848.00	32817225
Kim, J.	11/27/12	Revise doc re: employee issues per J. Croft.	.60	153.00	32841613
Kim, J.	11/27/12	Notebook pleadings.	.80	204.00	32841662
Cheung, S.	11/27/12	Circulated monitored docket online.	.30	45.00	32815893
Ilan, D.	11/28/12	corres re execution short forms; corres re past deals and patents	1.20	948.00	32804538

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Lipner, L.	11/28/12	T/c w/J. Davison (N) re demand letter (1.1); Preparation re same (.5).	1.60	1,056.00	32852169
Fleming, M. J.	11/28/12	Email re: staffing meeting.	.10	69.00	32824825
O'Keefe, P.	11/28/12	Circulate Nortel Networks news alerts to L. Barefoot	.10	31.00	32811964
Opolsky, J. R.	11/28/12	T/c w/ L. Lipner re: retention (.1); correspondence re: the same (.2); reviewing and summarizing chp. 11 docket for team (.1).	.40	226.00	32811200
Eckenrod, R.D.	11/28/12	EM to client re: wind-down entity (.2); discussion with J. Bromley re: amounts owed (.1); EMs to K. Hailey and client re: wind-down entities (.2)	.50	330.00	32817243
Cheung, S.	11/28/12	Circulated monitored docket online.	.50	75.00	32816505
Lashay, V.	11/28/12	Data processing through LAW; Data import to review database and image project; Database maintenance	.80	212.00	32790930
Bromley, J.	11/29/12	Ems on case matters with L. Schweitzer, H. Zelbo, J. Ray, Chilmark (.4)	.40	438.00	33103121
Schweitzer, L.	11/29/12	E-mails regarding case issues.	.20	208.00	32838539
Schweitzer, L.	11/29/12	Telephone call Larson, Croft.	.20	208.00	32838576
Schweitzer, L.	11/29/12	Opolsky e-mails regarding case issues.	.20	208.00	32839687
Schweitzer, L.	11/29/12	Ray, Zelbo e-mails regarding mediation case admin.	.40	416.00	32840258
Schweitzer, L.	11/29/12	Review fee apps, new pleadings filed.	.40	416.00	32840308
Croft, J.	11/29/12	Meeting with J. Opolsky re case issues (.3). Subsequent calls and emails with same re same (.3). Reviewing 12.5.2012 agenda (.1).	.70	483.00	32816511
Fleming, M. J.	11/29/12	Emails with J. Opolsky re: retention.	.20	138.00	32824993
Opolsky, J. R.	11/29/12	Emails to L. Schweitzer re: retention (.2); email to M. Fleming re: the same (.2); email to J. Ray re: the same (.2); emails re: the same (.2); ; t/c w/ J. Roll re: the same (.1); t/c w/ J. Kim re: the same (.1); t/c to M. Fleming re: the same (.1); review of documents re: correspondence (.5); drafting letter to purchaser re: the same (.8); emails to J. Croft re: the same (.2); meeting w/ J. Croft re: the same (.4); t/c w/ local counsel re: case issues (.2); reviewing and summarizing chp. 11 docket (.1).	3.30	1,864.50	32853599
Bussigel, E.A.	11/29/12	T/c re case question.	.20	126.00	32845604

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Reeb, R.	11/29/12	Prepare documents relating to subsidiary wind-down.	2.50	1,575.00	32865096
Hailey, K.	11/29/12	conf. calls, emails and tcs with local counsel, A. Stout, R. Eckenrod	1.20	1,008.00	32839610
Eckenrod, R.D.	11/29/12	EM to local advisor re: wind-down entity	.20	132.00	32817234
Whatley, C.	11/29/12	Docketed papers received.	.30	45.00	32824788
Cheung, S.	11/29/12	Circulated monitored docket online.	.50	75.00	32816807
Lashay, V.	11/29/12	Document production build and processing; Production data compression; Production data upload to FTP; Production metadata import to review database	.80	212.00	32807395
Bromley, J.	11/30/12	Calls and ems on case matters with L. Schweitzer, H. Zelbo, J. Ray, Chilmark (.5)	.50	547.50	33103143
Schweitzer, L.	11/30/12	Client e-mails regarding fees.	.10	104.00	32838037
Schweitzer, L.	11/30/12	E-mails Forrest, Bunda, Fleming, etc. regarding employee issues.	.30	312.00	32838070
Kim, J.	11/30/12	Revise motion.	.80	568.00	32843478
Croft, J.	11/30/12	Calls and emails with J Opolsky and J Roll re case issues.	.50	345.00	32845150
Opolsky, J. R.	11/30/12	Emails re: retention (.1); emails to client re: the same (.1); m/w J. Roll re: correspondence to purchasers (.1); review the same (.6); t/c w/ M. Fleming re: case issues (.1); email re: correspondence with purchasers (.1); review and summarize chp. 11 and 15 dockets (.1).	1.20	678.00	32853783
Diaba, L. S.	11/30/12	Revised the draft memo re: case issues.	1.50	945.00	32834544
Reeb, R.	11/30/12	Weekly call to discuss wind-down issues.	1.00	630.00	32865132
Reeb, R.	11/30/12	Prepare documents relating to subsidiary wind-down.	.50	315.00	32865134
Hailey, K.	11/30/12	Conf. call with A. Stout re tax issues (.8); conf. call with A. Stout team, L. Guerra re subsidiary winddowns (1.10); emails, t/c with A. Stout, local counsel, R. Reeb re subsidiary wind-downs (.9);	2.80	2,352.00	32840536
Eckenrod, R.D.	11/30/12	T/C with client re: wind-down entities	1.00	660.00	32826960
Eckenrod, R.D.	11/30/12	t/c w/ local advisors re: tax issues	.60	396.00	32826962
Kim, J.	11/30/12	Notebook emailed memos.	.50	127.50	32842668
Roll, J.	11/30/12	Prepared letters for mailing per J. Opolsky	2.00	510.00	32860206

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Lashay, V.	11/30/12	Incoming production data import to project for boundary modification	.30	79.50	32821996
Zahoroda, Y.	11/30/12	Docket update.	.20	30.00	32850403
Zahoroda, Y.	11/30/12	Docket update.	.30	45.00	32850612
		MATTER TOTALS:	288.40	175,034.50	

MATTER: 17650-005 CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION AND OBJECTIONS

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Bussigel, E.A.	09/27/12	Finalizing motion for filing and email MNAT re same	.70	441.00	32905413
Bussigel, E.A.	09/28/12	Emails claimant re adjournment, emails EY re tax claim issue	.80	504.00	32906990
Forrest, N.	11/01/12	Read latest emails with counsel for customer re open information request re claims issues	.50	420.00	32632046
Opolsky, J. R.	11/01/12	Drafting summary of research re: case issues.	.50	282.50	32666743
Bussigel, E.A.	11/02/12	Email J.Bromley re claim issue, t/c claimant re same (.8), email EY re liability estimates (.2), drafting settlement letter and email J.Bromley re same (1.5),	2.50	1,575.00	32864963
Forrest, N.	11/05/12	T/c counsel for customer re settlement of claims issues (.40); review emails re last communications with customer and pending proposals and emails S. Sado and J Palmer re same (1.30)	1.70	1,428.00	32640438
Bussigel, E.A.	11/05/12	Reviewing claims report	.30	189.00	32651992
Zahoroda, Y.	11/05/12	Docket update.	.30	45.00	32650863
Forrest, N.	11/06/12	Various emails re latest developments re customer claim.	.50	420.00	32642512
Sado, S.	11/06/12	Emails regarding customer settlement.	.30	198.00	32777052
Opolsky, J. R.	11/06/12	Email to K. Hailery re: plan issues (.1); review and summarizing chp. 11 docket for team (.1)	.20	113.00	32669108
Bussigel, E.A.	11/06/12	Finalizing and sending settlement letter (.4), t/c L.Lipner re case issue (.2), t/c K.Hailey re same (.2), research re same (.8), email J.Palmer re litigation claims (.1), t/c EY, T.Ross, W. McRae re claim issues (.6), email J.Bromley re claims issue (.1)	2.40	1,512.00	32864633
Uziel, J.L.	11/06/12	Prepare for telephonic conference re: case issue (0.2); Telephonic conference with state claimant, M. Hauser and E. Bussigel re: same (0.3)	.50	245.00	32680553
Cheung, S.	11/06/12	Circulated monitored docket online.	.50	75.00	32670351
Schweitzer, L.	11/07/12	Fabus e-mail re: claims issue.	.10	104.00	32690055
Bussigel, E.A.	11/07/12	Prep for call (.20). Call with tribunal and J. Uziel (.30)	.50	315.00	32864736

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Uziel, J.L.	11/07/12	Preparation for call with state claimant (0.1); T/C with state claimant, M. Hauser and E. Bussigel re: case issue (0.3)	.40	196.00	32680688
Kim, J.	11/07/12	Gather materials re claims per A. Beisler.	.70	178.50	32679110
Cheung, S.	11/07/12	Circulated monitored docket online.	.50	75.00	32670723
Schweitzer, L.	11/08/12	Nadeau e-mail regarding claimant.	.10	104.00	32914806
Bussigel, E.A.	11/08/12	Ems re liability estimates.	.20	126.00	32892846
Bussigel, E.A.	11/08/12	T/c EY re liability estimates.	.30	189.00	32892949
Uziel, J.L.	11/08/12	Review emails and stipulation re: case issues (0.2); T/C with E. Bussigel, J. Wood, M. Gentile, and T. Ross re: same (0.2); O/C with E. Bussigel re: same (0.1)	.50	245.00	32683138
Cheung, S.	11/08/12	Circulated monitored docket online.	.50	75.00	32675522
Bussigel, E.A.	11/09/12	Email J.Uziel re claim issue	.20	126.00	32892959
Uziel, J.L.	11/09/12	T/C with A. Dietz re: case issue (0.2); Email to E. Bussigel re: same (0.2)	.40	196.00	32683147
Cheung, S.	11/09/12	Circulated monitored docket online.	.50	75.00	32741619
Bussigel, E.A.	11/10/12	Email J. Uziel re claim issue (.2).	.20	126.00	32676352
Schweitzer, L.	11/12/12	Bagarella e-mails regarding claims inquiry.	.10	104.00	32914979
Bussigel, E.A.	11/12/12	Research re case issue (.5), email M. Gentile (EY) re claims issues (.3).	.80	504.00	32691076
Uziel, J.L.	11/12/12	Email to J. Wood, T. Ross, M. Gentile, J. Scott, B. McRae, G. Spencer and E. Bussigel re: case issue (0.2)	.20	98.00	32828535
Cheung, S.	11/12/12	Circulated monitored docket online.	.50	75.00	32741730
Bussigel, E.A.	11/13/12	Emails re claim issue.	.20	126.00	32694082
Uziel, J.L.	11/13/12	Email to M. Hauser re: claim issue	.10	49.00	32828556
Sherrett, J. D.	11/13/12	Call w/ opposing counsel re settlement stip (0.1); email to S. McCoy re same (0.1).	.20	113.00	32691625
Cheung, S.	11/13/12	Circulated monitored docket online.	.50	75.00	32741772
Schweitzer, L.	11/14/12	Cordo, Croft e-mails regarding claim.	.10	104.00	32915484
Croft, J.	11/14/12	Emails with J Uziel and B Faubus re agenda (.2)	.20	138.00	32705914
Bussigel, E.A.	11/14/12	T/c J. Uziel re claims issue.	.20	126.00	32703094

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Uziel, J.L.	11/14/12	Review forms (0.8); Email to E. Bussigel re: same (0.2); T/C with E. Bussigel re: claim issues (0.2)	1.20	588.00	32828717
Zahoroda, Y.	11/14/12	Docket update.	.20	30.00	32728622
Lipner, L.	11/15/12	T/c w/S. Sado re claims issue (.4); t/c w/S. Sado re claims issue (.2).	.60	396.00	32855205
Sado, S.	11/15/12	Respond to request for production (4.60) t/c w. L. Lipner re claim issues (.40).	5.00	3,300.00	32786149
Bussigel, E.A.	11/15/12	T/c J.Uziel re claims issue (.20), t/c A.Cerceo re same (.20).	.40	252.00	32719622
Uziel, J.L.	11/15/12	Review forms (0.1); Email to M. Gentile re: same (0.2); T/C with A. Dietz re: claim issue (0.1); Email to E. Bussigel re: same (0.1)	.50	245.00	32828878
Zahoroda, Y.	11/15/12	Docket update.	.30	45.00	32728987
Zahoroda, Y.	11/16/12	Docket update.	.30	45.00	32729102
Zahoroda, Y.	11/16/12	Docket update.	.50	75.00	32729177
Schweitzer, L.	11/19/12	E-mails regarding individual inquiries.	.10	104.00	32843973
Sado, S.	11/19/12	Respond to request for document production.	.30	198.00	32786216
Zahoroda, Y.	11/19/12	Docket update.	.30	45.00	32746095
Cheung, S.	11/20/12	Circulated monitored docket online.	.50	75.00	32768748
Forrest, N.	11/21/12	T/c counsel for claimant re latest settlement proposal.	.50	420.00	32777888
Sado, S.	11/21/12	Respond to request to produce documents.	.50	330.00	32801113
Cheung, S.	11/21/12	Circulated monitored docket online.	.50	75.00	32769906
Schweitzer, L.	11/24/12	Work on motion.	.70	728.00	32836845
Schweitzer, L.	11/26/12	Review Rose draft, Croft e-mails.	.20	208.00	32846272
Lipner, L.	11/26/12	Correspondence w N. Abularach re claims issue (.1).	.10	66.00	32851446
Sado, S.	11/26/12	Respond to request regarding production of documents.	.30	198.00	32801235
Uziel, J.L.	11/26/12	Email to J. Bromley re: claim issue	.60	294.00	32843006
Cheung, S.	11/26/12	Circulated monitored docket online.	.50	75.00	32815822
Schweitzer, L.	11/27/12	Revise claims objection draft.	.80	832.00	32786326

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Schweitzer, L.	11/27/12	Conference, e-mails Croft regarding response draft.	.30	312.00	32786337
Croft, J.	11/27/12	Emails with L. Schweitzer, C. Fischer and N. Abularach re claim.	.30	207.00	32787917
Lipner, L.	11/27/12	Reviewed materials in connection w/ litigation issues (.5); ` t/c w/N. Abularach re same (.1); Correspondence w/N. Abularach re same (.3).	.90	594.00	32851505
Sado, S.	11/27/12	Email regarding the status of purchaser issue.	.50	330.00	32801574
Cheung, S.	11/27/12	Circulated monitored docket online.	.20	30.00	32815902
Schweitzer, L.	11/28/12	Telephone call Alcock, Bagarella, Kunz regarding claim.	.30	312.00	32848894
Schweitzer, L.	11/28/12	Fischer e-mail regarding claims issue.	.10	104.00	32848904
Sado, S.	11/28/12	Update working chart regarding recent correspondence.	.30	198.00	32817488
Cheung, S.	11/28/12	Circulated monitored docket online.	.50	75.00	32816507
Forrest, N.	11/29/12	Review and revise case issues report (.40)	.40	336.00	32824052
Abularach, N.	11/29/12	Draft amended scheduling order stip and related communication with opposing counsel; draft litigation issues.	2.00	1,420.00	32846073
Sherrett, J. D.	11/29/12	Email to opposing counsel re settlement stip (0.1); email to MAO re dismissal (0.1).	.20	113.00	32800152
Cheung, S.	11/29/12	Circulated monitored docket online.	.50	75.00	32816814
Forrest, N.	11/30/12	Email summarizing latest customer settlement proposal.	.50	420.00	32838990
Sado, S.	11/30/12	Consider email from Neil.	1.00	660.00	32837442
Opolsky, J. R.	11/30/12	Research re: case issues.	.20	113.00	32854151
Zahoroda, Y.	11/30/12	Docket update.	.30	45.00	32850389
Zahoroda, Y.	11/30/12	Docket update.	.50	75.00	32850423
Zahoroda, Y.	11/30/12	Docket update.	.20	30.00	32850599
MATTER TOTALS:			44.00	25,163.00	

MATTER: 17650-009 EMPLOYEE MATTERS

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Kim, J.	10/02/12	Mtg w/ J. Croft re: claim (.2), review documents re: claim (.2).	.40	284.00	32801331
Kim, J.	10/03/12	Work re: employee claims (.5).	.50	355.00	32808602
Kim, J.	10/04/12	Employee claims resolution call and follow-up (.9), t/c w/ J. Croft re: employee claim (.2), t/c w/ B. Kahn re: employee claim (.1), t/c w/ J. Croft re: same (.1).	1.30	923.00	32801427
Kim, J.	10/05/12	Correspondence with J. Croft re: employee claim (.4), work re: employee claims (.3).	.70	497.00	32808633
Kim, J.	10/08/12	T/C w/ S. Peters re: employee claim (.2), e-mails re: employee claim (.2).	.40	284.00	32801782
Kim, J.	10/09/12	Discussion pre-employee claims team mtg (.5), Employee claims team mtg (1.0), e-mail to J. Ray re: employee claim (.4).	1.90	1,349.00	32802861
Kim, J.	10/10/12	E-mails to J. Croft re: employee claim (.3), e-mail to M. Fleming re: employee issue (.1), work re: employee claims issues (.4).	.80	568.00	32808754
Kim, J.	10/11/12	T/C w/ S. Liebowitz re: employee claim (.1), e-mail to M. Cilia re: employee claims (.1), e-mail to L. Schweitzer re: employee claim (.2).	.40	284.00	32804242
Kim, J.	10/12/12	Work re: employee claims (.3).	.30	213.00	32804276
Kim, J.	10/15/12	E-mail to J. Ray re: employee claim issue (.3).	.30	213.00	32804308
Kim, J.	10/16/12	Employee claims team meeting (1.0), e-mail to S. Losito re: employee claim (.1), work re: employee issues (.4).	1.50	1,065.00	32804388
Kim, J.	10/17/12	E-mails re: employee claims issues (.2).	.20	142.00	32804429
Kim, J.	10/18/12	T/C w/ S. Leibowitz re: employee claim (.1), T/C w/ R. Renck re: employee claim (.2), Employee claims resolution call and follow-up (1.2), work re: employee claims issues (.4).	1.90	1,349.00	32804529
Kim, J.	10/19/12	Communications with J. Croft re: employee claims issues (.5), work re: employee issues (.3).	.80	568.00	32804731
Kim, J.	10/22/12	Work re: employee claims issues.	.50	355.00	32807481
Kim, J.	10/23/12	Employee claims team mtg and follow-up (.7), follow-up mtg (.3), e-mails re: employee claims issues (.6), work re: employee claims issues (.9).	2.50	1,775.00	32807530
Kim, J.	10/24/12	E-mails with J. Croft re: employee claims call (.3), e-mails re: employee agreements (.4), work	1.10	781.00	32807569

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
		re: employee claims issues (.4).			
Kim, J.	10/25/12	Mtg w/ L. Malone & J. Croft re: employee claim (.4), Employee claims resolution call (1.0), Pre-call w/ J. Croft (.3), t/c w/ M. Fleming re: employee issue (.2), work re: employee claims issues (1.3).	3.20	2,272.00	32807606
Kim, J.	10/26/12	Various e-mails re: employee claim issues (.5).	.50	355.00	32807630
Schweitzer, L.	11/01/12	E/ms JA Kim, D Herrington re employee issues (0.2). Revise draft submission. A Mainoo e/ms re same (0.5). A Mainoo e/ms, e/cs re witness list (0.3). T/c N Berger re retiree issues (0.2).	1.20	1,248.00	32644117
Cooper, R. A.	11/01/12	Work on revising section of supplemental submission.	.80	732.00	32634171
Cooper, R. A.	11/01/12	Emails with NAbularach and Iqbal regarding employee issues.	.30	274.50	32634183
Forrest, N.	11/01/12	Email exchanges M Fleming re employee issues.	.50	420.00	32631957
Abularach, N.	11/01/12	Work on employee issues.	1.50	1,065.00	32644524
Fleming, M. J.	11/01/12	Reviewed objections.	1.00	690.00	32824085
Fleming, M. J.	11/01/12	Emails re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32824132
Fleming, M. J.	11/01/12	Emails re: employee issues.	.70	483.00	32824149
Fleming, M. J.	11/01/12	Emails re: employee issues.	.70	483.00	32824158
Fleming, M. J.	11/01/12	Emails re: employee issues.	.30	207.00	32824194
Fleming, M. J.	11/01/12	Emails to A. Mainoo re: witness list.	.20	138.00	32824204
Fleming, M. J.	11/01/12	Emails to N. Forrest re: witness list.	.20	138.00	32824360
Fleming, M. J.	11/01/12	Email to A. Mainoo.	.10	69.00	32824374
Fleming, M. J.	11/01/12	Email to K. Schulte re: documents.	.10	69.00	32824379
Fleming, M. J.	11/01/12	Emails re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32824386
Fleming, M. J.	11/01/12	Email to L. Schweitzer re: employee eissues.	.10	69.00	32824394
Mainoo, A.	11/01/12	Review data from Ms. Schulte.	.10	63.00	32605047
Mainoo, A.	11/01/12	Revise draft witness list.	.30	189.00	32605051
Mainoo, A.	11/01/12	Revise supplemental submission.	2.80	1,764.00	32605052
Mainoo, A.	11/01/12	Review correspondence from Mr. Abbott regarding supplemental submission.	.10	63.00	32605053

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Mainoo, A.	11/01/12	Incorporate Mr. Abbott's revisions to supplemental submission.	.50	315.00	32605054
Mainoo, A.	11/01/12	Further revise supplemental submission.	.20	126.00	32605064
Mainoo, A.	11/01/12	Correspondence to Mr. Abbott and Ms. Cordo regarding service of witness list.	.10	63.00	32605067
Mainoo, A.	11/01/12	Further revise witness list.	.30	189.00	32605070
Iqbal, A.	11/01/12	Review of newly submitted documents (1.0); review of documents (2.3).	3.30	1,617.00	32624192
Schweitzer, L.	11/02/12	Review court filings (0.6). E/ms M Fleming, J Uziel, A Mainoo, R Cooper re employee issues (1.2). JA Kim, etc. e/ms re employe eissues (0.2). J Kolodner e/m re EE settlement. J Ray, J Bromley e/ms.(0.1).	2.10	2,184.00	32644959
Cooper, R. A.	11/02/12	Emails regarding employee issues.	.30	274.50	32634634
Forrest, N.	11/02/12	Read email from LS re employee issues.	.40	336.00	32632384
Abularach, N.	11/02/12	t/c/w A Iqbal with E Suttly (Elliott Greenleaf) re employee issues (.5) and follow up re same (.5)	1.00	710.00	32644560
Fleming, M. J.	11/02/12	Emails re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32824431
Fleming, M. J.	11/02/12	Emails with L. Schweitzer, L. Beckerman and T. Matz re: status conference.	.30	207.00	32824441
Fleming, M. J.	11/02/12	Reviewed responses to document requests.	.60	414.00	32824445
Fleming, M. J.	11/02/12	Emails re: supplemental filing.	.50	345.00	32824453
Fleming, M. J.	11/02/12	Emails re: agreement.	.10	69.00	32824481
Fleming, M. J.	11/02/12	Emails to L. Schweitzer re: call with EG.	.10	69.00	32824508
Fleming, M. J.	11/02/12	Email to J. Stemerman.	.10	69.00	32824534
Fleming, M. J.	11/02/12	Emails re: litigation.	.20	138.00	32824544
Fleming, M. J.	11/02/12	Emails re: hearing on Dec. 7.	.30	207.00	32824562
Fleming, M. J.	11/02/12	Emails re: priv. log.	.10	69.00	32824569
Fleming, M. J.	11/02/12	Email to N. Abularach re: employee issues.	.30	207.00	32824586
Fleming, M. J.	11/02/12	Email to D. Stein.	.10	69.00	32824589
Fleming, M. J.	11/02/12	Email to A. Mainoo.	.10	69.00	32824595
Fleming, M. J.	11/02/12	Email to L. Schweitzer re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32824604
Fleming, M. J.	11/02/12	Email to J. Uziel re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32824614

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Fleming, M. J.	11/02/12	Emails re: service.	.20	138.00	32824618
Fleming, M. J.	11/02/12	Email to L. Schweitzer re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32824635
Fleming, M. J.	11/02/12	Email to B. Tunis re: outline.	.10	69.00	32824649
Fleming, M. J.	11/02/12	Email to L. Schweitzer, R. Cooper, M. Bunda and J. Uziel.	.10	69.00	32824676
Fleming, M. J.	11/02/12	Email to R. Ryan, J. Uziel and D. Stein re: litigation.	.10	69.00	32824696
Mainoo, A.	11/02/12	Follow up correspondence to Mr. Ray regarding supplemental submission.	.10	63.00	32605085
Mainoo, A.	11/02/12	Review correspondence regarding hearing on discovery motion.	.10	63.00	32605088
Mainoo, A.	11/02/12	Correspondence to Mr. Matz and Ms. Beckerman.	.10	63.00	32605089
Mainoo, A.	11/02/12	Draft proposed revision of supplemental submission.	.20	126.00	32605091
Mainoo, A.	11/02/12	Correspondence from Mr. Sturm.	.10	63.00	32605095
Mainoo, A.	11/02/12	Correspondence from and to L. Schweitzer regarding revision to supplemental submission.	.20	126.00	32605101
Mainoo, A.	11/02/12	Finalize supplemental submission.	.30	189.00	32605103
Mainoo, A.	11/02/12	Correspondence from and to N. Abularach regarding confidentiality agreement.	.20	126.00	32605104
Mainoo, A.	11/02/12	Finalize witness list.	.30	189.00	32605106
Mainoo, A.	11/02/12	Correspondence from and to Ms. Cordo and R. Ryan regarding service of supplemental submission.	.10	63.00	32605107
Iqbal, A.	11/02/12	Call w EG and N. Abularach to discuss pro se discovery disputes (.5); review of relevant documents prior to call (.7); review of newly submitted discovery disputes (.5).	1.70	833.00	32624227
Uziel, J.L.	11/02/12	Emails to L. Scwheitzer, M. Fleming, R. Cooper and K. Schulte re: employee issues (0.5)	.50	245.00	32678217
Fleming, M. J.	11/03/12	Call with J. Stemerman.	.10	69.00	32824008
Fleming, M. J.	11/03/12	Emails re: service.	.10	69.00	32824014
Fleming, M. J.	11/03/12	Emails to R. Ryan re: workstreams.	.30	207.00	32824019
Fleming, M. J.	11/03/12	Email to K. Schulte re: employee issues.	1.00	690.00	32824025
Fleming, M. J.	11/03/12	Updated timeline and related emails.	.80	552.00	32824031

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Fleming, M. J.	11/04/12	Email to J. Opolsky re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32824043
Fleming, M. J.	11/04/12	Reviewed filing.	.30	207.00	32824048
Fleming, M. J.	11/04/12	Reviewed documents from Kathy.	.30	207.00	32824055
Fleming, M. J.	11/04/12	Reviewed objections.	.20	138.00	32824069
Mainoo, A.	11/04/12	Review document re: employee issues.	.10	63.00	32605165
Iqbal, A.	11/04/12	Review of documents (3.0); review of objection (1.0).	4.00	1,960.00	32624249
Schweitzer, L.	11/05/12	Team telephone call conference regarding discovery issues, hearing prep.	1.00	1,040.00	32688736
Schweitzer, L.	11/05/12	Telephone call Beckerman, Matz, Kim, etc. regarding employee issues (partial participant).	.50	520.00	32688742
Schweitzer, L.	11/05/12	Kim e-mails regarding same.	.10	104.00	32688919
Schweitzer, L.	11/05/12	Bagarella e-mails regarding employee claims.	.10	104.00	32688924
Cooper, R. A.	11/05/12	Emails with NAbularach and AIqbal regarding employee issues.	.30	274.50	32641774
Cooper, R. A.	11/05/12	Meeting with NAbularach and AIqbal regarding employee issues.	.50	457.50	32641921
Cooper, R. A.	11/05/12	Review materials regarding discovery disputes.	.50	457.50	32641939
Cooper, R. A.	11/05/12	Reviewed materials related to doc requests and objections.	1.30	1,189.50	32641960
Cooper, R. A.	11/05/12	Prep for meeting (.30). Team meeting regarding employee issues and upcoming hearing (1.0).	1.30	1,189.50	32641974
Cooper, R. A.	11/05/12	Call with NAbularach regarding update on calls.	.30	274.50	32641985
Cooper, R. A.	11/05/12	Call with Morris Nichols regarding procedure for hearing on Wednesday.	.20	183.00	32641999
Forrest, N.	11/05/12	Read motion objections (1.30); t/c team re status of discovery disputes (.70 partial participant)	2.00	1,680.00	32640380
Abularach, N.	11/05/12	Work on discovery issues (6.60). Meeting with R. Cooper and A. Iqbal re: discovery issues (.5). Team conference re: discovery and hearing (1.0)	8.10	5,751.00	32680375
Fleming, M. J.	11/05/12	Emails with B. Tunis re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32666465
Fleming, M. J.	11/05/12	T/c's with J. Uziel re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32666477
Fleming, M. J.	11/05/12	T/c with R. Ryan re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32666494
Fleming, M. J.	11/05/12	Emails to R. Ryan re: employee issues.	.30	207.00	32666524

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Fleming, M. J.	11/05/12	T/c's with N. Abularach re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32666582
Fleming, M. J.	11/05/12	Reviewed objection and research list.	2.80	1,932.00	32666597
Fleming, M. J.	11/05/12	Email to K. O'Neil re: claim.	.10	69.00	32666605
Fleming, M. J.	11/05/12	T/c with A. Iqbal re: hearing.	.10	69.00	32666612
Fleming, M. J.	11/05/12	T/c with A. Cordo re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32668269
Fleming, M. J.	11/05/12	Conference call with L. Schweitzer, R. Cooper, N. Abularach, D. Stein, R. Ryan, N. Forrest, J. Uziel, A. Iqbal and A. Mainoo.	1.00	690.00	32668291
Fleming, M. J.	11/05/12	Emails to J. Uziel re: employee issues.	.30	207.00	32668292
Fleming, M. J.	11/05/12	Email to L. Bagarella re: claims issues.	.20	138.00	32668299
Fleming, M. J.	11/05/12	Office conference with R. Ray and J. Penn re: research.	1.10	759.00	32669854
Fleming, M. J.	11/05/12	Reviewed new claims report.	.20	138.00	32669860
Fleming, M. J.	11/05/12	Reviewed amendment to agreement.	.10	69.00	32669867
Fleming, M. J.	11/05/12	Emails to K. Schultea re: employee issues.	.30	207.00	32669890
Fleming, M. J.	11/05/12	Email to L. Bagarella and M. Alcock re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32669902
Fleming, M. J.	11/05/12	Email to A. Kohn and M. Alcock re: employee LTD issues.	.30	207.00	32669925
Fleming, M. J.	11/05/12	Reviewed insurance contract.	.20	138.00	32669931
Fleming, M. J.	11/05/12	Email to N. Abularach.	.10	69.00	32670021
Penn, J.	11/05/12	Employee Matters.	2.00	1,380.00	32629796
Penn, J.	11/05/12	Employee Matters. Prep for meeting (.40) Meeting with Fleming and Ray (1.1).	1.50	1,035.00	32670906
Malone, L.	11/05/12	T/c with M. Alcock and L. Bagarella re: EE issues (0.3); e-mails re: EE issues (0.5).	.80	528.00	32656418
Hurley, R.	11/05/12	Extensive electronic document review for employee issues, per D. Stein.	8.80	1,672.00	32785940
Bagarella, L.	11/05/12	Work regarding employee issues (5.10). Telephone conversation with M. Alcock and L. Malone (.30).	5.40	3,402.00	32768468
Mainoo, A.	11/05/12	Correspondence from and to N. Abularach regarding conference call.	.10	63.00	32619001
Mainoo, A.	11/05/12	Review agenda for November 7 hearing.	.10	63.00	32619181

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Mainoo, A.	11/05/12	Correspondence from and to A. Cordo regarding employee issues.	.10	63.00	32619301
Mainoo, A.	11/05/12	Telephone conference with L. Schweitzer, R. Cooper, N. Forrest, M. Fleming, N. Abularach, R. Ryan, D. Stein, J. Uziel and A. Iqbal regarding hearing on discovery motion.	.90	567.00	32623889
Mainoo, A.	11/05/12	Correspondence to Mr. Ray re: employee issues.	.20	126.00	32624264
Erickson, J.	11/05/12	Work on discovery for employee issues, comms D. Stein, V. Lashay re same.	1.30	461.50	32630665
Erickson, J.	11/05/12	Document review management for employee issues	.50	177.50	32630673
Erickson, J.	11/05/12	Extensive electronic document review for employee issues, per D. Stein and N. Abularach.	4.00	1,420.00	32630685
Iqbal, A.	11/05/12	Meeting w R Cooper and N. Abularach to discuss upcoming discovery status conference (.5); drafting talking points for upcoming status conference (2.3); team meeting to discuss status conference (1.0); calls and correspondence with Employees (3.0); updating compilation of all discovery requests (.5); review of employee issues (1.2); review of employee issues (1.4).	9.90	4,851.00	32677976
Stein, D. G.	11/05/12	Review documents in regard to employee issues.	1.00	490.00	32670621
Stein, D. G.	11/05/12	Meeting with R. Cooper, L. Schweitzer, N. Forrest, M. Fleming, N. Abularach, R. Ryan, A. Mainoo, A. Iqbal and J. Uziel.	1.00	490.00	32670641
Uziel, J.L.	11/05/12	T/Cs with M. Fleming re: employee issues (0.2); T/C with L. Schweitzer, R. Cooper, M. Fleming, N. Abularach, A. Mainoo, R. Ryan, D. Stein, A. Iqbal and re: same (0.8); Review objection to termination motion (0.4)	1.40	686.00	32680402
Kim, J.	11/05/12	Check and prepare objection binders for distribution per R. Ryan.	2.00	510.00	32675906
Kim, J.	11/05/12	Check Nortel Hotline per J. Croft.	.10	25.50	32676118
Kahn, M.	11/05/12	Drafting doc requests	1.60	664.00	32630701
Tunis, B.	11/05/12	Work on employee issues and ems to R. Ryan of same.	3.40	1,411.00	32627030
Tunis, B.	11/05/12	Set up a meeting for the Nortel Team for this Friday.	.20	83.00	32627055
Xu, D.	11/05/12	Comm. re: updating index	.30	124.50	32675549

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Xu, D.	11/05/12	Updating objections summaries	.10	41.50	32675556
Xu, D.	11/05/12	Researching case issues	1.90	788.50	32675603
Xu, D.	11/05/12	T/c w/ T. Britt re: employee issues	.30	124.50	32675614
Xu, D.	11/05/12	Comm. re: employee issues	.10	41.50	32675628
Roll, J.	11/05/12	Prepared 11/7 hearing binder per A. Iqbal (3.0); Prepared binders per R. Ryan (2.5).	5.50	1,402.50	32691207
Schweitzer, L.	11/06/12	e-mails regarding discovery responses.	.30	312.00	32689958
Schweitzer, L.	11/06/12	JA Kim e-mails regarding employee issues.	.10	104.00	32689962
Schweitzer, L.	11/06/12	Work on employee issues.	.10	104.00	32689966
Schweitzer, L.	11/06/12	Bagarella e-mails regarding claims.	.10	104.00	32689977
Cooper, R. A.	11/06/12	Read materials in preparation for hearing.	2.50	2,287.50	32739723
Cooper, R. A.	11/06/12	Call with Elliot Greenleaf and team regarding hearing plan.	.50	457.50	32739768
Cooper, R. A.	11/06/12	Read materials in preparation for hearing.	1.00	915.00	32739858
Cooper, R. A.	11/06/12	Meeting with NAbularach and AIqbal regarding hearing.	.80	732.00	32739877
Cooper, R. A.	11/06/12	Work on materials for hearing.	.50	457.50	32739884
Cooper, R. A.	11/06/12	Prepared notes for hearing.	.50	457.50	32739892
Forrest, N.	11/06/12	Read additional objections to LTD motion and prepared list of issues to be researched.	1.00	840.00	32642525
Abularach, N.	11/06/12	Work on employee issues including mtg with D. Stein and A. Iqbal re files; calls to participants re discovery disputes; prep for 11/7 hearing; Meeting w/ R. Cooper and A. Iqbal re: hearing.	10.00	7,100.00	32680410
Bunda, M.	11/06/12	Work on query from team and corresponding regarding same.	.60	420.00	32657301
Fleming, M. J.	11/06/12	Conference call with Monitor re: cross-border claims.	.60	414.00	32852405
Fleming, M. J.	11/06/12	T/c with N. Abularach.	.10	69.00	32852419
Fleming, M. J.	11/06/12	Conference call with N. Abularach and M. Ledwin.	.30	207.00	32852430
Fleming, M. J.	11/06/12	Email to M. Ledwin.	.20	138.00	32852443
Fleming, M. J.	11/06/12	Reviewed objections and related emails.	3.70	2,553.00	32852452

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Fleming, M. J.	11/06/12	T/c with R. Ryan re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32852462
Fleming, M. J.	11/06/12	Email to A. Mainoo re: employee issues.	.30	207.00	32852479
Fleming, M. J.	11/06/12	Emails to D. Stein re: employee issues.	.60	414.00	32852491
Fleming, M. J.	11/06/12	Emails to N. Abularach re: employee issues.	.30	207.00	32852503
Fleming, M. J.	11/06/12	Email to A. Cordo and N. Abularach re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32852522
Fleming, M. J.	11/06/12	Reviewed letter re: employee issues.	.30	207.00	32852560
Fleming, M. J.	11/06/12	Email to L. Schweitzer re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32852582
Fleming, M. J.	11/06/12	T/c with N. Abularach and A. Iqbal re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32852649
Fleming, M. J.	11/06/12	Edited research chart and related emails.	.60	414.00	32852662
Fleming, M. J.	11/06/12	T/c with D. Stein re: research.	.10	69.00	32852674
Fleming, M. J.	11/06/12	Email to R. Ryan re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32852707
Fleming, M. J.	11/06/12	Reviewed tax and email to N. Abularach and A. Iqbal.	.20	138.00	32852726
Fleming, M. J.	11/06/12	T/c with J. Penn re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32852837
Fleming, M. J.	11/06/12	T/c with N. Abularach re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32852863
Fleming, M. J.	11/06/12	Prepared for hearing.	1.10	759.00	32852886
Fleming, M. J.	11/06/12	Emails re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32852898
Fleming, M. J.	11/06/12	Email re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32852907
Fleming, M. J.	11/06/12	Email to J. Uziel re: timeline.	.10	69.00	32852916
Fleming, M. J.	11/06/12	Email re: fee applications to R. Ryan.	.10	69.00	32852926
Fleming, M. J.	11/06/12	Email to J. Penn and A. Mainoo re: Retiree/LTD issues.	.10	69.00	32852942
Penn, J.	11/06/12	Employee Matters	.60	414.00	32694962
Penn, J.	11/06/12	Employee Matters. Telephone call Liliane Diabe.	.70	483.00	32695294
Malone, L.	11/06/12	T/c re: cross-border issues (0.5); e-mails re: EE issues (0.3).	.80	528.00	32656433
Hurley, R.	11/06/12	Extensive electronic document review for employee issues, per D. Stein.	8.50	1,615.00	32785943
Bagarella, L.	11/06/12	Preparation for and call with Goodmans regarding employee issue (.80). emails with M. Alcock and L. Schweitzer (.30). Research regarding case issue	3.10	1,953.00	32768517

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
		(1.00). Preparation of documents regarding employee issue and email to Goodmans (1.00).			
Diaba, L. S.	11/06/12	Correspondence with Jeff on the case research.	.30	189.00	32838350
Diaba, L. S.	11/06/12	Reviewed the objection.	2.80	1,764.00	32838400
Diaba, L. S.	11/06/12	Started researching re: case issue.	2.10	1,323.00	32848613
Mainoo, A.	11/06/12	Correspondence to J. Penn regarding employee issues.	.20	126.00	32637761
Erickson, J.	11/06/12	Work on discovery for employee issues, comms D. Stein, V. Lashay re same.	1.50	532.50	32641722
Erickson, J.	11/06/12	Document review management for employee issues.	.50	177.50	32641733
Iqbal, A.	11/06/12	Logistics re binder for status conference (1.3); meeting with N. Abularach and D. Stein to discuss collection and review of files (1.5); calls and correspondence with Employees (5.0); drafting talking points for upcoming status conference (3.0); meeting w R Cooper and N. Abularach to discuss upcoming discovery status conference (.8).	11.60	5,684.00	32678010
Stein, D. G.	11/06/12	Meeting with N. Abularach and A. Iqbal regarding documents (partial participant).	1.00	490.00	32670747
Stein, D. G.	11/06/12	Review documents regarding motion.	2.00	980.00	32670750
Uziel, J.L.	11/06/12	Review letter re: employee issues (0.1); Review and analyze objection (0.7)	.80	392.00	32680533
Kim, J.	11/06/12	Check Nortel Hotline per J. Croft.	.10	25.50	32679004
Tunis, B.	11/06/12	Worked on research requested by Rob Ryan re: case issues.	6.20	2,573.00	32638313
Tunis, B.	11/06/12	Met with Rob Ryan to discuss research project.	.40	166.00	32638319
Xu, D.	11/06/12	Mtg w/ R. Ryan re: new research	.30	124.50	32675886
Xu, D.	11/06/12	Research re: case issues: t/c w/ Darryl (20 min);	.30	124.50	32675928
Xu, D.	11/06/12	Research re: same	4.50	1,867.50	32675951
Xu, D.	11/06/12	Comm. re: same	.50	207.50	32675959
Xu, D.	11/06/12	Work on employee issues.	.70	290.50	32675976
Roll, J.	11/06/12	Prepared 11/7 hearing binder per A. Iqbal (8.6); Prepared binders per R. Ryan (1.3); Prepared binders per review per D. Stein (0.5).	10.40	2,652.00	32691220

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Schweitzer, L.	11/07/12	E-mails Berger, Cooper, Fleming, Curran regarding employee issues.	.50	520.00	32690047
Cooper, R. A.	11/07/12	Non-working travel to Wilmington for hearing (50% of 4.0 or 2.0).	2.00	1,830.00	32740360
Cooper, R. A.	11/07/12	Prepared for hearing.	2.50	2,287.50	32740422
Cooper, R. A.	11/07/12	Status conference on discovery issues.	1.00	915.00	32740426
Cooper, R. A.	11/07/12	Discussed hearing with team.	.80	732.00	32740427
Cooper, R. A.	11/07/12	Non-working travel back to New York (50% of 4.0 or 2.0).	2.00	1,830.00	32740434
Cooper, R. A.	11/07/12	Meeting regarding employee issues.	1.00	915.00	32740438
Cooper, R. A.	11/07/12	Call with M. Bunda regarding employee issues call.	.20	183.00	32740442
Cooper, R. A.	11/07/12	Employee call with M. Bunda.	.50	457.50	32740444
Cooper, R. A.	11/07/12	Discussed with M. Bunda to-do list for employee work.	.30	274.50	32740447
Forrest, N.	11/07/12	Read research materials, made suggested additions, and emails re same (1.50) Con't reading objections (1.0)	2.50	2,100.00	32664339
Abularach, N.	11/07/12	Prepare for hearing during travel from New York to Delaware (w/R. Cooper, M. Fleming and A. Iqbal) (1.0); attend hearing in Bankruptcy Court re. LTD discovery matters (2.5); mtg with R. Cooper, D. Stein and M. Fleming re LTD discovery 1.10) related issues and follow-up re same (0.4)	5.00	3,550.00	32680420
Bunda, M.	11/07/12	Work on employee issues.	1.30	910.00	32689796
Fleming, M. J.	11/07/12	Non-working travel to hearing (50% of 3.6 or 1.8).	1.80	1,242.00	32676077
Fleming, M. J.	11/07/12	Non-working travel from hearing (50% of 4.6 or 2.3).	2.30	1,587.00	32676093
Fleming, M. J.	11/07/12	Attended hearing and related meetings.	3.00	2,070.00	32676335
Fleming, M. J.	11/07/12	Office conference with R. Cooper, N. Abularach and D. Stein re: documents.	1.10	759.00	32678377
Fleming, M. J.	11/07/12	T/c's with A. Mainoo re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32678382
Fleming, M. J.	11/07/12	T/c with T. Britt re: document retention.	.20	138.00	32678385
Fleming, M. J.	11/07/12	T/c with J. Penn re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32678391
Fleming, M. J.	11/07/12	T/c with R. Ryan re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32678403

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Fleming, M. J.	11/07/12	Emails to A. Mainoo re: employee issues.	.40	276.00	32678413
Fleming, M. J.	11/07/12	Email to J. Uziel re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32678655
Fleming, M. J.	11/07/12	Email to D. Xu re: summary.	.30	207.00	32678661
Fleming, M. J.	11/07/12	Email to B. Tunis re: research.	.20	138.00	32678665
Fleming, M. J.	11/07/12	Email to K. Schulte re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32678670
Penn, J.	11/07/12	Employee Matters. Talk with Darryl Stein.	.50	345.00	32694822
Penn, J.	11/07/12	Employee Matters. E-mail to Jennifer Kraft.	.40	276.00	32694830
Penn, J.	11/07/12	Employee Matters. Telephone call Fleming.	.40	276.00	32694853
Hurley, R.	11/07/12	Extensive electronic document review for employee issues, per D. Stein.	8.80	1,672.00	32785948
Mainoo, A.	11/07/12	Correspondence from and to J. Penn and M. Fleming regarding status update on discovery responses.	.10	63.00	32644023
Mainoo, A.	11/07/12	Review timeline.	.10	63.00	32645124
Mainoo, A.	11/07/12	Correspondence from and to J. Penn and M. Fleming regarding employee issues.	.10	63.00	32650118
Mainoo, A.	11/07/12	Review employee issues.	.70	441.00	32651914
Mainoo, A.	11/07/12	Correspondence from and to M. Fleming regarding employee issues.	.20	126.00	32651926
Mainoo, A.	11/07/12	Correspondence to R. Cooper regarding confidentiality designations.	.50	315.00	32654174
Erickson, J.	11/07/12	Work on discovery for employee issues, comms D. Stein, N. Abularach, A. Iqbal re same.	.50	177.50	32657069
Iqbal, A.	11/07/12	Review of objection (.4); discovery status conference (1.0); non-working travel to and from discovery status conference (50% of 3.0 or 1.5); discussing matter with team (5.5); review of calls and correspondence with Employees to determine necessary followup (.3).	8.70	4,263.00	32678068
Stein, D. G.	11/07/12	Prep for meeting (.50) Meeting with J. Penn regarding motion (.50).	1.00	490.00	32670776
Stein, D. G.	11/07/12	Review documents regarding motion.	1.00	490.00	32670778
Stein, D. G.	11/07/12	Meeting with R. Cooper, N. Abularach and M. Fleming (partial participant).	.80	392.00	32670780
Stein, D. G.	11/07/12	Prepare for meeting regarding employee issues.	.50	245.00	32670781

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Stein, D. G.	11/07/12	Draft correspondence related to motion.	1.00	490.00	32670788
Uziel, J.L.	11/07/12	Update timeline re: scheduling (0.3); T/Cs with R. Ryan re: employee issues (0.2); Review and analyze motion (1.9); T/C with D. Xu re: employee issues (0.1); Review summary email by D. Xu re: same (0.3)	2.80	1,372.00	32680676
Kim, J.	11/07/12	Check Nortel Hotline per J. Croft.	.10	25.50	32679120
Kim, J.	11/07/12	Prepare binders per R. Ryan.	1.00	255.00	32679127
Kahn, M.	11/07/12	Drafting doc request	1.70	705.50	32655608
Tunis, B.	11/07/12	Continued to conduct research on case issue. Drafted memo and sent it to Rob Ryan and Megan Fleming on my findings.	6.70	2,780.50	32670639
Xu, D.	11/07/12	Research on case issue.	8.10	3,361.50	32676001
Xu, D.	11/07/12	Comm. re: same	.70	290.50	32676021
Xu, D.	11/07/12	Summaries of news alerts in analogous bankruptcies	2.10	871.50	32676031
Roll, J.	11/07/12	Prepared binders for review per D. Stein (0.3); Prepared binders for 11/8 mtg. per D. Stein (1.8); Project re compiling and comparing plan language per D. Stein (0.5).	2.60	663.00	32691234
Schweitzer, L.	11/08/12	E-mails Kim regarding drafts.	.10	104.00	32914624
Schweitzer, L.	11/08/12	Fleming e-mails on discovery.	.10	104.00	32914631
Schweitzer, L.	11/08/12	motion.	.10	104.00	32914639
Schweitzer, L.	11/08/12	Review research, objections on employee benefits.	1.30	1,352.00	32914646
Schweitzer, L.	11/08/12	Keach, Beckerman e-mails regarding call.	.10	104.00	32914655
Schweitzer, L.	11/08/12	E-mails Berger, Fleming regarding discovery schedule, drafts.	.10	104.00	32914666
Schweitzer, L.	11/08/12	E-mails Fleming, Ray, etc. regarding.	.10	104.00	32914676
Schweitzer, L.	11/08/12	Mainoo e-mails regarding discovery disputes and work on same.	.30	312.00	32914726
Cooper, R. A.	11/08/12	Emails with team regarding yesterday's hearing.	.20	183.00	32741872
Cooper, R. A.	11/08/12	Emails regarding request.	.20	183.00	32741880
Cooper, R. A.	11/08/12	Team meeting regarding Plan documents.	1.00	915.00	32741886
Cooper, R. A.	11/08/12	Work on review of discovery email.	.40	366.00	32741894

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Cooper, R. A.	11/08/12	Emails regarding Committee email.	.20	183.00	32741899
Cooper, R. A.	11/08/12	Revised discovery letter.	.70	640.50	32741912
Cooper, R. A.	11/08/12	Reviewed materials on confidentiality designation of interrogatory responses.	.40	366.00	32741923
Cooper, R. A.	11/08/12	Call with MFleming regarding designation of confidentiality designations.	.20	183.00	32741976
Forrest, N.	11/08/12	Cont reading objections to and analyze most significant bases for objections.	2.30	1,932.00	32668013
Bunda, M.	11/08/12	Meeting to plan language (1.2). Communications w/ R. Cooper regarding same (.8).	2.00	1,400.00	32689836
Fleming, M. J.	11/08/12	Emails with A. Mainoo and A. Cordo.	.40	276.00	32687658
Fleming, M. J.	11/08/12	T/c's with A. Mainoo re: employee issues.	.30	207.00	32687668
Fleming, M. J.	11/08/12	Email to J. Ray re: employee issues.	.30	207.00	32687692
Fleming, M. J.	11/08/12	Conference call with J. Penn, A. Mainoo, D. Stein and J. Kraft re: employee issues.	.70	483.00	32687785
Fleming, M. J.	11/08/12	T/c with A. Cordo re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32687976
Fleming, M. J.	11/08/12	Email to K. Schulte re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32688167
Fleming, M. J.	11/08/12	Emails to L. Schweitzer re: employee issues.	.80	552.00	32688171
Fleming, M. J.	11/08/12	Emails to A. Mainoo re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32688176
Fleming, M. J.	11/08/12	T/c's with J. Uziel re: employee issues.	.30	207.00	32688205
Fleming, M. J.	11/08/12	Email to team re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32688209
Fleming, M. J.	11/08/12	Office conference with R. Cooper, J. Penn, M. Bunda, D. Stein and R. Ryan.	1.20	828.00	32688239
Fleming, M. J.	11/08/12	Email to D. Stein re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32688257
Fleming, M. J.	11/08/12	Emails re: scheduling order.	.30	207.00	32688259
Fleming, M. J.	11/08/12	T/c's with D. Stein re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32688263
Fleming, M. J.	11/08/12	Email to J. Ray and K. Schulte re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32688275
Fleming, M. J.	11/08/12	Email to J. Uziel re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32688997
Fleming, M. J.	11/08/12	Email to A. Mainoo re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32688999
Fleming, M. J.	11/08/12	Reviewed certificate of counsel and related email to J. Uziel.	.20	138.00	32689020

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Fleming, M. J.	11/08/12	T/c with J. Uziel re: certificate of counsel.	.10	69.00	32689025
Fleming, M. J.	11/08/12	Conference call with A. Mainoo and A. Cordo re: filing.	.20	138.00	32689029
Fleming, M. J.	11/08/12	Email to L. Schweitzer, R. Cooper and A. Mainoo.	.40	276.00	32690373
Fleming, M. J.	11/08/12	Emails re: employee issues.	.30	207.00	32690377
Fleming, M. J.	11/08/12	Email to D. Xu re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32690386
Fleming, M. J.	11/08/12	Email to R. Ryan and B. Tunis re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32690481
Fleming, M. J.	11/08/12	T/c with R. Cooper re: employee issues.	.30	207.00	32690692
Fleming, M. J.	11/08/12	Emails to L. Schweitzer, R. Cooper, A. Mainoo and D. Stein.	.50	345.00	32690748
Fleming, M. J.	11/08/12	Reviewed research.	.30	207.00	32690757
Fleming, M. J.	11/08/12	T/c with J. Penn re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32690768
Fleming, M. J.	11/08/12	Email to J. Penn and B. Tunis.	.20	138.00	32690782
Fleming, M. J.	11/08/12	Email to N. Berger re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32690791
Fleming, M. J.	11/08/12	Email to J. Anderson re: agreements..	.20	138.00	32690800
Fleming, M. J.	11/08/12	Email to R. Zahralddin.	.20	138.00	32690812
Fleming, M. J.	11/08/12	Email to L. Schweitzer and R. Cooper re: transcripts.	.20	138.00	32690827
Penn, J.	11/08/12	Employee Matters. Prep and telephone call with Jennifer Kraft, Stein, Mainoo, Fleming.	1.30	897.00	32694607
Penn, J.	11/08/12	Employee Matters. Meeting w. R. Cooper, M. Fleming, M. Bunda, D. Stein + R. Ryan.	1.20	828.00	32694632
Reinstein, J. M	11/08/12	Retrieved the order.	.20	51.00	32663594
Malone, L.	11/08/12	E-mails re: EE issues (0.5).	.50	330.00	32676629
Hurley, R.	11/08/12	Extensive electronic document review for employee issues, per D. Stein.	9.30	1,767.00	32785952
Bagarella, L.	11/08/12	Telephone conversation with team member regarding employee issues (.50). Telephone conversation with C. Kunz regarding employee issue (.50). Research regarding employee issues (.70). Email to Goodmans regarding employee issue (.30).	2.00	1,260.00	32770490
Diaba, L. S.	11/08/12	Nortel case research.	7.30	4,599.00	32838490

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Mainoo, A.	11/08/12	Correspondence from and to M. Fleming and Ms. Cordo regarding service of witness list.	.30	189.00	32655862
Mainoo, A.	11/08/12	Correspondence to D. Stein regarding supplemental responses.	.10	63.00	32655901
Mainoo, A.	11/08/12	Review summary of status conference on discovery procedures.	.10	63.00	32655957
Mainoo, A.	11/08/12	Telephone conference with Ms. Cordo regarding service.	.10	63.00	32656906
Mainoo, A.	11/08/12	Correspondence from and to R. Cooper regarding service.	.20	126.00	32657394
Mainoo, A.	11/08/12	Telephone conference with Ms. Kraft, M. Fleming, J. Penn and D. Stein regarding interrogatories (partial participant).	.50	315.00	32657695
Mainoo, A.	11/08/12	Discuss revisions to interrogatories.	.20	126.00	32657698
Mainoo, A.	11/08/12	Revise supplemental responses.	.40	252.00	32657699
Mainoo, A.	11/08/12	Correspondence from and to M. Fleming regarding employee issues.	.30	189.00	32659705
Mainoo, A.	11/08/12	Review draft email regarding employee issues.	.10	63.00	32659709
Mainoo, A.	11/08/12	Communication with M. Fleming and A. Cordo regarding service.	.90	567.00	32659710
Erickson, J.	11/08/12	Work on discovery for employee issues, comms D. Stein, N. Abularach, A. Iqbal re same.	.80	284.00	32666435
Erickson, J.	11/08/12	Document review management for employee issues.	.50	177.50	32666441
Erickson, J.	11/08/12	Extensive electronic document review for employee issues, per D. Stein and N. Abularach.	4.70	1,668.50	32666444
Iqbal, A.	11/08/12	Revising and circulating to team memo describing case matters (.2); review of Motion (1.0); meeting with J. Penn to discuss Motion (.5).	1.70	833.00	32678136
Stein, D. G.	11/08/12	Prep for call (.30). Call with Seyfarth Shaw, J. Penn, A. Mainoo and M. Fleming regarding motion (.70).	1.00	490.00	32670795
Stein, D. G.	11/08/12	Meeting with R. Cooper, M. Bunda, M. Fleming, J. Penn, R. Ryan regarding motion.	1.00	490.00	32670804
Stein, D. G.	11/08/12	Draft correspondence related to motion.	.50	245.00	32670815
Uziel, J.L.	11/08/12	T/Cs with M. Fleming re: employee issues (0.4); Review emails re: same (0.2); Draft memos and prepare binder re: research on case issues (2.9);	5.60	2,744.00	32683137

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
		Review census information (0.2) and email to K. Schulte re: same (0.3); Draft certification of counsel and proposed order re: scheduling (0.7); Email to L. Schweitzer re: same (0.1); Emails to J. Ray, N. Berger, L. Beckerman, T. Matz and A. Cordo re: same (0.3); Review and analyze objections to motion (0.5)			
Kim, J.	11/08/12	Check and distribute binders in full sets and in condensed form per R. Ryan.	1.50	382.50	32679141
Kim, J.	11/08/12	Assist J. Roll in preparing motion paper binders to distribute.	1.00	255.00	32679153
Kim, J.	11/08/12	Check Nortel Hotline per J. Croft.	.10	25.50	32679172
Kahn, M.	11/08/12	Team communication.	.10	41.50	32663699
Xu, D.	11/08/12	Comm. re: case research	.30	124.50	32676419
Xu, D.	11/08/12	Comm. re: analysis case research	.30	124.50	32676428
Xu, D.	11/08/12	Analyzing objections to other settlements	1.10	456.50	32676496
Roll, J.	11/08/12	Project re employee issues per D. Stein (3.3); prepared binders for meeting per D. Stein (0.3).	3.60	918.00	32696550
Cheung, S.	11/08/12	Circulated monitored docket online.	.30	45.00	32675540
Schweitzer, L.	11/09/12	Review of objections, produced documents.	.60	624.00	32914356
Schweitzer, L.	11/09/12	Team meeting regarding employee issues.	1.50	1,560.00	32914377
Schweitzer, L.	11/09/12	Berger e-mails.	.10	104.00	32914380
Schweitzer, L.	11/09/12	Beckerman, Matz e-mails regarding issues.	.10	104.00	32914390
Schweitzer, L.	11/09/12	Telephone call Berger.	.20	208.00	32914394
Cooper, R. A.	11/09/12	Work on revising confidentiality agreement from NAbularach.	.50	457.50	32741999
Cooper, R. A.	11/09/12	Team meeting to discuss strategy and open issues.	1.50	1,372.50	32742006
Forrest, N.	11/09/12	Conf call re status and issues (1.50); cont. reading objections to motion (1.0).	2.50	2,100.00	32679189
Croft, J.	11/09/12	Call with claimant (.3); emails with L Schweitzer and A Cordo re claimant (.2); drafting response to motion (2.5).	3.00	2,070.00	32681817
Fleming, M. J.	11/09/12	Email to L. Schweitzer re: meeting.	.10	69.00	32706933
Fleming, M. J.	11/09/12	Emails to D. Stein re: redactions.	.20	138.00	32706964
Fleming, M. J.	11/09/12	Emails to B. Tunis re: meeting.	.30	207.00	32706974

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Fleming, M. J.	11/09/12	Email to L. Schweitzer re: redactions.	.10	69.00	32707025
Fleming, M. J.	11/09/12	Email to R. Cooper re: letter.	.10	69.00	32707038
Fleming, M. J.	11/09/12	Email to J. Uziel re: certificate of counsel.	.10	69.00	32707044
Fleming, M. J.	11/09/12	Emails with L. Schweitzer re: certificate of counsel.	.10	69.00	32707060
Fleming, M. J.	11/09/12	T/c with R. Ryan re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32707100
Fleming, M. J.	11/09/12	Emails to L. Schweitzer re: employee issues.	.30	207.00	32707114
Fleming, M. J.	11/09/12	Reviewed research.	1.00	690.00	32707121
Fleming, M. J.	11/09/12	T/c with J. Penn re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32707656
Fleming, M. J.	11/09/12	Prepared for call and related t/c with J. Uziel.	.90	621.00	32707661
Fleming, M. J.	11/09/12	Email to M. Alcock re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32707677
Fleming, M. J.	11/09/12	Emails to D. Stein re: employee issues.	.30	207.00	32708482
Fleming, M. J.	11/09/12	T/c with A. Cordo.	.10	69.00	32708486
Fleming, M. J.	11/09/12	T/c's with J. Uziel re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32708491
Fleming, M. J.	11/09/12	Conference call with K. Schulte, D. Parker and J. Uziel and office conference with J. Uziel.	.90	621.00	32708512
Fleming, M. J.	11/09/12	Office conference with L. Schweitzer, R. Cooper and team re: strategy and follow-up office conference with L. Schweitzer.	1.60	1,104.00	32710025
Fleming, M. J.	11/09/12	Edited response email.	.30	207.00	32715911
Fleming, M. J.	11/09/12	Email to M. Ledwin.	.20	138.00	32715991
Fleming, M. J.	11/09/12	Email to L. Bagarella.	.10	69.00	32716838
Fleming, M. J.	11/09/12	Email to L. Schweitzer, R. Cooper and D. Stein.	.20	138.00	32716843
Fleming, M. J.	11/09/12	Office conference with D. Stein.	.10	69.00	32716852
Fleming, M. J.	11/09/12	Email to K. Schulte.	.10	69.00	32716877
Penn, J.	11/09/12	Employee Matters	1.00	690.00	32694470
Hurley, R.	11/09/12	Extensive electronic document review for employee issues, per D. Stein.	8.00	1,520.00	32785982
Bagarella, L.	11/09/12	Email to J. Kim regarding employee issue (.30). Work regarding employee issues (1.00).	1.30	819.00	32771424
Diaba, L. S.	11/09/12	Research re: case issue.	1.80	1,134.00	32838620

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Diaba, L. S.	11/09/12	Reviewing motion and attached documents.	3.00	1,890.00	32838666
Mainoo, A.	11/09/12	Correspondence from and to D. Stein and J. Erickson regarding supplemental responses.	.10	63.00	32663748
Mainoo, A.	11/09/12	Create chart of follow-up information.	.80	504.00	32669714
Mainoo, A.	11/09/12	Attend Nortel team meeting.	1.30	819.00	32670957
Erickson, J.	11/09/12	Work on discovery for employee issues, comms D. Stein, N. Abularach, A. Iqbal re same.	1.00	355.00	32677230
Erickson, J.	11/09/12	Document review management for employee issues.	.40	142.00	32677249
Iqbal, A.	11/09/12	Team meeting to discuss Committee's objection (1.5); researching re case issue (.5).	2.00	980.00	32678183
Stein, D. G.	11/09/12	Review discovery.	2.00	980.00	32718762
Stein, D. G.	11/09/12	Team meeting with R. Cooper, L. Schweitzer, M. Fleming, A. Mainoo, D. Xu, R. Ryan and B. Tunis (partial participant).	1.00	490.00	32718919
Uziel, J.L.	11/09/12	Draft memos and prepare binder re: research on case issues (2.0); Revise certification of counsel and proposed order re: scheduling (0.1); Communications with M. Fleming re: same (0.2); Prepare same for filing (0.3); Emails to A. Cordo re: same (0.2); Preparation for T/C with K. Schultea and D. Parker re: employee issues (0.2); T/C with K. Schultea, D. Parker and M. Fleming re: same (0.9); Draft email to Committee re: same (1.5); Revise same (0.3); T/C with R. Ryan re: issues (0.1); T/C with M. Fleming and A. Cordo re: certification of counsel and proposed order (0.1); Email to L. Bagarella re: employee claims issue (0.1); Emails to M. Fleming and L. Schweitzer re: issues (0.2)	6.20	3,038.00	32683145
Kim, J.	11/09/12	Check Nortel Hotline per J. Croft.	.10	25.50	32679209
Kahn, M.	11/09/12	Team comm (0.1)	.10	41.50	32673890
Tunis, B.	11/09/12	Attended Nortel employee matters meeting (partial participant).	1.00	415.00	32699911
Tunis, B.	11/09/12	Research re: case issues	1.50	622.50	32699920
Tunis, B.	11/09/12	Sent out more invitations and made changes to employee matters team meeting	.30	124.50	32699922
Xu, D.	11/09/12	Mtg prep for team meeting.	1.50	622.50	32681460
Xu, D.	11/09/12	Nortel team mtg	1.40	581.00	32681485

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Xu, D.	11/09/12	Legal research re: case issue.	1.10	456.50	32681496
Xu, D.	11/09/12	Comm re: same	.30	124.50	32681504
Roll, J.	11/09/12	Project re employee issues per D. Stein (6.3); prepared Binder per J. Uziel (0.3).	6.60	1,683.00	32696578
Fleming, M. J.	11/10/12	Emails with L. Schweitzer re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32722030
Fleming, M. J.	11/10/12	Email to R. Ryan re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32722055
Fleming, M. J.	11/11/12	Email to L. Schweitzer re: employee issues.	.40	276.00	32722074
Fleming, M. J.	11/11/12	Reviewed mark-up.	1.30	897.00	32722086
Fleming, M. J.	11/11/12	Email to J. Ray.	.40	276.00	32722090
Fleming, M. J.	11/11/12	Email to T. Matz and L. Beckerman.	.30	207.00	32722100
Schweitzer, L.	11/12/12	Work on retiree drafts.	.40	416.00	32914852
Schweitzer, L.	11/12/12	Various correspondence Cooper, Stein, Uziel, etc. on LTD discovery issues including review memos regarding same.	1.20	1,248.00	32914902
Schweitzer, L.	11/12/12	Telephone call Ledwin, Fleming including conference Fleming regarding same.	1.00	1,040.00	32914995
Schweitzer, L.	11/12/12	Telephone call Berger, Fleming regarding draft.	.90	936.00	32915014
Schweitzer, L.	11/12/12	Conference Cooper, Bunda regarding report.	.80	832.00	32915035
Kim, J.	11/12/12	T/c w/ S. Carlin re: employee claim and follow-up email re: same. (.2)	.20	142.00	32817535
Cooper, R. A.	11/12/12	Meeting with M. Bunda and L.Schweitzer regarding employee issues. (partial participant).	.80	732.00	32742289
Cooper, R. A.	11/12/12	Emails regarding notice.	.50	457.50	32742297
Cooper, R. A.	11/12/12	Reviewed certain documents.	.40	366.00	32742303
Forrest, N.	11/12/12	Read exhibits to motion (2.0)	2.00	1,680.00	32689866
Abularach, N.	11/12/12	Work on Nortel discovery issues.	5.20	3,692.00	32706527
Bunda, M.	11/12/12	T/c w/R. Cooper regarding employee issues.	.30	210.00	32690141
Bunda, M.	11/12/12	Meeting w/L. Schweitzer, R. Cooper regarding employee issues.	1.20	840.00	32690144
Croft, J.	11/12/12	Drafting objection to motion (.4); calls and emails with A Cordo and L Schweitzer re same, including reviewing notice of hearing (.3); call with movant (.1); calls with employees and updating response tracker (.4); drafting and editing stipulation with claims trader, including	2.50	1,725.00	32690367

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
		diligence re same (1.3);			
Fleming, M. J.	11/12/12	Emails with N. Berger and L. Schweitzer re: call.	.20	138.00	32719452
Fleming, M. J.	11/12/12	Email to L. Schweitzer re: issues.	.20	138.00	32719458
Fleming, M. J.	11/12/12	Email to A. Kohn and M. Alcock re: issues.	.10	69.00	32719460
Fleming, M. J.	11/12/12	Emails to R. Ryan re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32719461
Fleming, M. J.	11/12/12	Email to D. Stein re: priv log.	.20	138.00	32720320
Fleming, M. J.	11/12/12	T/c with J. Anderson (Reese).	.10	69.00	32720353
Fleming, M. J.	11/12/12	Meeting preparation.	.40	276.00	32720357
Fleming, M. J.	11/12/12	Conference call with L. Schweitzer and Togut re: settlement agreement.	.90	621.00	32720362
Fleming, M. J.	11/12/12	Office conference with L. Schweitzer and t/c with M. Ledwin.	1.00	690.00	32720369
Fleming, M. J.	11/12/12	Email to J. Opolsky re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32720372
Fleming, M. J.	11/12/12	T/c with R. Ryan re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32720374
Fleming, M. J.	11/12/12	T/c's with J. Uziel re: employee issues.	.60	414.00	32720384
Fleming, M. J.	11/12/12	Reviewed spreadsheet.	.40	276.00	32720413
Fleming, M. J.	11/12/12	Office conference with J. Uziel re: employee issue.	.40	276.00	32720421
Fleming, M. J.	11/12/12	Emails to J. Uziel re: employee issues.	.60	414.00	32720432
Fleming, M. J.	11/12/12	Office conference with D. Stein re: employee issues.	.40	276.00	32720445
Fleming, M. J.	11/12/12	Emails re: agenda.	.20	138.00	32720450
Fleming, M. J.	11/12/12	T/c with D. Stein re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32720468
Fleming, M. J.	11/12/12	Reviewed data from K. Schulte.	.40	276.00	32721936
Fleming, M. J.	11/12/12	Email to K. Schulte re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32721939
Fleming, M. J.	11/12/12	T/c with J. Uziel.	.10	69.00	32721943
Fleming, M. J.	11/12/12	Edited email to L. Schweitzer and R. Cooper.	.30	207.00	32721946
Penn, J.	11/12/12	Employee Matters.	.50	345.00	32730450
Reinstein, J. M	11/12/12	Assisted L. Bagarella in researching case issue.	1.50	382.50	32688815
Hurley, R.	11/12/12	Extensive electronic document review for employee issues, per D. Stein.	9.50	1,805.00	32786749
Bagarella, L.	11/12/12	Email to L. Schweitzer regarding claimant.	.20	126.00	32771569

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Diaba, L. S.	11/12/12	Finished reading motion and reviewing cases.	3.30	2,079.00	32848297
Diaba, L. S.	11/12/12	research on case issue.	1.40	882.00	32848320
Mainoo, A.	11/12/12	Correspondence from and to J. Erickson regarding employee issues	.10	63.00	32674776
Erickson, J.	11/12/12	Work on discovery for employee issues, comms D. Stein, N. Abularach, A. Iqbal re same.	1.30	461.50	32687436
Erickson, J.	11/12/12	Document review management for employee issues.	.80	284.00	32687442
Iqbal, A.	11/12/12	Reviewing notes from calls with Employees re discovery requests (0.5); Reviewing documents responsive to discovery requests (1.7); Reviewing responses to our document requests (2.0).	4.20	2,058.00	32770082
Stein, D. G.	11/12/12	Review discovery.	2.00	980.00	32719052
Stein, D. G.	11/12/12	Prep for meeting (.10). Meeting with M. Fleming regarding discovery (.40).	.50	245.00	32719057
Stein, D. G.	11/12/12	Review discovery.	1.50	735.00	32719062
Uziel, J.L.	11/12/12	T/Cs with M. Fleming re: employee issues (0.6); Prepare for meeting with M. Fleming (0.1); O/C with M. Fleming re: employee issues (0.4); Emails to Mercer re: same (0.2); Review data (0.2) and email to K. Schultea re: same (0.2); Revise email to Retiree Committee re: data questions (0.6); Emails to M. Fleming re: same (0.4); Email to L. Schweitzer re: same (0.1)	2.80	1,372.00	32828526
Kim, J.	11/12/12	Check Nortel Hotline per J. Croft.	.10	25.50	32777624
Kahn, M.	11/12/12	Drafting doc requests	.40	166.00	32685714
O'Donohue, A. K	11/12/12	Prep for meeting (.20). O.C. with M. Fleming re case background. (1.10)	1.30	539.50	32694262
O'Donohue, A. K	11/12/12	Discuss with R. Ryan Nortel research case issue.	.10	41.50	32694332
Tunis, B.	11/12/12	Spoke with Rob Ryan regarding additional research of case issues to be done.	.30	124.50	32699934
Xu, D.	11/12/12	Legal research re: objections	5.80	2,407.00	32695364
Roll, J.	11/12/12	Project re compiling and comparing plan language per D. Stein (4.1); work on employee issues (0.3); Prepared Binders per J. Uziel (0.2); Prepared binders for new team member per R. Ryan (0.3)	4.90	1,249.50	32770946
Schweitzer, L.	11/13/12	Telephone call Keach regarding employee issues.	.30	312.00	32915323
Schweitzer, L.	11/13/12	Abularach, Cooper e-mails regarding discovery	.60	624.00	32915335

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
		issues.			
Schweitzer, L.	11/13/12	Employee claims team meeting.	1.00	1,040.00	32915368
Schweitzer, L.	11/13/12	Work on retiree inquiries.	.30	312.00	32915385
Kim, J.	11/13/12	Employee claims team meeting and follow-up (.7)	.70	497.00	32817582
Cooper, R. A.	11/13/12	Emails with associates regarding discovery questions.	.80	732.00	32742613
Cooper, R. A.	11/13/12	Reviewed witness list.	.20	183.00	32742621
Cooper, R. A.	11/13/12	Emails with team regarding witness list.	.20	183.00	32742628
Cooper, R. A.	11/13/12	Emails with NAbularach and LSchweitzer regarding document discovery issues.	.50	457.50	32742636
Forrest, N.	11/13/12	Read research on principal issues. Read List of Witnesses and various emails re same.	2.50	2,100.00	32707658
Abularach, N.	11/13/12	Work on discovery issues, including re-review of documents for production purposes in response to discovery disputes	7.00	4,970.00	32706536
Bunda, M.	11/13/12	T/cs and correspondence with team and research re employee issues.	.50	350.00	32697563
Bunda, M.	11/13/12	Prep for meeting (.10) Meeting w/D. Stein regarding plan language analysis project. (1.0).	1.10	770.00	32697571
Bunda, M.	11/13/12	Prep for employee issues meeting.	.50	350.00	32697608
Croft, J.	11/13/12	Drafting and editing response to employee motion (5 hours); research re case issue (1 hour); emails with L Malone, M Cilia and D Parker re same, including reviewing documents circulated by same (1 hour); employee claims resolution meeting (.5); emails with claims trader and claimant (.2); call with claimant and A Cordo and email with team re CNO (.4); drafting objection to same (.8).	8.90	6,141.00	32691988
Fleming, M. J.	11/13/12	Email to V. Farswani.	.10	69.00	32780190
Fleming, M. J.	11/13/12	Email to L. Schweitzer, R. Cooper and M. Bunda.	.20	138.00	32780200
Fleming, M. J.	11/13/12	T/c's with J. Uziel re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32780205
Fleming, M. J.	11/13/12	Reviewed emails re: fee application.	.20	138.00	32780218
Fleming, M. J.	11/13/12	Email to A. Mainoo re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32780225
Fleming, M. J.	11/13/12	Office conference with R. Ryan re: settlement agreement.	.60	414.00	32780255

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Fleming, M. J.	11/13/12	T/c with N. Abularach re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32780264
Fleming, M. J.	11/13/12	Email re: document production.	.30	207.00	32780276
Fleming, M. J.	11/13/12	Office conference with J. Uziel.	.80	552.00	32780286
Fleming, M. J.	11/13/12	Emails to N. Abularach re: employee issues.	.30	207.00	32780293
Fleming, M. J.	11/13/12	Email to R. Cooper re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32780353
Fleming, M. J.	11/13/12	Email to D. Hardin re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32780361
Fleming, M. J.	11/13/12	Email to L. Schweitzer and J. Uziel re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32780386
Fleming, M. J.	11/13/12	Emails to J. Uziel re: Retiree/LTD issues.	.20	138.00	32780543
Fleming, M. J.	11/13/12	Emails to A. Mainoo re: discovery.	.20	138.00	32780625
Fleming, M. J.	11/13/12	Employee claims team meeting (1.0) and follow-up office conference with M. Alcock. (.30).	1.30	897.00	32780642
Fleming, M. J.	11/13/12	Email to M. Alcock.	.10	69.00	32780647
Fleming, M. J.	11/13/12	Emails re: witnesses with team.	.20	138.00	32780665
Fleming, M. J.	11/13/12	Email to M. Cilia re: claims.	.30	207.00	32780671
Fleming, M. J.	11/13/12	T/c with J. Penn re: Retiree/LTD issues.	.10	69.00	32780676
Fleming, M. J.	11/13/12	Edited settlement agreement.	1.50	1,035.00	32780682
Fleming, M. J.	11/13/12	Email to R. Ryan re: settlement agreement.	.20	138.00	32780690
Fleming, M. J.	11/13/12	Email to K. Schultea.	.10	69.00	32782455
Penn, J.	11/13/12	Employee Matters. Research and diligence on questions from N. Abularach.	.60	414.00	32842989
Penn, J.	11/13/12	Employee Matters.	.20	138.00	32843463
Reinstein, J. M	11/13/12	Continued researching case issue.	2.50	637.50	32691408
Malone, L.	11/13/12	Research re: case issues (2.0); e-mails re: same (0.6); EE claims meeting (1.0).	3.60	2,376.00	32841817
Lipner, L.	11/13/12	Correspondence w/J. Croft and L. Malone re pension issues (.7).	.70	462.00	32855146
Hurley, R.	11/13/12	Extensive electronic document review for employee issues, per D. Stein.	9.30	1,767.00	32786844
Bagarella, L.	11/13/12	Employee claims team meeting (1.00). Follow up office conference with J. Ray and L. Schweitzer (.50). Email to M. Alcock regarding employee benefit plan (.20).	1.70	1,071.00	32790893

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Diaba, L. S.	11/13/12	Nortel research on case issue.	1.80	1,134.00	32839655
Mainoo, A.	11/13/12	Analyze supplemental interrogatories.	1.80	1,134.00	32691144
Mainoo, A.	11/13/12	Correspondence from and to M. Fleming regarding interrogatories.	.20	126.00	32691431
Mainoo, A.	11/13/12	Draft correspondence regarding information for LTD interrogatories.	.20	126.00	32691557
Erickson, J.	11/13/12	Work on discovery for employee issues, comms D. Stein, N. Abularach, A. Iqbal re same.	1.20	426.00	32695175
Erickson, J.	11/13/12	Document review management for employee issues.	.50	177.50	32695178
Iqbal, A.	11/13/12	Reviewing personnel files (2.0); Reviewing responses to our document requests (2.0); Reviewing document requests (.50).	4.50	2,205.00	32770161
Stein, D. G.	11/13/12	Review discovery.	5.00	2,450.00	32719476
Stein, D. G.	11/13/12	Meeting with M. Bunda regarding employee issues.	1.00	490.00	32719490
Uziel, J.L.	11/13/12	T/C with M. Fleming re employee issues (0.1); Prepare for meeting with M. Fleming re: same (0.1); O/C with M. Fleming re: same (0.8); Revise email to Retiree Committee re: data questions (0.3); Email to K. Schultea re: same (0.1); Review emails re: same (0.1); Email to M. Fleming re: same (0.2); Email to Retiree Committee re: data questions (0.2); Review docket re: employee claim issue (0.1); T/C with M. Bunda re: employee issues (0.1)	2.10	1,029.00	32828550
Kim, J.	11/13/12	Check Nortel Hotline per J. Croft.	.10	25.50	32712474
Xu, D.	11/13/12	Case issues research	4.00	1,660.00	32694217
Xu, D.	11/13/12	Research re: case issues.	8.10	3,361.50	32694224
Xu, D.	11/13/12	Cross-checking discovery responses	.20	83.00	32694231
Roll, J.	11/13/12	Project re employe issues per D. Stein (0.8); Prepared binders for new team member per R. Ryan (0.4); Prepared Research Binders for team per J. Uziel (1.4); Compiled individual responses (1.1).	3.70	943.50	32844128
Schweitzer, L.	11/14/12	Berger, Rafael Z. e-mails.	.10	104.00	32915507
Schweitzer, L.	11/14/12	Fleming, Schultea e-mails regarding benefit issues.	.10	104.00	32915525

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Schweitzer, L.	11/14/12	J. Ray, J. Bromley e-mails regarding employee issues.	.10	104.00	32915549
Schweitzer, L.	11/14/12	Meeting with M. Bunda re: employee issues .	2.50	2,600.00	32915556
Schweitzer, L.	11/14/12	Work on employee issues.	1.50	1,560.00	32915568
Bunda, M.	11/14/12	Meeting with team re employee issues.	3.30	2,310.00	32719898
Bunda, M.	11/14/12	Follow up re: employee issues.	1.10	770.00	32719917
Bunda, M.	11/14/12	Planning for employee issues meeting.	.30	210.00	32720464
Croft, J.	11/14/12	Research re case issues (1.8 hours); drafting response to same (1.5 hours); editing objection and emails with L Schweitzer, J Kim and A Cordo re same (.4); call with claimant (.1); editing stipulation and circulating same (.2)	4.00	2,760.00	32705900
Fleming, M. J.	11/14/12	Email to R. Ryan re: emplyee issues.	.10	69.00	32742285
Fleming, M. J.	11/14/12	Emails to D. Stein re: production.	.30	207.00	32745917
Fleming, M. J.	11/14/12	Emails to M. Alcock re: call.	.20	138.00	32745924
Fleming, M. J.	11/14/12	Reviewed research re case issues.	1.60	1,104.00	32745927
Fleming, M. J.	11/14/12	Email to N. Abularach re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32745936
Fleming, M. J.	11/14/12	Emails to K. Schultea re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32747140
Fleming, M. J.	11/14/12	Emails to L. Schweitzer re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32747496
Fleming, M. J.	11/14/12	T/c to shared services.	.10	69.00	32747505
Fleming, M. J.	11/14/12	Email to M. Bunda re: records.	.10	69.00	32747534
Fleming, M. J.	11/14/12	Reviewed objections.	3.80	2,622.00	32747537
Penn, J.	11/14/12	Employee Matters.	1.50	1,035.00	32732608
Penn, J.	11/14/12	Employee Matters. Telephone call D. Howells and H. Pianko of Seyfarth re production.	.50	345.00	32781504
Malone, L.	11/14/12	Research re: case issues (0.8).	.80	528.00	32841996
Hurley, R.	11/14/12	Extensive electronic document review for employee issues, per D. Stein.	9.50	1,805.00	32786847
Diaba, L. S.	11/14/12	Research re: case issues.	2.80	1,764.00	32848418
Erickson, J.	11/14/12	Work on discovery for employee issues, comms D. Stein, N. Abularach, A. Iqbal re same (document tracking, database mgmt, uploads, production).	1.40	497.00	32705863
Erickson, J.	11/14/12	Document review management for employee	.30	106.50	32705867

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
		issues.			
Iqbal, A.	11/14/12	Call w J Penn to discuss employee issues (0.3); Reviewing document requests to determine who requested certain documents (0.7); Reviewing files for documents responsive to employee issues (0.5).	1.50	735.00	32770229
Stein, D. G.	11/14/12	Review discovery with regard to employee issues.	2.00	980.00	32719514
Kim, J.	11/14/12	Check Nortel Hotline per J. Croft.	.10	25.50	32712462
Xu, D.	11/14/12	Research re: case issues	5.10	2,116.50	32737380
Roll, J.	11/14/12	Compiled individual responses to discovery requests on share drive per A. Iqbal	1.50	382.50	32787011
Roll, J.	11/14/12	Pulled plan documents for binder per D. Stein	.50	127.50	32787019
Schweitzer, L.	11/15/12	E-mails M. Fleming, Rafael regarding hotline.	.10	104.00	32716297
Schweitzer, L.	11/15/12	Telephone call C. Kunz, M. Alcock, L. Bagarella regarding claim issue. (partial participant).	.30	312.00	32718117
Schweitzer, L.	11/15/12	Work re: employee issues.	.40	416.00	32718142
Schweitzer, L.	11/15/12	E-mails B. Cooper, N. Abularach, M. Fleming, D. Stein regarding production issues.	.60	624.00	32718149
Schweitzer, L.	11/15/12	Telephone call L. Beckerman, T. Matz, J. Kim regarding employee issues.	.50	520.00	32718155
Schweitzer, L.	11/15/12	Conference M. Bunda, consultants regarding employee issues (part).	.60	624.00	32718173
Schweitzer, L.	11/15/12	M. Kostov e-mail regarding employee issues.	.20	208.00	32718175
Schweitzer, L.	11/15/12	L. Bagarella e-mails regarding claim.	.10	104.00	32718188
Kim, J.	11/15/12	T/c w/ R. Davis re: employee claim (.1), t/c w/ L. Feinberg re: employee claim (.1), email to J. Croft re: employee claim (.1)	.30	213.00	32817838
Cooper, R. A.	11/15/12	Call with M. Bunda regarding employee issues.	.40	366.00	32746144
Cooper, R. A.	11/15/12	Meeting with M. Bunda regarding employee issues.	.50	457.50	32746150
Cooper, R. A.	11/15/12	Emails regarding employee issues.	.30	274.50	32746154
Cooper, R. A.	11/15/12	Emails with L. Schweitzer regarding employee issues.	.40	366.00	32746161
Forrest, N.	11/15/12	Read discovery requests and responses re: employee issues (1.30); read proposal re: employee issues (1.0)	2.30	1,932.00	32720379

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Abularach, N.	11/15/12	review objection re: employee issues; work on chart re employee issues.	6.90	4,899.00	32778124
Bunda, M.	11/15/12	Various Meetings w/ L. Malone, L. Lipner, L Schweitzer, R. Cooper, A. Iqbal regarding employee issues, and t/c with team member regarding same.	3.00	2,100.00	32721869
Croft, J.	11/15/12	Drafting and editing objection re: employee issues (1.5); call with J Kim re claimants (.1); emails with J kim, M Cilia, C Brown, L Bagarella and M Alcock re employee issues (.3).	1.90	1,311.00	32722991
Fleming, M. J.	11/15/12	Emails to L. Schweitzer re: employee issues.	.50	345.00	32747730
Fleming, M. J.	11/15/12	T/c with N. Abularach re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32747750
Fleming, M. J.	11/15/12	Emails with D. Stein re: production.	.30	207.00	32747765
Fleming, M. J.	11/15/12	Emails to M. Alcock re: employee issues.	.30	207.00	32747853
Fleming, M. J.	11/15/12	Set up call re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32747884
Fleming, M. J.	11/15/12	Emails to D. Parker re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32748104
Fleming, M. J.	11/15/12	T/c with J.Uziel re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32748108
Fleming, M. J.	11/15/12	Email to J. Roll re: workstreams.	.10	69.00	32748353
Fleming, M. J.	11/15/12	Email to J. Uziel re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32748356
Fleming, M. J.	11/15/12	Conference call with M. Alcock and D. Parker; Follow-up office conference with M. Alcock.	.30	207.00	32748363
Fleming, M. J.	11/15/12	Reviewed production; Related t/c's with N. Abularach and D. Stein.	.40	276.00	32748367
Fleming, M. J.	11/15/12	Email to D. Stein re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32748376
Fleming, M. J.	11/15/12	T/c's with A. Cordo re: employee issues.	.30	207.00	32751175
Fleming, M. J.	11/15/12	Emails re: production.	.40	276.00	32772883
Fleming, M. J.	11/15/12	T/c's with N. Abularach re: discovery.	.20	138.00	32772896
Fleming, M. J.	11/15/12	Emails to N. Abularach re: employee issues.	.30	207.00	32772906
Fleming, M. J.	11/15/12	Office conference with N. Abularach and t/c's to J. Penn and M. Ledwin.	.30	207.00	32772917
Fleming, M. J.	11/15/12	Email to L. Schweitzer, R. Cooper and N. Abularach re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32772944
Fleming, M. J.	11/15/12	T/c with R. Ryan re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32772956
Fleming, M. J.	11/15/12	Email to R. Ryan re: claims.	.10	69.00	32772974

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Fleming, M. J.	11/15/12	Edited outline re: employee issues.	1.00	690.00	32772977
Fleming, M. J.	11/15/12	Emails re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32772985
Penn, J.	11/15/12	Correspondence with Abularach/Fleming re employee issues.	.30	207.00	32781613
O'Keefe, P.	11/15/12	Communications with M. Kahn regarding claims (.10) Search for and circulate related materials (.20)	.30	93.00	32712434
Reinstein, J. M	11/15/12	Research re: case issues.	.30	76.50	32719500
Malone, L.	11/15/12	Discuss employee issues w/M. Bunda (0.5); prepare for same (0.3)	.80	528.00	32842207
Malone, L.	11/15/12	Research re: case issue (0.7).	.70	462.00	32842423
Lipner, L.	11/15/12	Correspondence w/M. Kahn re employee issues (.1).	.10	66.00	32855223
Lipner, L.	11/15/12	O/c w/M. Bunda re employee issues (.4); Correspondence w/M. Bunda re same (.2).	.60	396.00	32855383
Hurley, R.	11/15/12	Extensive electronic document review for employee issues, per D. Stein.	9.00	1,710.00	32786849
Bagarella, L.	11/15/12	Telephone conversation with Mercer regarding employee benefits issues (.50). Telephone conversation with C. Kunz, L. Schweitzer, M. Alcock regarding employee issues (.70). Emails to K. Schulte regarding employee issue (.50).	1.70	1,071.00	32790943
Diaba, L. S.	11/15/12	Research re: case issues.	5.90	3,717.00	32848450
Erickson, J.	11/15/12	Work on discovery for employee issues, comms D. Stein, N. Abularach, V. Lashay re same (document tracking, database mgmt, uploads, production).	1.40	497.00	32718156
Iqbal, A.	11/15/12	Meeting w M Bunda to discuss research re case issue (0.7); Correspondence w J Uziel to discuss research re case issue (0.3); Reviewing personnel files for documents responsive to discovery requests (2.7).	3.70	1,813.00	32770274
Stein, D. G.	11/15/12	Review discovery with regard to employee issues.	4.00	1,960.00	32719550
Stein, D. G.	11/15/12	Prepare for production re: employee issues.	2.00	980.00	32719552
Uziel, J.L.	11/15/12	T/C with M. Fleming re: employee issues (0.1); T/C with M. Bunda re: same (0.1); T/C with R. Ryan re: same (0.1); T/C with A. Iqbal re: same (0.2)	.50	245.00	32828885
Kim, J.	11/15/12	Check nortel hotline per J. Croft.	.10	25.50	32712457

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Kahn, M.	11/15/12	Drafting doc request (2.3) and comm re: same (0.1).	2.40	996.00	32715756
Xu, D.	11/15/12	Legal research re: case issues.	2.00	830.00	32737494
Xu, D.	11/15/12	Reviewing logs re: employee issues.	1.40	581.00	32740101
Roll, J.	11/15/12	Pulled plan documents for binder per D. Stein	.80	204.00	32787250
Roll, J.	11/15/12	Corr. w/ R. Ryan re employee issues.	.10	25.50	32787257
Roll, J.	11/15/12	Scanned production letter	.20	51.00	32787263
Roll, J.	11/15/12	Added document to litigator's notebook per N. Abularach	.10	25.50	32787282
Schweitzer, L.	11/16/12	Telephone call Keach regarding employee issues.	.40	416.00	32841390
Schweitzer, L.	11/16/12	E-mails Beckerman, Ray etc. regarding same.	.30	312.00	32841523
Schweitzer, L.	11/16/12	Work on notices re: employee issues.	.30	312.00	32841550
Kim, J.	11/16/12	E-mail to J. Croft re: employee issue (.1)	.10	71.00	32821959
Bunda, M.	11/16/12	Work on legal and factual issues with respect to employee issues including corresponding with team (.70). meeting w/J. Uziel, A. Iqbal regarding legal research re: case issues. (.30).	1.00	700.00	32729220
Croft, J.	11/16/12	Call with claimant and updating response tracker re same (.3); call with A O'Donohue (.1); drafting and editing objection (4 hours); research re case issues (1 hour).	5.40	3,726.00	32728659
Fleming, M. J.	11/16/12	Emails re: notice.	.80	552.00	32772994
Fleming, M. J.	11/16/12	Emails to L. Schweitzer re: employee issues.	.30	207.00	32773081
Fleming, M. J.	11/16/12	Emails to J. Ray re: employee issues.	.30	207.00	32773084
Fleming, M. J.	11/16/12	T/c with J. Uziel re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32773087
Fleming, M. J.	11/16/12	T/c with J. Graffam re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32773102
Fleming, M. J.	11/16/12	Emails to L. Schweitzer, R. Cooper and N. Abularach.	.30	207.00	32773122
Fleming, M. J.	11/16/12	Created outline re: employee issues.	3.00	2,070.00	32773130
Fleming, M. J.	11/16/12	T/c to R. Eckenrod re: schedule.	.10	69.00	32773354
Fleming, M. J.	11/16/12	Email to L. Barefoot re: schedule.	.10	69.00	32773357
Fleming, M. J.	11/16/12	T/c with J. Uziel re: research re: case issues.	.50	345.00	32773380
Fleming, M. J.	11/16/12	Email to L. Schweitzer re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32773383

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Fleming, M. J.	11/16/12	T/c with R. Ryan re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32773390
Fleming, M. J.	11/16/12	T/c with B. Tunis re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32773413
Fleming, M. J.	11/16/12	Email to B. Tunis re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32773515
Fleming, M. J.	11/16/12	Email to K. Schulte re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32773594
Fleming, M. J.	11/16/12	Email to J. Penn re: research re: case issues.	.10	69.00	32773679
Fleming, M. J.	11/16/12	Office conference with B. Tunis re: mark-up.	.50	345.00	32773682
Penn, J.	11/16/12	Telephone call Diaba re research re: case issues.	.40	276.00	32792973
Hurley, R.	11/16/12	Extensive electronic document review for employee issues, per D. Stein.	10.30	1,957.00	32786855
Diaba, L. S.	11/16/12	call with J. Penn re: research re: case issues.	.40	252.00	32848469
Diaba, L. S.	11/16/12	Reviewing background plan documents.	2.70	1,701.00	32848483
Diaba, L. S.	11/16/12	Research re: case issues.	2.00	1,260.00	32848495
Iqbal, A.	11/16/12	Meetings (.30) and communications with M. Bunda and J. Uziel to discuss research re case issue (.8).	1.10	539.00	32770281
Stein, D. G.	11/16/12	Review documents with regard to discovery.	2.00	980.00	32782519
Uziel, J.L.	11/16/12	Email to R. Ryan re: employee issues (0.1); Work on communications re: employee issues (0.3); T/C with M. Fleming re: same (0.2); Email to L. Schweitzer re: same (0.2); Email to M. Bunda re: research re: case issues (0.2); Review and analyze materials re: same (0.5); O/C with M. Bunda and A. Iqbal re: employee issues (0.3); Conduct research re: case issues (4.0)	5.80	2,842.00	32828891
Kim, J.	11/16/12	Check Nortel Hotline per J. Croft.	.10	25.50	32733325
Tunis, B.	11/16/12	Prep for meeting (.20). Met with M. Fleming to discuss outline regarding case issues (.50).	.70	290.50	32760482
Tunis, B.	11/16/12	Work regarding case issues.	.90	373.50	32760483
Xu, D.	11/16/12	Legal research re: case issues.	2.90	1,203.50	32737892
Xu, D.	11/16/12	Research re: case issues.	2.10	871.50	32737917
Iqbal, A.	11/17/12	Research re case issue.	5.50	2,695.00	32770355
Uziel, J.L.	11/17/12	Conducted research re: employee issues	2.00	980.00	32828898
Bunda, M.	11/18/12	Reviewing research memo re: case issues and discussion of same w/J. Uziel, A. Iqbal; corresponding w/L. Schweitzer regarding same.	3.00	2,100.00	32730080

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Iqbal, A.	11/18/12	Research re case issue (6.6); Call w M Bunda and J Uziel to discuss research re case issue (0.7); Reviewing personnel files for documents responsive to discovery requests (0.8).	8.10	3,969.00	32770368
Uziel, J.L.	11/18/12	Conducted research re: case issues (1.8); Drafted memo re: same (3.0); Revise same (1.5); T/C with M. Bunda and A. Iqbal re: same (0.7)	7.00	3,430.00	32828913
Tunis, B.	11/18/12	Began working on and reviewing edits for outline re: case issues.	1.10	456.50	32760492
Schweitzer, L.	11/19/12	Review documents re: employee issues.	.90	936.00	32843053
Schweitzer, L.	11/19/12	Telephone call T. Matz.	.30	312.00	32843074
Schweitzer, L.	11/19/12	Telephone call Keach.	.30	312.00	32843101
Schweitzer, L.	11/19/12	Team meeting regarding employee issues.	1.30	1,352.00	32843135
Schweitzer, L.	11/19/12	Work on employee issues.	.60	624.00	32843415
Schweitzer, L.	11/19/12	Review e-mails regarding employee issues.	1.20	1,248.00	32843450
Schweitzer, L.	11/19/12	Miscellaneous correspondence re: employee issues.	.50	520.00	32843481
Schweitzer, L.	11/19/12	E-mails regarding meetings re: employee issues.	.20	208.00	32843563
Schweitzer, L.	11/19/12	Work re: employee issues.	.40	416.00	32843608
Cooper, R. A.	11/19/12	Review memo re: case issues.	1.00	915.00	32747366
Cooper, R. A.	11/19/12	Team meeting regarding employee issues.	1.50	1,372.50	32747373
Cooper, R. A.	11/19/12	Reviewed notices re: employee issues.	.60	549.00	32747401
Cooper, R. A.	11/19/12	Emails regarding employee issues.	.20	183.00	32747421
Cooper, R. A.	11/19/12	Reviewed summary chart re: employee issues	.40	366.00	32747432
Forrest, N.	11/19/12	Review papers re: employee issues.	2.00	1,680.00	32741994
Abularach, N.	11/19/12	Work re: employee issues (6.3); review documents re: employee issues (.5); review log re: employee issues (.5); review complaint re: employee issues (.5) review report re: employee issues (.5).	8.30	5,893.00	32778178
Bunda, M.	11/19/12	Team meeting regarding employee issues.	1.50	1,050.00	32771544
Bunda, M.	11/19/12	T/cs with team members re employee issues.	.30	210.00	32771599
Bunda, M.	11/19/12	Reviewing report re: employee issues.	.50	350.00	32771601
Croft, J.	11/19/12	Meeting re case issue with A O'Donohue (.4); prep for and follow-up re same (.3); editing response to and coordinating filing of same with A Cordo and	1.20	828.00	32737808

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
		L Schweitzer (.4); call with claimant (.1).			
Fleming, M. J.	11/19/12	Email to L. Schweitzer re: outline.	.10	69.00	32801485
Fleming, M. J.	11/19/12	Emails re: research re: case issues.	.20	138.00	32801492
Fleming, M. J.	11/19/12	Email to J. Opolsky re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32801615
Fleming, M. J.	11/19/12	Emails to D. Stein re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32801624
Fleming, M. J.	11/19/12	Email to J. Uziel re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32801632
Fleming, M. J.	11/19/12	T/c with D. Parker re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32801641
Fleming, M. J.	11/19/12	Email to N. Abularach re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32801681
Fleming, M. J.	11/19/12	Email to B. Tunis re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32801723
Fleming, M. J.	11/19/12	Email to R. Ryan re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32801837
Fleming, M. J.	11/19/12	Emails to A. Cordo re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32801843
Penn, J.	11/19/12	Meeting Liliane Diaba re Research re: case issues (.9); prep re : same (.1)	1.00	690.00	32793237
Penn, J.	11/19/12	Follow up research re: case issue comm. with Liliane Diaba provided by Darryl Stein.	.80	552.00	32845263
Reinstein, J. M	11/19/12	Research re: case issues.	1.50	382.50	32732764
Malone, L.	11/19/12	Review motion (1.0).	1.00	660.00	32842858
Hurley, R.	11/19/12	Extensive electronic document review for employee issues, per D. Stein.	9.50	1,805.00	32793963
Bagarella, L.	11/19/12	Telephone conversation with L. Schweitzer regarding employee issue (.40). Email to C. Kunz regarding employee issue (.20). Follow up email to K. Schultea (.20). Work regarding employee issues (1.30).	2.10	1,323.00	32791673
Diaba, L. S.	11/19/12	Prepared (.1) for and met with Jeff to discuss the status of the research re: case issues.(.9)	1.00	630.00	32834148
Diaba, L. S.	11/19/12	Research re: case issues.	6.70	4,221.00	32837964
Mainoo, A.	11/19/12	Review outline re: case issues.	.20	126.00	32732741
Mainoo, A.	11/19/12	Review complaint re: case issues.	.40	252.00	32734189
Erickson, J.	11/19/12	Work on discovery for employee issues, comms D. Stein, N. Abularach, V. Lashay re same (document tracking, database mgmt, uploads, production)	.50	177.50	32734206
Iqbal, A.	11/19/12	Reviewing documents responsive to discovery requests (2.0); Reviewing complaint (1.0);	5.00	2,450.00	32770413

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
		Reviewing report re: employee issues (0.5); Meeting team to discuss research re case issue (1.5).			
Stein, D. G.	11/19/12	Review documents with regard to employee issues.	5.00	2,450.00	32782665
Stein, D. G.	11/19/12	Review filings with regard to employee issues.	1.00	490.00	32782679
Uziel, J.L.	11/19/12	Prepare for meeting re employee issue (0.5); O/C with team re: same (1.5); Coordinate team meeting re: employee issues (0.1); T/C with R. Ryan re; same (0.2); Email to M. Fleming re: same (0.2); T/C with A. Mainoo re: same (0.1); Email to K. Schultea re: employee issues (0.7); Review checklist (0.1); Review complaint (0.6); Review materials and prepare for meeting re: employee issues (0.6)	4.60	2,254.00	32834370
Kim, J.	11/19/12	Check hotline per J. Croft.	.10	25.50	32769960
O'Donohue, A. K	11/19/12	Office conference with J. Croft re: employee issues.	.40	166.00	32770175
Tunis, B.	11/19/12	Edited and completed outline regarding case issues after Comms with D. Stein and A. Mainoo. Submitted draft for R. Ryan, D. Stein, A. Mainoo, and J. Uziel's review	3.90	1,618.50	32760489
Tunis, B.	11/19/12	Made edits to outline regarding case issues, as were provided to me by R. Ryan and A. Mainoo.	.60	249.00	32760490
Xu, D.	11/19/12	Legal research re: case issues.	2.50	1,037.50	32737946
Xu, D.	11/19/12	Write-up of legal research re: employee benefit issues	1.10	456.50	32737954
Roll, J.	11/19/12	Project re employee issues per D. Stein	4.50	1,147.50	32787412
Schweitzer, L.	11/20/12	Claimant e-mail.	.10	104.00	32779109
Schweitzer, L.	11/20/12	Stein conference, e-mails regarding discovery, correspondence.	.30	312.00	32779117
Schweitzer, L.	11/20/12	Keach e-mail.	.10	104.00	32779133
Schweitzer, L.	11/20/12	Work on objection including multiple telephone calls, conferences, e-mails regarding same.	6.50	6,760.00	32779145
Schweitzer, L.	11/20/12	Comm. L. Beckerman, T. Matz regarding same.	.50	520.00	32779180
Schweitzer, L.	11/20/12	LTD team meeting regarding discovery issues.	1.50	1,560.00	32779189
Schweitzer, L.	11/20/12	Conference w/ team . regarding Rose objection.	.50	520.00	32779210
Schweitzer, L.	11/20/12	Revise draft of same.	.30	312.00	32779260

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Cooper, R. A.	11/20/12	Reviewed complaint re: employee issues.	.50	457.50	32819623
Cooper, R. A.	11/20/12	Team meeting on complaint and discovery issues.	1.00	915.00	32819806
Cooper, R. A.	11/20/12	Emails regarding discovery issues.	.40	366.00	32819825
Cooper, R. A.	11/20/12	Emails with team regarding responses on discovery.	.30	274.50	32819841
Cooper, R. A.	11/20/12	Read draft report re: employee issues.	.70	640.50	32819868
Cooper, R. A.	11/20/12	Work in connection with employee issues.	2.50	2,287.50	32819890
Forrest, N.	11/20/12	Attend team meeting to review all issues (1.50); drafted and sent letter to opposing counsel re employee issues (1.50); review of papers re: employee issues (.80)	3.80	3,192.00	32777181
Abularach, N.	11/20/12	Team Mtg and related follow-up (1.80); file re-review and production (2.0); review and edit log (.70); revise ltr to Elliott Greenleaf in response to document complaints (1.0); prepare re-production of certain documents (1.30)	6.80	4,828.00	32778260
Bunda, M.	11/20/12	Work on employee issues including meetings and t/cs with team re same.	2.00	1,400.00	32771639
Bunda, M.	11/20/12	Team meeting.	1.40	980.00	32771648
Croft, J.	11/20/12	Meeting with team, re motion (.5). Follow-up re same (.3). Call with employee (.3).	1.10	759.00	32768295
Fleming, M. J.	11/20/12	T/c with D. Abbott re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32773692
Fleming, M. J.	11/20/12	Email to L. Bagarella re: cross-border claims.	.10	69.00	32773696
Fleming, M. J.	11/20/12	Team meeting (partial).	1.40	966.00	32773699
Fleming, M. J.	11/20/12	Set up travel to hearing.	.10	69.00	32773703
Fleming, M. J.	11/20/12	Set up call re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32773706
Fleming, M. J.	11/20/12	Drafted and edited objections and related comms with L. Schweitzer with Akin, Milbank, K. Schultea and D. Abbott.	11.30	7,797.00	32773842
Fleming, M. J.	11/20/12	Email to J. Croft re: call.	.10	69.00	32773847
Fleming, M. J.	11/20/12	Email to K. Schultea re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32773854
Fleming, M. J.	11/20/12	Drafted proposed order re: employee issues.	.30	207.00	32773857
Fleming, M. J.	11/20/12	T/c with A. Cordo re: hearing and related filings.	.10	69.00	32773869
Fleming, M. J.	11/20/12	T/c with L. Schweitzer re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32773875

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Fleming, M. J.	11/20/12	Emails re: order re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32773888
Penn, J.	11/20/12	Team Meeting.	1.50	1,035.00	32793252
Malone, L.	11/20/12	Meeting with team re: motion (0.6); review motion and research revised case issue (1.2); comm with L. Bagarella, M. Alcock and monitor re: cross-border issues (0.6); e-mails re: motion (0.8).	3.20	2,112.00	32843028
Hurley, R.	11/20/12	Extensive electronic document review for employee issues, per D. Stein.	9.00	1,710.00	32793964
Bagarella, L.	11/20/12	Crossborder employee claims call (1.30). Telephone conversation with J. Rich regarding employee claim (.20).	1.50	945.00	32791718
Diaba, L. S.	11/20/12	Spoke with J. Penn about the research re: case issue.	.30	189.00	32838059
Diaba, L. S.	11/20/12	Nortel research re case issues..	4.50	2,835.00	32838081
Mainoo, A.	11/20/12	Employee claims team meeting.	1.50	945.00	32739294
Erickson, J.	11/20/12	Work on discovery for employee issues, comms D. Stein, N. Abularach, P. Lang re same (document tracking, database mgmt, uploads, production)	.50	177.50	32745037
Erickson, J.	11/20/12	Document review management for employee issues.	.30	106.50	32745039
Iqbal, A.	11/20/12	Team meeting to discuss complaint re: employee issues (1.8); Reviewing responses to our document requests (5.5).	7.30	3,577.00	32770533
Stein, D. G.	11/20/12	Team meeting re: employee matters.	1.00	490.00	32782702
Stein, D. G.	11/20/12	Review documents with regard to employee issues.	7.00	3,430.00	32782836

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Uziel, J.L.	11/20/12	Review and analyze complaint and export report documents (0.5); O/C with team re: case issues (1.8); Arrange reservation for hearing (0.1); Draft portions of response to motion (1.6); Communications with R. Ryan re: employee issues (0.1); Compile materials for hearing (0.5); Review and markup report (2.0); T/C w/team re: employee issues (0.9); T/C with D. Stein re: same (0.1); Communications with M. Fleming re: same (0.3); T/C with M. Bunda re: same (0.2); Communications with M. Bunda and D. Stein re: same (0.7); O/C with J. Roll re: same (1.0); Prepare response to motion for filing (1.0); Email re: employee issues (0.1)	10.90	5,341.00	32837829
Kim, J.	11/20/12	Check Nortel Hotline per J. Croft.	.10	25.50	32773928
O'Donohue, A. K	11/20/12	Research re: case issue.	2.00	830.00	32770253
O'Donohue, A. K	11/20/12	Attend team conference to discuss employee issues and other updates.	1.80	747.00	32770261
O'Donohue, A. K	11/20/12	Office conference re: employee issues.	.60	249.00	32770265
Tunis, B.	11/20/12	meeting regarding employee matters	1.40	581.00	32743558
Tunis, B.	11/20/12	Completed research and memo regarding case issue	3.40	1,411.00	32743567
Tunis, B.	11/20/12	Looked for previous documents compiled regarding employee issues, to send to N. Abularach.	.50	207.50	32743575
Tunis, B.	11/20/12	Completed research for Rob Ryan regarding case issues.	1.80	747.00	32752025
Xu, D.	11/20/12	Nortel team meeting	1.50	622.50	32828619
Xu, D.	11/20/12	Preparation for team meeting.	.60	249.00	32828735
Roll, J.	11/20/12	Chart re employee issues per D. Stein (3.0); Assisted with preparing objection to preliminary injunction motion for filing per M. Fleming (3.5); Prepared binders for 11/21 hearing per R. Ryan (1.0); Corr. w/ Practice Support re compiling documents (0.2); Added documents to litigator's notebook (0.6).	8.30	2,116.50	32849393
Schweitzer, L.	11/21/12	Non-billable travel NJ to Del. (50% of 2.4 or 1.2)	1.20	1,248.00	32844942
Schweitzer, L.	11/21/12	Prepare for and attend hearing re: employee issues.	4.00	4,160.00	32844962
Schweitzer, L.	11/21/12	Non-billable travel Del. to NJ. (50% of 2.6 or 1.3)	1.30	1,352.00	32844991
Schweitzer, L.	11/21/12	Keach e-mail.	.10	104.00	32845004

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Schweitzer, L.	11/21/12	Levin e-mails.	.10	104.00	32845018
Forrest, N.	11/21/12	Listened to court hearing re: employee issues (1.0); various emails re discovery issues (1.0)	2.00	1,680.00	32777872
Bunda, M.	11/21/12	T/cs with team regarding employee issues.	2.00	1,400.00	32774399
Croft, J.	11/21/12	Drafting and editing response to motion (3.0). Research re case issue (1.0). Circulating same (.3). Call with A. Donohohue re same (.1). Call with employee (.3). Reviewing documents re employee motion (1.0). Drafting declaration in support of response and emails with declarant (.5).	6.20	4,278.00	32768579
Fleming, M. J.	11/21/12	Emails to T. Snow re: contact.	.20	138.00	32779529
Fleming, M. J.	11/21/12	Emails re: service.	.30	207.00	32779535
Fleming, M. J.	11/21/12	Hearing summary email to J. Ray.	.60	414.00	32779560
Fleming, M. J.	11/21/12	Email to R. Cooper re: hearing.	.10	69.00	32779569
Fleming, M. J.	11/21/12	Email to R. Ryan re: order.	.10	69.00	32779579
O'Keefe, P.	11/21/12	Communications with K. Huff and A. O'Donohue (.20) Retrieve case law re: case issue as per A. O'Donohue (.30) Edited case citations as per A. O'Donohue (1.20)	1.70	527.00	32768994
Malone, L.	11/21/12	E-mails re: employee motion (0.8).	.80	528.00	32843429
Hurley, R.	11/21/12	Extensive electronic document review for employee issues, per D. Stein.	10.30	1,957.00	32793965
Klein, K.T.	11/21/12	Review document re: employee issue	.30	189.00	32758994
Diaba, L. S.	11/21/12	Research re: case issues.	6.50	4,095.00	32834582
Mainoo, A.	11/21/12	Correspondence from and to R. Ryan regarding service.	.10	63.00	32751155
Erickson, J.	11/21/12	Work on discovery for employee issues, comms D. Stein, N. Abularach, V. Lashay re same (document tracking, database mgmt, uploads, production).	1.00	355.00	32768206
Stein, D. G.	11/21/12	Meeting with team regarding motion re: employee issues.	.50	245.00	32783114
Kim, J.	11/21/12	Check Nortel Hotline per J. Croft.	.10	25.50	32774172
O'Donohue, A. K	11/21/12	Attend hearing re: employee issues.	1.90	788.50	32770278
O'Donohue, A. K	11/21/12	Participate in conference call re: witness preparation.	.70	290.50	32770308
O'Donohue, A. K	11/21/12	Summarize points and tasks from conference call	.40	166.00	32770330

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
		re: employee issues for M. Bunda.			
O'Donohue, A. K	11/21/12	Research case issue.	3.50	1,452.50	32770403
Tunis, B.	11/21/12	Attended telephonic hearing regarding case issues	2.00	830.00	32752009
Xu, D.	11/21/12	Telephone conference on employee issues (2.0). Research on case issues (.9). Comm re: same (.7).	3.60	1,494.00	32828715
Roll, J.	11/21/12	Prepared letter for mailing per D. Stein (0.2); correspondence w/R. Ryan re service list (0.2); scanned documents per A. Iqbal (0.5).	.90	229.50	32849554
Cheung, S.	11/21/12	Circulated monitored docket online.	.20	30.00	32770306
Fleming, M. J.	11/22/12	Email re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32780123
Schweitzer, L.	11/23/12	Work on report re: employee issues.	1.20	1,248.00	32836795
Cooper, R. A.	11/23/12	Work on reviewing report re: employee issues.	1.20	1,098.00	32820088
Cooper, R. A.	11/23/12	Emails with L. Schweitzer and M. Bunda regarding employee issues.	.20	183.00	32820100
Schweitzer, L.	11/24/12	R. Ryan e-mails regarding employee issues.	.40	416.00	32836861
Schweitzer, L.	11/24/12	M. Bunda, R. Cooper e-mails regarding employee issues.	.40	416.00	32836897
Bunda, M.	11/24/12	Commenting on employee issues and team correspondence regarding same.	1.60	1,120.00	32774423
Fleming, M. J.	11/24/12	Emails re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32779597
Fleming, M. J.	11/24/12	Emails re: call with E. Greenleaf.	.10	69.00	32780114
Uziel, J.L.	11/24/12	Review and revise report re: employee issues.	2.50	1,225.00	32841498
Schweitzer, L.	11/25/12	Work on employee issues.	.80	832.00	32836962
Cooper, R. A.	11/25/12	Call with L. Schweitzer and M. Bunda regarding revisions to report re: employee issues.	.80	732.00	32820137
Cooper, R. A.	11/25/12	Further review of report re: employee issues.	.40	366.00	32820145
Cooper, R. A.	11/25/12	Emails regarding draft document re: employee issues.	.20	183.00	32820149
Bunda, M.	11/25/12	Revising report re: employee issues (2.7) and t/c w/L. R. Cooper regarding same.(.8)	3.50	2,450.00	32774432
Fleming, M. J.	11/25/12	Emails re: employee issues.	.30	207.00	32779591
Mainoo, A.	11/25/12	Draft notice re: employee issues.	1.50	945.00	32760803
Mainoo, A.	11/25/12	Draft correspondence responding to request re:	3.70	2,331.00	32764160

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
		employee issues.			
Bromley, J. L.	11/26/12	Ems L. Schweitzer, J. Ray re: employee issues (.50)	.50	547.50	32858683
Schweitzer, L.	11/26/12	Work on report re: employee issues, including team meeting regarding same.	1.50	1,560.00	32845853
Schweitzer, L.	11/26/12	Scheduling order re: employee issues.	.10	104.00	32845865
Schweitzer, L.	11/26/12	E-mail Fleming regarding employee issues.	.10	104.00	32845875
Schweitzer, L.	11/26/12	N. Berger e-mails.	.10	104.00	32845889
Schweitzer, L.	11/26/12	E. Greenleaf e-mails regarding employee issues.	.10	104.00	32845911
Schweitzer, L.	11/26/12	Telephone call Towers, e-mail Fleming regarding employee issues.	.30	312.00	32845930
Schweitzer, L.	11/26/12	Telephone call D. Abbott, A. Cordo, J. Kim regarding employee issues.	.60	624.00	32845949
Schweitzer, L.	11/26/12	Follow-up e-mails regarding same.	.30	312.00	32845974
Schweitzer, L.	11/26/12	Telephone call Elliott Greenleaf, team. regarding employee issues, litigation issues including follow-up meeting, e-mails regarding same.	1.70	1,768.00	32846505
Schweitzer, L.	11/26/12	Work on individual employee claims.	.40	416.00	32846681
Schweitzer, L.	11/26/12	Work re: employee issues.	2.30	2,392.00	32846697
Cooper, R. A.	11/26/12	Work reviewing report re: employee issues.	.90	823.50	32820808
Cooper, R. A.	11/26/12	Call with team member regarding employee issues.	1.50	1,372.50	32820860
Cooper, R. A.	11/26/12	Reviewed draft email to Elliot Greenleaf regarding employee issues.	.30	274.50	32820870
Cooper, R. A.	11/26/12	Call with M. Bunda regarding employee issues.	.20	183.00	32820902
Cooper, R. A.	11/26/12	Meet and confer call w/ team and Elliot Greenleaf.	1.80	1,647.00	32820928
Cooper, R. A.	11/26/12	Discussion with M. Bunda regarding employee issues.	.20	183.00	32820935
Forrest, N.	11/26/12	Conf call team with counsel to discuss employee issues (1.50). Meeting team re same (.30); read administrative agreements re employee issues (1.50); various emails re employee issues (.70).	4.00	3,360.00	32781980
Abularach, N.	11/26/12	Draft email to Elliott Greenleaf re employee issues, draft ltr to Court re same, Review file re: employee issues, Review log for production	7.60	5,396.00	32845929

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Abularach, N.	11/26/12	Review draft objection re: employee issues.	.30	213.00	32845940
Bunda, M.	11/26/12	Work on report re: employee issues.	3.40	2,380.00	32842905
Bunda, M.	11/26/12	Conference call re: employee issues.	1.40	980.00	32842942
Croft, J.	11/26/12	Drafting declarations re: employee issues and communication with client and L Malone re same (.6). Emails with N. Abularach and L. Malone re case issue (.3). Comms and emails with A. O'Donohue re pleading (.5). Editing same (1.5). Reviewing case relevant to same (.3). Emails comms with L. Schweitzer and A. Cordo re same (.5).	3.70	2,553.00	32777857
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Office conference with D. Stein.	.40	276.00	32782964
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Email to J. Uziel.	.10	69.00	32782977
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Email to R. Ryan re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32782994
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	T/c with D. Abbott and A. Cordo.	.20	138.00	32782997
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Email to J. Bromley and H. Zelbo re: employee issues.	.30	207.00	32782999
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Email to L. Schweitzer.	.10	69.00	32783002
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Reviewed statements re: employee issues and related emails.	.50	345.00	32783006
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	T/c with N. Abularach.	.30	207.00	32783029
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Email to K. Schulte re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32808743
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Emails to D. Stein re: meeting.	.20	138.00	32808747
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	T/c with R. Ryan.	.10	69.00	32808749
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Email to L. Schweitzer re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32808795
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	T/c with J. Thomson and J. Opolsky; Follow-up with J. Opolsky and email to L. Schweitzer.	.40	276.00	32808812
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Reviewed document re: employee issues.	.30	207.00	32808819
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Email to L. Schweitzer re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32808887
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Meet and confer re: employee issues; Follow-up with team.	1.80	1,242.00	32809061
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Email to D. Abbott and A. Cordo	.10	69.00	32809852
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	T/c with J. Penn.	.10	69.00	32809983
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Email to L. Schweitzer re: document re: employee	.20	138.00	32810119

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
		issues.			
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Email to J. Opolsky re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32810253
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Set up call.	.10	69.00	32810350
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Reviewed notice re: employee issues; Related emails.	.70	483.00	32810521
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Email to A. Mainoo re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32810610
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Email to D. Stein re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32810613
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Email to J. Uziel re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32810615
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Email to J. Croft.	.10	69.00	32810619
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Email to D. Parker.	.20	138.00	32810729
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Emails to J. Uziel.	.20	138.00	32810839
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Emails to R. Ryan re: employee issue.	.20	138.00	32810875
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Email to A. Cordo re employee issues.	.10	69.00	32810887
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Email to L. Schweitzer and R. Cooper.	.10	69.00	32811001
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Email to A. Cordo re: notice.	.10	69.00	32811043
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Emails to N. Abularach.	.30	207.00	32811046
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Email to L. Schweitzer re: call.	.10	69.00	32811079
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	T/c's with E. Demel.	.40	276.00	32811086
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Email to K. Schulte.	.10	69.00	32811087
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Email to J. Thomson.	.10	69.00	32811094
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Created schedule re: employee issues and email to K. Schulte.	.10	69.00	32811100
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Email to L. Schweitzer re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32811103
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Email to S. Skelly re: inquiry.	.10	69.00	32811107
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Email to L. Schweitzer re: call.	.10	69.00	32836669
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Email to D. Stein re: call.	.10	69.00	32836682
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Email to K. Schulte re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32836700
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Email to L. Schweitzer re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32836719
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Email to D. Stein re: meeting.	.10	69.00	32836730
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Email traffic re: call with Committee.	.20	138.00	32836747

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Email to L. Schweitzer and R. Cooper re: employee issues.	.30	207.00	32836800
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	T/c with L. Schweitzer re: retention.	.10	69.00	32836833
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	T/c with J. Uziel.	.20	138.00	32836887
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Edited certificate of counsel and related email to J. Uziel.	.10	69.00	32836910
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	T/c with A. Cordo.	.10	69.00	32836924
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Email to L. Schweitzer re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32837656
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	T/c's with D. Parker.	.20	138.00	32837674
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	Email to N. Abularach.	.10	69.00	32837682
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	T/c with J. Thomson.	.10	69.00	32837710
Fleming, M. J.	11/26/12	T/c's with J. Uziel.	.30	207.00	32837730
Penn, J.	11/26/12	Email to J Kraft (Seyfarth). T/c Megan Fleming re: employee issues.	.80	552.00	32907711
Malone, L.	11/26/12	Work related to motion (1.0); e-mails re: employee issues (0.5); research re: case issue (1.0).	2.50	1,650.00	32849198
Lipner, L.	11/26/12	Correspondence w/J. Croft re employee issues (.3).	.30	198.00	32851348
Hurley, R.	11/26/12	Extensive electronic document review for employee issues, per D. Stein.	9.30	1,767.00	32809031
Mainoo, A.	11/26/12	Correspondence from and to M. Fleming regarding employee issues.	.10	63.00	32775047
Erickson, J.	11/26/12	Work on discovery for employee issues, comms D. Stein, N. Abularach, V. Lashay re same (document tracking, database mgmt, uploads, production).	.50	177.50	32806589
Erickson, J.	11/26/12	Document review management for employee issues.	.50	177.50	32806591
Stein, D. G.	11/26/12	Review documents with regard to employee issues.	4.00	1,960.00	32783124
Stein, D. G.	11/26/12	Meeting with M. Fleming with regard to employee issues (.4); prep re: same (.1)	.50	245.00	32783128
Stein, D. G.	11/26/12	Call with Elliott Greenleaf, team.	1.00	490.00	32783137
Uziel, J.L.	11/26/12	Prepare for T/C with team (0.2); T/C with team re: employee issues (0.8); Follow up O/C with team re: same (0.7); T/C with team re: same (0.7); T/C with S. Wilson, K. Kirgiz and M. Bunda re: same (0.3); O/C with M. Bunda re: same (0.4); Email	8.20	4,018.00	32842828

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
		to D. Parker re: employee issues (0.2); Draft certification of counsel re: employee issues (0.5); Communications w/ M. Fleming re: employee issues (0.4); Email to L. Schweitzer re: employee issues (0.1); Review docket re: employee claim issue (0.1) and email to M. Fleming re: same (0.1); Communications with R. Ryan re: employee issues (0.2); Emails to J. Ray, L. Beckerman and T. Matz re: employee issues (0.2); Email to L. Schweitzer and R. Cooper re: employee issues (0.2); T/C with A. Iqbal re: employee issues (0.1); T/C with M. Bunda re employee issues (0.1); Email to J. Bromley re: same (0.3); Preparation for T/C with Elliott Greenleaf re: employee issues (0.2); T/C with Elliott Greenleaf, team and follow up meeting re: same (1.7); Prepare documents (0.3); Review and analyze emails from D. Parker re: data questions (0.2); Emails to N. Berger and L. Schweitzer re: employee issues (0.2)			
Kim, J.	11/26/12	Check Nortel Hotline.	.10	25.50	32841139
O'Donohue, A. K	11/26/12	Research and draft memo on case issue for R. Ryan.	1.10	456.50	32786488
O'Donohue, A. K	11/26/12	Review cases re: employee issues for J. Croft.	3.60	1,494.00	32786504
O'Donohue, A. K	11/26/12	Revise motion and incorporate L. Schweitzer's edits into the motion and declarations.	.90	373.50	32786539
Roll, J.	11/26/12	Prepared materials for meeting per D. Stein (1.0); updated chart of documents per J. Uziel (2.0); scanned documents per A. Iqbal (2.0).	5.00	1,275.00	32849734
Schweitzer, L.	11/27/12	Telephone call H. Zelbo, Ling regarding employee issues.	.50	520.00	32786213
Schweitzer, L.	11/27/12	Conference team regarding employee issues including L. Beckerman telephone call regarding same.	1.70	1,768.00	32786251
Schweitzer, L.	11/27/12	Telephone call Levin.	.30	312.00	32786263
Schweitzer, L.	11/27/12	Telephone call N. Berger regarding employee issues.	.40	416.00	32786275
Schweitzer, L.	11/27/12	Work on employee issues.	.40	416.00	32786344
Schweitzer, L.	11/27/12	Team meeting regarding employee issues.	4.00	4,160.00	32786363
Schweitzer, L.	11/27/12	Work on employee issues.	.60	624.00	32786370
Schweitzer, L.	11/27/12	E-mails K. Schulte, M. Fleming regarding employee issues.	.40	416.00	32786408

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Schweitzer, L.	11/27/12	Ryan e-mail regarding employee issues.	.10	104.00	32786427
Schweitzer, L.	11/27/12	Uziel, etc. e-mails regarding employee issues.	.30	312.00	32786440
Kim, J.	11/27/12	T/c w/ S. Peters re: employee claim (.1), mtg w/ L. Schweitzer re: same (.1), t/c w/ J. Rich re: employee claims (.1), research re: case issue (.3), t/c w/ J. Davison re: employee claims. (.1)	.70	497.00	32819604
Cooper, R. A.	11/27/12	Reviewed draft re: employee issues.	.30	274.50	32821228
Cooper, R. A.	11/27/12	Call re: employee issues.	1.00	915.00	32821231
Cooper, R. A.	11/27/12	Team meeting regarding employee issues.	1.80	1,647.00	32821235
Cooper, R. A.	11/27/12	Team meeting regarding employee issues.	1.50	1,372.50	32821240
Cooper, R. A.	11/27/12	Reviewed report re: employee issues.	.50	457.50	32821246
Forrest, N.	11/27/12	Various emails re employee issues (1.0); prepared and sent email to E. Greenleaf re: employee issues (1.0).	2.00	1,680.00	32792274
Abularach, N.	11/27/12	review documents re: employee issues (.6); t/c with M. Ledwin re employee issues (0.1) and d/c with M. Fleming (.5); work on employee issues (5.4)	6.60	4,686.00	32845993
Bunda, M.	11/27/12	Work on employee issues.	6.30	4,410.00	32843167
Croft, J.	11/27/12	Reviewing and editing response to employee motion (2.5 hours). Calls, emails and office conference with team re same (1 hour). Compiling exhibits re same (.5). Research re case issues (.5).	4.50	3,105.00	32787438
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Email to J. Penn re: call.	.10	69.00	32825286
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Emails with D. Stein re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32825292
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Email to R. Ryan re: notices.	.10	69.00	32825301
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Email to J. Kim re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32825305
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Email to L. Bagarella re: cross-border employee claims.	.10	69.00	32825310
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Emails with K. Schulte and L. Schweitzer re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32825313
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	T/c with L. Schweitzer re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32825317
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	T/c with R. Ryan re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32825320
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	T/c with N. Abularach re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32825323
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Email to R. Ryan re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32825326

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Edited notice re: employee issues.	.30	207.00	32825334
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Emails to L. Schweitzer re: employee issues.	.30	207.00	32825337
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Email to R. Ryan re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32825346
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Email to J. Penn re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32825350
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Office conference with J. Uziel re: employee issues. (1) + prep re. same (0.1)	1.10	759.00	32825355
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	T/c with D. Hardin re: Retiree/LTD issues.	.10	69.00	32825358
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Office conference with N. Abularach re: employee issues.	.50	345.00	32825365
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Emails to J. Uziel re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32825371
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Office conference with J. Kim re: employee issues.	.60	414.00	32825374
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	T/c with M. Ledwin and follow-up with N. Abularach.	.70	483.00	32825376
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	T/c's with J. Uziel re: employee issues.	.30	207.00	32825382
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Created list of testimony topics.	2.20	1,518.00	32825384
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	T/c with D. Hardin and V. Fariswani.	.20	138.00	32825386
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Edited insurance letter.	.20	138.00	32825387
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Email to J. Uziel re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32825395
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Filed certificate of counsel.	.10	69.00	32825398
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Email to A. Cordo re: service.	.10	69.00	32825404
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Email to E. Demel.	.60	414.00	32825406
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Email to T. Minott re: service.	.10	69.00	32825409
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Reviewed report re: employee issues.	.40	276.00	32825412
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Emails re: team meeting.	.30	207.00	32825418
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Emails re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32825423
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Email to L. Schweitzer and R. Cooper re: depositions.	.20	138.00	32825427
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Email to J. Uziel re: certificate of counsel.	.10	69.00	32825431
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Emails re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32825433
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Email to K. Schulte re: deposition.	.10	69.00	32825437
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Email to R. Ryan and J. Penn re: research.	.10	69.00	32825441

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Emails with J. Ray re: deposition.	.20	138.00	32825444
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Emails to A. Mainoo re: deposition notice.	.20	138.00	32825446
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Drafted letter to M. Kohart.	.60	414.00	32825447
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Schedule meeting re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32825453
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Email to J. Graffam re: deposition.	.10	69.00	32825455
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Email to D. Parker re: deposition.	.10	69.00	32825458
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Email to E. Demel.	.20	138.00	32825462
Penn, J.	11/27/12	Employee Matters. T/c Howard Pianko.	.30	207.00	32804190
Hurley, R.	11/27/12	Extensive electronic document review for employee issues, per D. Stein.	9.30	1,767.00	32809034
Bagarella, L.	11/27/12	crossborder claims call with Goodmans (.4), call with J. Uziel and L. Schweitzer re. employee issue (.3), follow up re. same (.5), emails with M. Alcock and L. Schweitzer re. employee claim (.4)	1.60	1,008.00	32853360
Diaba, L. S.	11/27/12	Research re: case issue.	5.10	3,213.00	32834461
Mainoo, A.	11/27/12	Revise correspondence re: employee issues.	.20	126.00	32775061
Mainoo, A.	11/27/12	Revise deposition notice.	.20	126.00	32784048
Mainoo, A.	11/27/12	Correspondence to L. Schweitzer and R. Cooper regarding notice.	.10	63.00	32784049
Mainoo, A.	11/27/12	Begin drafting responses and objections.	.80	504.00	32794947
Erickson, J.	11/27/12	Work on discovery for employee issues, comms D. Stein, N. Abularach, V. Lashay re same.	.50	177.50	32806549
Iqbal, A.	11/27/12	Assembling personnel files for production (1.5); reviewing responses to our document requests (.3).	1.80	882.00	32819150
Stein, D. G.	11/27/12	Review documents with regard to motion.	.50	245.00	32823134
Stein, D. G.	11/27/12	Planning regarding discovery.	.50	245.00	32823246
Uziel, J.L.	11/27/12	Email to N. Berger re: order (0.1); Review and analyze report (0.2); Prepare for O/C with M. Fleming re: employee issues (0.1); Review plan documents (0.2); Review notice (0.3); O/C with M. Fleming re: employee issues (1.0); Email to D. Parker re: data questions (0.3); Email to R. Ryan re: employee issues (0.1); Email to M. Bunda re: same (0.2); Email to team member re: same (0.1); Prepare spreadsheet for email (0.1); Email to L. Schweitzer re: employee issues (0.6); Prepare for call with team re employee issues (0.2); Email to	8.80	4,312.00	32848619

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
		team member re: plan documents (0.1); Emails to J. Ray, L. Beckerman and T. Matz re: employee issues (0.3); Email to L. Schweitzer re: same (0.1); Communications with M. Fleming and R. Ryan re: same (0.2); Team meeting re: export reports T/C with S. Wilson, K. Kirgiz and E. Kra and follow up meeting re: report (4.4); Review emails (0.2)			
Kim, J.	11/27/12	Check Nortel Hotline per J. Croft.	.10	25.50	32841635
O'Donohue, A. K	11/27/12	Shepardize cases for J. Croft.	.70	290.50	32786736
O'Donohue, A. K	11/27/12	Find, download, and send cases cited in memorandum to R. Ryan.	.30	124.50	32786826
Tunis, B.	11/27/12	Spoke with R. Ryan regarding research on case issues.	.20	83.00	32828622
Roll, J.	11/27/12	Updated list of documents and pulled new documents to send to team per J. Uziel (2.5); Organized scanned documents produced by LTD employees per A. Iqbal (0.6); Updated privilege log per D. Stein (1.6).	4.70	1,198.50	32850238
Schweitzer, L.	11/28/12	Reading e-mail regarding research.	.20	208.00	32848740
Schweitzer, L.	11/28/12	Conference Cooper, Fleming, Forest regarding deposition notice, prep issues.	1.20	1,248.00	32848787
Schweitzer, L.	11/28/12	Follow-up correspondence, review of drafts regarding same.	.50	520.00	32848802
Schweitzer, L.	11/28/12	Telephone call Ray regarding employee litigation matters.	.30	312.00	32848830
Schweitzer, L.	11/28/12	Telephone call McDonald, Beckerman, Matz, etc. regarding employee issues.	1.00	1,040.00	32848970
Schweitzer, L.	11/28/12	Follow-up telephone call Herrington.	.10	104.00	32848996
Schweitzer, L.	11/28/12	Work on employee issues including draft report, telephone calls regarding same.	2.50	2,600.00	32849101
Schweitzer, L.	11/28/12	Work on discovery, depo prep issues.	1.50	1,560.00	32849114
Cooper, R. A.	11/28/12	Meeting with L. Schweitzer, M. Fleming, and N. Forrest regarding depositions.	.20	183.00	32821313
Cooper, R. A.	11/28/12	Emails with associates and LSchweitzer regarding deposition notices.	.40	366.00	32822767
Cooper, R. A.	11/28/12	Reviewed additional changes to report.	.50	457.50	32823188
Cooper, R. A.	11/28/12	Call with team re employee issues.	.80	732.00	32823233

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Cooper, R. A.	11/28/12	Discussion of class action complaint with L. Schweitzer.	.50	457.50	32823242
Forrest, N.	11/28/12	Meeting L. Schweitzer, Roger Cooper, M. Fleming re depositions and subjects and schedules relating thereto (1.2). Work on notice of depositions and cover letter, various emails re same and conf A. Mainoo re same (3.0); review latest topic list for Nortel deposition witnesses (.30).	4.50	3,780.00	32809240
Bunda, M.	11/28/12	Work on employee issues.	4.20	2,940.00	32843427
Croft, J.	11/28/12	Editing response to employee motion, including emails with L. Schweitzer, M. Alcock and A. Cordo re same (1 hour). Compiling exhibits re same (1 hour). Emails with M. Cilia and C. Brown re employee claims and notice of settled claims (.6).	2.60	1,794.00	32801630
Fleming, M. J.	11/28/12	Meeting preparation.	.20	138.00	32824742
Fleming, M. J.	11/28/12	T/c with J. Penn re: research.	.10	69.00	32824750
Fleming, M. J.	11/28/12	Office conference with L. Schweitzer, R. Cooper and N. Forrest.	1.20	828.00	32824764
Fleming, M. J.	11/28/12	T/c with J. Uziel.	.30	207.00	32824774
Fleming, M. J.	11/28/12	Edited letter and emails to N. Forrest.	.60	414.00	32824782
Fleming, M. J.	11/28/12	Edited topic list and email to J. Ray and K. Schultea.	.60	414.00	32824791
Fleming, M. J.	11/28/12	Email to J. Graffam re: deposition.	.10	69.00	32824799
Fleming, M. J.	11/28/12	Email to N. Forrest and A. Mainoo re: deposition notice.	.30	207.00	32824818
Fleming, M. J.	11/28/12	Email to N. Forrest re: deposition.	.30	207.00	32824827
Fleming, M. J.	11/28/12	T/c with K. Schultea re: deposition.	.10	69.00	32824830
Fleming, M. J.	11/28/12	Emails to L. Schweitzer, R. Cooper and N. Forrest.	.30	207.00	32824837
Fleming, M. J.	11/28/12	Emails to A. Mainoo re: deposition.	.20	138.00	32824843
Fleming, M. J.	11/28/12	T/c with A. Mainoo re: letter.	.10	69.00	32824850
Fleming, M. J.	11/28/12	Email to team re: schedule.	.40	276.00	32824857
Fleming, M. J.	11/28/12	Email to D. Stein re: deposition.	.10	69.00	32824865
Fleming, M. J.	11/28/12	Emails re: deposition notices with A. Mainoo.	.20	138.00	32824869
Fleming, M. J.	11/28/12	Emails re: deposition schedule with team.	.30	207.00	32824878

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Fleming, M. J.	11/28/12	Emails re: letter to M. Kohart.	.10	69.00	32824884
Fleming, M. J.	11/28/12	Emails with N. Abularach re: employee issue.	.20	138.00	32824889
Fleming, M. J.	11/28/12	Emails re: census information with L. Schweitzer and J. Uziel.	.10	69.00	32824905
Fleming, M. J.	11/28/12	Emails re: updated topic list.	.20	138.00	32824913
Fleming, M. J.	11/28/12	Email to J. Uziel re: census.	.10	69.00	32824920
Fleming, M. J.	11/28/12	Emails to A. Mainoo re: subpoena.	.20	138.00	32824925
Penn, J.	11/28/12	Employee Matters. T/c Megan Fleming (.1) and email Liliane Diaba re case research.(.4)	.50	345.00	32801218
Hurley, R.	11/28/12	Extensive electronic document review for employee issues, per D. Stein.	8.80	1,672.00	32809038
Bagarella, L.	11/28/12	preparation for call.	.70	441.00	32855472
Diaba, L. S.	11/28/12	Research re: case issue.	.80	504.00	32834483
Mainoo, A.	11/28/12	Draft deposition notices.	.30	189.00	32790520
Mainoo, A.	11/28/12	Review revised deposition notice.	.10	63.00	32791023
Mainoo, A.	11/28/12	Revise draft letter re: employee issues.	.40	252.00	32791343
Mainoo, A.	11/28/12	Finalize correspondence re: employee issues.	2.70	1,701.00	32794942
Mainoo, A.	11/28/12	Continue drafting responses and objections.	5.30	3,339.00	32794945
Erickson, J.	11/28/12	Work on discovery for employee issues, comms D. Stein, N. Abularach, A. Iqbal, V. Lashay re same.	2.50	887.50	32807231
Erickson, J.	11/28/12	Document review management for employee issues.	.50	177.50	32808600
Iqbal, A.	11/28/12	Discussing depositions with R. Cooper.	.20	98.00	32820012
Stein, D. G.	11/28/12	Planning for discovery.	.50	245.00	32823930
Stein, D. G.	11/28/12	Review documents with regard to discovery.	1.00	490.00	32824005
Uziel, J.L.	11/28/12	Draft response and email same to L. Schweitzer (1.6); T/C with M. Bunda re: report (0.2); Communications with M. Fleming re: employee issues (0.3); T/C with R. Ryan re: employee issues (0.2); T/C with A. Cordo re: same (0.1); Review email from N. Berger re: scheduling order (0.1); Revise email re: data questions (0.3); Review and analyze revised document (1.5); O/C with team re: T/C with team and revisions to report/exhibits (3.0); Email to N. Berger re: data questions (0.2)	7.50	3,675.00	32850743

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
O'Donohue, A. K	11/28/12	Revise draft memo on case issue and circulate cases to team.	1.10	456.50	32804169
Tunis, B.	11/28/12	Spoke with D. Stein and emailed relevant documents to him regarding case issues.	.20	83.00	32829019
Tunis, B.	11/28/12	Corresponded further with D. Stein regarding case issues.	.20	83.00	32829098
Roll, J.	11/28/12	Prepared binders of documents in privilege log per D. Stein.	1.70	433.50	32850426
Croft, J.	11/29/12	Employee claims resolution team meeting (.4). Research re employee issues (.2). Emails with M. Cilia, C. Brown and D. Parker re same (.2).	.80	552.00	32816539
Schweitzer, L.	11/29/12	E-mails Cordo, Fatel, Herrington, etc. regarding deferred comp. hearing scheduling.	.30	312.00	32838996
Schweitzer, L.	11/29/12	Team meeting regarding deposition, discovery issues.	1.20	1,248.00	32839020
Schweitzer, L.	11/29/12	Conference Ryan regarding mediation issues.	.20	208.00	32839121
Schweitzer, L.	11/29/12	Review draft, telephone calls and e-mails regarding same.	1.00	1,040.00	32839302
Schweitzer, L.	11/29/12	Fleming e-mail regarding EE correspondence.	.20	208.00	32839453
Schweitzer, L.	11/29/12	E-mails Herrington, Kim regarding employee issues.	.20	208.00	32839496
Schweitzer, L.	11/29/12	Telephone call Beckerman, Matz regarding mediation, including follow-up conference Fleming.	1.20	1,248.00	32839640
Schweitzer, L.	11/29/12	mediation prep.	.70	728.00	32840403
Kim, J.	11/29/12	Review e-mails re: employee claims (.2), t/c w/ R. Ryan re: same (.1).	.30	213.00	32843301
Cooper, R. A.	11/29/12	Team meeting on legal issues and depositions.	1.50	1,372.50	32824036
Cooper, R. A.	11/29/12	Reviewed draft letter from NAbularach.	.30	274.50	32824045
Cooper, R. A.	11/29/12	Call with M. Bunda regarding report status.	.40	366.00	32824056
Cooper, R. A.	11/29/12	Call with M. Bunda regarding employee issues materials.	.40	366.00	32824067
Cooper, R. A.	11/29/12	Reviewed final changes to report and exhibits.	.80	732.00	32824076
Forrest, N.	11/29/12	Team meeting to review employee issues (2.0); various emails re scheduling issues (1.0); email exchange counsel re open discovery issues (.50); sent email re: scheduling issues (.50)	4.00	3,360.00	32824039

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Abularach, N.	11/29/12	Priv log (.2); correspondence re discovery dispute follow-up (.9); review agreement (.7); team mtg re depo prep and related follow-up work re depo prep (7.0)	8.80	6,248.00	32846096
Bunda, M.	11/29/12	Work on employee issues.	5.00	3,500.00	32846103
Fleming, M. J.	11/29/12	Email to D. Stein re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32824968
Fleming, M. J.	11/29/12	T/c with R. Ryan re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32824971
Fleming, M. J.	11/29/12	Email to L. Schweitzer re: term sheet.	.20	138.00	32824976
Fleming, M. J.	11/29/12	Edited R & O to 30(b)(6) notice.	2.60	1,794.00	32824982
Fleming, M. J.	11/29/12	T/c with D. Stein.	.10	69.00	32824988
Fleming, M. J.	11/29/12	T/c with J. Uziel re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32825003
Fleming, M. J.	11/29/12	Office conference with team re: research.	1.80	1,242.00	32825009
Fleming, M. J.	11/29/12	Office conference with team re: deposition preparation.	1.90	1,311.00	32825014
Fleming, M. J.	11/29/12	Edited term sheet.	1.20	828.00	32825060
Fleming, M. J.	11/29/12	T/c with J. Penn re: research.	.10	69.00	32825078
Fleming, M. J.	11/29/12	T/c with A. Cordo re: withdrawal notices.	.10	69.00	32825085
Fleming, M. J.	11/29/12	T/c with Paroski.	.20	138.00	32825091
Fleming, M. J.	11/29/12	Prepared for t/c with L. Beckerman, L. Schweitzer and T. Matz.	.20	138.00	32825152
Fleming, M. J.	11/29/12	Email to J. Bromley and L. Schweitzer re: call re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32825168
Fleming, M. J.	11/29/12	Conference with L. Schweitzer, L. Beckerman and T. Matz and follow-up office conference with L. Schweitzer. (1.2) Prep re: same (0.3)	1.50	1,035.00	32825197
Fleming, M. J.	11/29/12	T/c with N. Abularach re: employee issues.	.10	69.00	32825202
Fleming, M. J.	11/29/12	T/c with J. Opolosky re: 2014 statement.	.10	69.00	32825205
Fleming, M. J.	11/29/12	Letter to M. Kohart.	.70	483.00	32825211
Fleming, M. J.	11/29/12	Drafted letter to retiree and related emails.	1.60	1,104.00	32825219
Malone, L.	11/29/12	Employee claims call (0.7).	.70	462.00	32849463
Hurley, R.	11/29/12	Extensive electronic document review for employee issues, per D. Stein.	10.30	1,957.00	32848257
Diaba, L. S.	11/29/12	Research on case issue.	4.10	2,583.00	32834502

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Diaba, L. S.	11/29/12	Drafted short memo on case issue.	1.30	819.00	32834559
Mainoo, A.	11/29/12	Complete responses and objections re: employee issues.	3.10	1,953.00	32794936
Mainoo, A.	11/29/12	Correspondence to N. Forrest regarding transmittal of letter.	.10	63.00	32812209
Erickson, J.	11/29/12	Work on discovery for employee issues, comms D. Stein, N. Abularach, A. Iqbal, V. Lashay re same.	1.00	355.00	32819115
Erickson, J.	11/29/12	Document review management for employee issues.	.50	177.50	32819127
Iqbal, A.	11/29/12	Team meetings to prepare for upcoming depositions.	3.20	1,568.00	32820068
Stein, D. G.	11/29/12	Review documents with regard to Long Term Disability discovery.	1.00	490.00	32824183
Stein, D. G.	11/29/12	Meeting with team with regard to discovery.	1.50	735.00	32824205
Stein, D. G.	11/29/12	Meeting with team with regarding to discovery.	2.00	980.00	32824246
Stein, D. G.	11/29/12	Planning regarding discovery.	.50	245.00	32824255
Uziel, J.L.	11/29/12	Communications with M. Fleming re: employee issues (0.2); Review and comment on exhibits to report (0.5); O/C with team re: employee issues (1.8); O/C w/ team re: same (1.8); T/C with M. Bunda re employee issues (0.1); Review and revise exhibits to report (2.9); Review emails re: same (0.2); Work on preparation for depositions (0.6); O/C with M. Bunda re: export report (0.4); Emails to L. Schweitzer, R. Cooper and B. Bunda re: same (0.6)	9.10	4,459.00	32851090
Kim, J.	11/29/12	Search PACER per R. Ryan.	2.00	510.00	32842120
Kim, J.	11/29/12	Check Nortel Hotline per J. Croft.	.10	25.50	32842137
O'Donohue, A. K	11/29/12	Research into case issue.	.60	249.00	32823863
Tunis, B.	11/29/12	Began review of case issues, on the request of R. Ryan.	3.00	1,245.00	32811780
Xu, D.	11/29/12	Comm. to partner re: employee issues.	.90	373.50	32829037
Roll, J.	11/29/12	Prepared binder of documents in privilege log per D. Stein (0.3); prepared deposition prep binders (6.5).	6.80	1,734.00	32850543
Bromley, J.	11/30/12	Call with L. Schweitzer re mediation (1.0); various ems re same with L. Schweitzer, J. Ray, others	1.30	1,423.50	33103144

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
		(.3)			
Schweitzer, L.	11/30/12	Multiple team e-mails regarding discovery retiree issues.	.50	520.00	32837445
Schweitzer, L.	11/30/12	Telephone call Bromley regarding employee issues.	.60	624.00	32837485
Schweitzer, L.	11/30/12	E-mails Herrington, Kim regarding employee issues.	.30	312.00	32837661
Schweitzer, L.	11/30/12	Telephone call Fleming regarding mediation.	.30	312.00	32837949
Schweitzer, L.	11/30/12	Telephone call Matz regarding mediation.	.30	312.00	32837968
Schweitzer, L.	11/30/12	E-mails Ryan regarding employee issues.	.10	104.00	32837992
Schweitzer, L.	11/30/12	Telephone call Bunda regarding report.	.10	104.00	32838011
Cooper, R. A.	11/30/12	Emails with Forrest and associates regarding deposition locations.	.20	183.00	32842125
Cooper, R. A.	11/30/12	Call with M. Bunda regarding status on report.	.20	183.00	32842164
Cooper, R. A.	11/30/12	Reviewed edits to report.	.20	183.00	32842337
Cooper, R. A.	11/30/12	Reviewed employee issues.	.80	732.00	32842416
Cooper, R. A.	11/30/12	Met with Ryan and MFleming regarding revisions.	.40	366.00	32842632
Cooper, R. A.	11/30/12	Reviewed final edits to documents.	.40	366.00	32842718
Cooper, R. A.	11/30/12	Reviewed draft responses to individual employees.	.50	457.50	32842770
Cooper, R. A.	11/30/12	Call with M. Bunda regarding final report.	.30	274.50	32847795
Forrest, N.	11/30/12	Review of employee claims (.50) and conf call Seyfarth, M. Fleming, J. Penn re same (1.0). Read email re deposition scheduling, various internal emails re same (.80); sent response and letter raising other open discovery issues transmitting to counsel (.50); review of information re various potential deponents (.70); read report (1.1) and t/c M. Bunda with questions re methodology and assumptions (0.2)	4.80	4,032.00	32838931
Bunda, M.	11/30/12	Finalizing report and arranging for filing and service.	4.90	3,430.00	32847036
Fleming, M. J.	11/30/12	Emails re: deposition with N. Forrest.	.50	345.00	32836230
Fleming, M. J.	11/30/12	Emails to L. Schweitzer re: call.	.20	138.00	32836244
Fleming, M. J.	11/30/12	Email to J. Ray re: deposition.	.10	69.00	32836266

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Fleming, M. J.	11/30/12	Email to L. Schweitzer re: term sheet.	.20	138.00	32836282
Fleming, M. J.	11/30/12	T/c with J. Penn.	.10	69.00	32836296
Fleming, M. J.	11/30/12	T/c with J. Opolosky re: pleadings.	.10	69.00	32836304
Fleming, M. J.	11/30/12	Email to L. Schweitzer re: employee issues.	.20	138.00	32836320
Fleming, M. J.	11/30/12	Edited term sheet.	2.10	1,449.00	32836333
Fleming, M. J.	11/30/12	T/c with L. Schweitzer.	.20	138.00	32836345
Fleming, M. J.	11/30/12	T/c's with D. Stein.	.20	138.00	32836350
Fleming, M. J.	11/30/12	T/c's with J. Thomson and J. Opolsky.	.20	138.00	32836367
Fleming, M. J.	11/30/12	Email to D. Stein.	.20	138.00	32836376
Fleming, M. J.	11/30/12	T/c with J. Uziel re: census.	.20	138.00	32836384
Fleming, M. J.	11/30/12	T/c with R. Ryan re: letter and objections.	.10	69.00	32836411
Fleming, M. J.	11/30/12	Email to R. Zahralddin and M. Curran.	.50	345.00	32836443
Fleming, M. J.	11/30/12	Office conference with R. Cooper and R. Ryan re: employee issues.	.40	276.00	32836476
Fleming, M. J.	11/30/12	T/c with S. Skelly.	.10	69.00	32836497
Fleming, M. J.	11/30/12	Conference call with Seyfarth and follow-up office conference with N. Forrest and J. Penn. (1) prep re: same (0.1)	1.10	759.00	32836524
Fleming, M. J.	11/30/12	T/c with A. Mainoo.	.20	138.00	32836549
Fleming, M. J.	11/30/12	Email to K. Minyard and A. Newman.	.20	138.00	32836565
Fleming, M. J.	11/30/12	Email to R. Ryan re: letter.	.10	69.00	32836578
Penn, J.	11/30/12	Employee Matters. Prep for telephone call with Seyfarth.	.50	345.00	32845580
Penn, J.	11/30/12	Employee Matters. Telephone call Seyfarth, M. Fleming, N. Forrest.	1.00	690.00	32845606
Reinstein, J. M	11/30/12	Research re: case issue.	1.50	382.50	32825047
Hurley, R.	11/30/12	Extensive electronic document review for employee issues, per D. Stein.	10.30	1,957.00	32848273
Diaba, L. S.	11/30/12	Research on case issues.	4.70	2,961.00	32834533
Mainoo, A.	11/30/12	Review revised Objections and Responses to 30(b)(6) deposition notice.	.20	126.00	32821291
Mainoo, A.	11/30/12	Telephone conference with M. Fleming regarding	.20	126.00	32826117

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
		depositions.			
Mainoo, A.	11/30/12	Correspondence to and from R. Ryan regarding revision to deposition.	.10	63.00	32826120
Mainoo, A.	11/30/12	Correspondence to and from Ms. Cordo regarding service of subpoenas.	.30	189.00	32826185
Erickson, J.	11/30/12	Work on discovery for employee issues, comms D. Stein, N. Abularach, A. Iqbal, V. Lashay re same.	.80	284.00	32839507
Iqbal, A.	11/30/12	Review of documents for deposition prep binder.	6.00	2,940.00	32915604
Stein, D. G.	11/30/12	Review documents with regard to motion.	4.00	1,960.00	32842886
Uziel, J.L.	11/30/12	Review and edit report and exhibits (2.2); T/C with J. Roll re: employee issues (0.1); T/C with M. Fleming re: same (0.2); Email to E. Smith (Nortel) re: same (0.1); T/C with J. Penn re: same (0.1); Review materials and draft response to Retiree Committee data questions (0.8); Review and edit notice of filing (0.3); T/C with R. Ryan re: employee issues (0.1); Review report (0.3); Emails to J. Ray, R. Levin and employee re: report (0.3); Review emails re: employee issues (0.1); Email to M. Fleming re: employee issues (0.2); T/C with D. Stein re: same (0.1); O/C with M. Bunda re: report (0.3)	5.20	2,548.00	32853149
Kim, J.	11/30/12	Prepare proofs of claim per R. Ryan.	1.00	255.00	32842512
Kim, J.	11/30/12	Check nortel hotline per J. Croft.	.10	25.50	32842703
Tunis, B.	11/30/12	Finished research regarding case issues and began drafting email summarizing my findings, as R. Ryan requested.	4.20	1,743.00	32825721
Tunis, B.	11/30/12	Conducted research for N. Forrest regarding case issues, as requested by M. Fleming. Emailed with N. Forrest to discuss my findings.	1.80	747.00	32825731
Roll, J.	11/30/12	Prepared deposition prep binders	5.20	1,326.00	32860015
Zahoroda, Y.	11/30/12	Docket update.	.30	45.00	32850413
		MATTER TOTALS:	1,424.20	799,842.00	

MATTER: 17650-014 INTELLECTUAL PROPERTY

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Carew-Watts, A.	11/01/12	Call re litigant claim; pre-strategy for all-day meeting.	1.80	1,134.00	32670456
Carew-Watts, A.	11/05/12	Prepare for meeting.	.40	252.00	32670574
Ilan, D.	11/05/12	Cfc re jointly owned patents and corres Megan St. Ledger (0.7); additional corres re patents (0.5)	1.20	948.00	32664278
Carew-Watts, A.	11/06/12	Meetings with litigant/Nortel.	6.50	4,095.00	32670605
Ilan, D.	11/06/12	Revise notices for jointly owned patents	1.00	790.00	32641422
Croft, J.	11/08/12	Reviewing IP issues side agreements and emails with L Schweitzer and M Kennedy re same.	.50	345.00	32670852
Ilan, D.	11/13/12	Corres bidding re patents (0.7); cf Megan St. Ledger re assignments (0.2)	.90	711.00	32696581
Ilan, D.	11/14/12	Corres re patents with M. Hearn	.60	474.00	32706747
Ilan, D.	11/15/12	cfc Chris Hunter (0.3); corres M. Hearn re patents (0.3)	.60	474.00	32782276
Ilan, D.	11/29/12	corres re IP issues.	.50	395.00	32816806
		MATTER TOTALS:	14.00	9,618.00	

MATTER: 17650-019 FEE AND EMPLOYMENT APPLICATIONS

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Coleman, R.	11/02/12	Comms w/ J. Sherrett, M. Kahn re: fee app; preparation re: same	.40	196.00	32589801
Sherrett, J. D.	11/02/12	Comms re Sept fee app.	.20	113.00	32630213
Coleman, R.	11/03/12	Comm w/ M. Ryan, M. Kahn re: fee app (.2); work on tracking (.2); attention to scheduling (.2)	.60	294.00	32595534
Brod, C. B.	11/05/12	Conference and e-mail Sherrett (.20).	.20	219.00	32819160
Coleman, R.	11/05/12	Comms w/ J. Sherrett, M. Kahn, M. Ryan, J. Erickson, M. Bunda, others re: fee app (1.5); attention to scheduling (.2); revising same (.4); work on disbursements (.5);	2.60	1,274.00	32622262
Erickson, J.	11/05/12	Work on September fee app, comms J. Sherrett, M. Ryan re same	1.20	426.00	32630694
Sherrett, J. D.	11/05/12	Working on Sept fee app and comms w/ team re same.	.80	452.00	32627705
Kahn, M.	11/05/12	Comm re: fee app w/ R. Coleman (0.2). Team comm. (0.2)	.40	166.00	32630515
Brod, C. B.	11/06/12	Conference Sherrett re Sept fee app.(.10).	.10	109.50	32819733
Coleman, R.	11/06/12	Comms and coordination w/ J. Sherrett, M. Kahn, M. Ryan, M. Bunda, C. Brod, others re: fee app (1.6); work regarding same (3.5); attention to scheduling (.2); scheduling monthly diary review meeting (.3); work on tracking (.4)	6.00	2,940.00	32633618
Erickson, J.	11/06/12	Work on September fee app, comms J. Sherrett, M. Ryan re same.	1.00	355.00	32641739
Sherrett, J. D.	11/06/12	Finalizing Sept fee app for filing (1.7); email to J. Bromley re same (0.1); email to H. Zelbo re same (0.1); emails w/ A. Cordo re same (0.1); email to Nortel billers re Oct fee app (0.1).	2.10	1,186.50	32637525
Kahn, M.	11/06/12	Working on disbursements chart (3.8). Team communications re Sept fee app. (0.6)	4.40	1,826.00	32640015
Coleman, R.	11/07/12	Comms w/ J. Erickson, M. Kahn, M. Ryan re: fee app (.2); mtg w/ M. Kahn re: same (.7); prep re: same (.2); attention to scheduling (.1); work regarding fee app (.2)	1.40	686.00	32641913
Erickson, J.	11/07/12	Work on October disbursements for fee app.	.80	284.00	32657099
Kahn, M.	11/07/12	Meeting w/ R. Coleman re: fee app (0.7). Prep re: same (0.1). Team comm. (0.1)	.90	373.50	32655557
Brod, C. B.	11/08/12	Conference re: status and invoice (.30).	.30	328.50	32820190

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Coleman, R.	11/08/12	Ems re: diaries w/ J. Sherrett (.1), A. Abelev (.1), D. Diaz (.1), J. Penn (.1), J. Cornelius (.1), P. Marette (.1), V. Vergara (.1), N. Rodriguez (.1), B. Taylor (.1); Calls re: diaries with J. Sherrett (.1), R. Lombasso (.1), J. Defonte (.1), G. Flores (.1), P. Coppola (.1); comm w/ M. Ryan re: diaries (.1); comm re: disbursements w/ M. Kahn (.1), J. Erickson re: disbursements (.2), M. Ryan (.1), M. Larkin (.1); em from A. Cordo re: fee app (.1)	2.10	1,029.00	32657493
Sherrett, J. D.	11/08/12	Call w/ R. Coleman re Oct fee app (0.1); email re same (0.1); email to M. Cook re fee estimates (0.1); call w/ M. Ryan re same (0.1).	.40	226.00	32659541
Kahn, M.	11/08/12	Team comm re: fee app.	.10	41.50	32663706
Coleman, R.	11/09/12	Comm re: diaries w/ J. Cornelius (.1), P. O'Keefe (.1); attention to scheduling (.2); comm w/ M. Kahn re: meeting (.1); comms w/ M. Kahn, M. Ryan, J. Erickson re: disbursements (.5); meeting w/ M. Kahn re: same (.4); work regarding same (.1); preparing documents re: diaries (.2)	1.70	833.00	32663453
O'Keefe, P.	11/09/12	Prepare diaries for review (.50) Review October time details (1.70) E-mail to E. Bussigel regarding diary entry (.10) Communications with M.V. Ryan (Billing Dept.) regarding latest diaries (.20) Prepared latest version of diaries for review and assigned to team (.50).	3.00	930.00	32668280
Erickson, J.	11/09/12	Work on October disbursements for fee app.	.30	106.50	32677257
Sherrett, J. D.	11/09/12	Call w/ M. Ryan re Oct fee app (0.1); email to L. Schweitzer re same (0.1); email to M. Ryan re same (0.1).	.30	169.50	32671037
Kahn, M.	11/09/12	Fee app meeting w/ R. Coleman (0.4). Prep re: same (0.1). Fee app comm (0.1). Fee app work (1.3)	1.90	788.50	32673886
Coleman, R.	11/10/12	October diary review	1.40	686.00	32676834
Erickson, J.	11/11/12	October diary review.	1.00	355.00	32677823
Kahn, M.	11/11/12	Diary review (1.6). Disbursements work (0.4)	2.00	830.00	32671447

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Coleman, R.	11/12/12	Meeting with M. Kahn re: disbursements (including coordinated work on same) (1.2); prep re: same (.1); comm w/ same re: meeting (.1); comms w/ M. Ryan, M. Kahn, J. Erickson, B. Miller, Lawyers Travel re: disbursements (1.3); comm w/ V. Vergara re: diaries (.1); comm w/ M. Ryan re: diaries (.1); comm w/ K. Klein re: diary review mtg (.1); sending diary docs to M. Ryan (.1)	3.10	1,519.00	32676965
O'Keefe, P.	11/12/12	Communications with M.V. Ryan (Billing Dept.) regarding fee application (.10) Communications with D. Stein regarding same (.10) Review of October time details for firm fee application (2.80)	3.00	930.00	32680103
Erickson, J.	11/12/12	October disbursements.	.10	35.50	32687486
Uziel, J.L.	11/12/12	October Diary Review	1.00	490.00	32828536
Sherrett, J. D.	11/12/12	Diary review for Oct fee app (0.4); emails to team re Oct fee app (0.1).	.50	282.50	32679701
Kahn, M.	11/12/12	Meeting w/ R. Coleman re: disbursements (1.2) and prep re: same (0.1). Work on fee app (3.1). Comm re: same (0.4)	4.80	1,992.00	32685726
Fleming, M. J.	11/13/12	Emails to R. Ryan re: fee application.	.20	138.00	32782463
Coleman, R.	11/13/12	Comms and coordinations with M. Ryan, M. Kahn, Lawyers Travel, others regarding fee app (.9); work regarding same (3.5)	4.40	2,156.00	32691729
Malone, L.	11/13/12	October diary review (1.5).	1.50	990.00	32841851
Opolsky, J. R.	11/13/12	October diary review.	2.70	1,525.50	32777035
Bagarella, L.	11/13/12	October diary review.	2.50	1,575.00	32790881
Klein, K.T.	11/13/12	October diary review	1.70	1,071.00	32691743
Erickson, J.	11/13/12	October diary review.	.10	35.50	32695203
Kostov, M.N.	11/13/12	October diary review (1.4)	1.40	791.00	32750238
Sherrett, J. D.	11/13/12	Logisitics for Oct fee app (0.3); emails w/ K. Klein and L. Bagarella re diary review for Oct fee app (0.1); emails w/ J. Erickson re Oct fee app (0.1); call w/ J. Erickson re same (0.1); email to R. Ryan re same (0.1).	.70	395.50	32691501
Kahn, M.	11/13/12	Fee app work (disbursements) and comm re: same.	2.90	1,203.50	32693428
Coleman, R.	11/14/12	Comm w/ M. Kahn re: disbursements (.2); work regarding same (.6); communications with M.	1.00	490.00	32695685

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
		Kahn, others regarding diaries (.2)			
Malone, L.	11/14/12	Fee application (1.0); e-mails re: fee application (0.4).	1.40	924.00	32842030
Bagarella, L.	11/14/12	October diary review.	1.50	945.00	32790909
Klein, K.T.	11/14/12	October diary review	3.00	1,890.00	32695947
Erickson, J.	11/14/12	October diary review.	.60	213.00	32705872
Sherrett, J. D.	11/14/12	Emails w/ A. Wu re Oct fee app (0.1); diary review for Oct fee app (0.2).	.30	169.50	32698949
Kahn, M.	11/14/12	October Diary Review and comms re: same.	2.90	1,203.50	32701853
Coleman, R.	11/15/12	Comms w/ J. Sherrett, M. Kahn re: fee app (.4); work regarding same (.5)	.90	441.00	32712837
Erickson, J.	11/15/12	October diary review.	.10	35.50	32718159
Sherrett, J. D.	11/15/12	Email to J. Erickson re Oct fee app diaries (0.1); diary review for Oct fee app (1.2); o/c w/ R. Coleman re Oct fee app (0.1).	1.40	791.00	32712367
Kahn, M.	11/15/12	Drafting fee app motion and comm re: same.	1.40	581.00	32715774
Brod, C. B.	11/16/12	Conference Sherrett (.10).	.10	109.50	32846209
Coleman, R.	11/16/12	Attention to scheduling (.1); updating same (.1)	.20	98.00	32717548
Coleman, R.	11/16/12	Attention to scheduling (.1); updating same (.1); comm w/ J. Sherrett, M. Kahn re: fee app (.2)	.40	196.00	32718591
Erickson, J.	11/16/12	October diary review, comms J. Sherrett and M. Ryan re same	2.20	781.00	32727343
Sherrett, J. D.	11/16/12	Comms w/ J. Erickson re Oct fee app (0.1); comms w/ M. Ryan re same (0.1); revising Oct fee app motion and comms w/ C. Brod re same (1.1).	1.30	734.50	32723044
Brod, C. B.	11/17/12	Review October Fee App. (1.50).	1.50	1,642.50	32848683
Sherrett, J. D.	11/17/12	Comms w/ J. Bromley and C. Brod re Oct fee app.	.10	56.50	32726627
Brod, C. B.	11/18/12	Review October Fee Application (4.00).	4.00	4,380.00	32848731
Brod, C. B.	11/19/12	Review excluded diaries (.70); telephone call and conference Shettett (.30).	1.00	1,095.00	32848879
Coleman, R.	11/19/12	Comm and coordination with C. Brod, J. Sherrett, M. Kahn, M. Ryan, P. O'Keefe, J. Karpf, others regarding fee app (.7); work on same (.6); attention to scheduling (.1)	1.40	686.00	32731695

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Erickson, J.	11/19/12	October diary review	2.30	816.50	32734208
Sherrett, J. D.	11/19/12	Working on Oct fee app (0.2); comms w/ M. Kahn re quarterly fee app (0.2); comms w/ B. Miller re Oct fee app (0.1); email to M. Ryan re same (0.1); diary review for Oct fee app and comms re same (1.0).	1.60	904.00	32733411
Kahn, M.	11/19/12	Monthly fee app work and comms re: same (1.1). Quarterly fee app work and comms re: same (1.4).	2.50	1,037.50	32743119
Schweitzer, L.	11/21/12	Fee app e-mails.	.10	104.00	32845538
Schweitzer, L.	11/20/12	Fee apps.	.10	104.00	32779334
Brod, C. B.	11/20/12	E-mails Sherrett (.20).	.20	219.00	32850071
Coleman, R.	11/20/12	Comm w/ J. Sherrett, M. Kahn re: fee app (.2); work regarding same (.7); attention to scheduling (.1)	1.00	490.00	32743410
Sherrett, J. D.	11/20/12	Finalizing Oct fee app for filing (1.0); comms w/ M. Ryan re quarterly fee app (0.1); drafting quarterly fee app (0.4); comms w/ R. Coleman and M. Kahn re same (0.1).	1.60	904.00	32743264
Kahn, M.	11/20/12	Work on Quarterly Fee app and comms re: same.	.60	249.00	32746000
Coleman, R.	11/21/12	Comm w/ J. Sherrett, M. Ryan, A. Stout, L. Hobby, others re: call (.4); attention to scheduling (.1)	.50	245.00	32749965
Sherrett, J. D.	11/21/12	Finalizing quarterly fee app (1.7); call w/ C. Brod re same (0.1); comms w/ M. Ryan re same (0.1); email to A. Cordo re same (0.1).	2.00	1,130.00	32750865
Coleman, R.	11/26/12	Comm w/ J. Sherrett, M. Ryan, K. Ponder, A. Stout re: year end call (.2); scheduling same (.1); attention to scheduling (.1)	.40	196.00	32767519
Fleming, M. J.	11/27/12	Email to R. Ryan re: fee application.	.10	69.00	32825451
Coleman, R.	11/27/12	Comm w/ J. Sherrett, others re: fee app (.1)	.10	49.00	32783741
Klein, K.T.	11/27/12	Quarterly and monthly diary review	.60	378.00	32790811
Sherrett, J. D.	11/27/12	Email to K. Klein re fee app issue.	.10	56.50	32782683
Sherrett, J. D.	11/27/12	Reviewing pleadings and comms w/ C. Brod and J. Bromley.	.30	169.50	32783256
Kahn, M.	11/27/12	Comms re Oct fee app.	.10	41.50	32788022
Coleman, R.	11/29/12	Comm w/ M. Ryan re: fee app (.2); work regarding same (.4); comm w/ P. O'Keefe re: scheduling (.1)	.70	343.00	32809006

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Brod, C. B.	11/30/12	Conference call with Sherrett, Coleman, Ryan, Stout (.30).	.30	328.50	32853272
Coleman, R.	11/30/12	Comm w/ J. Sherrett, M. Ryan, others re: call with Nortel (.2); call with Nortel (.3); preparation regarding same (.2)	.70	343.00	32822759
Sherrett, J. D.	11/30/12	Email to C. Brod re call w/ Nortel (0.1); comms w/ R. Coleman and M. Ryan re same (0.1); email to M. Ryan re CNO for Sept fee app (0.1); call w/ Nortel (0.3).	.60	339.00	32821853
MATTER TOTALS:			111.40	58,332.50	

MATTER: 17650-021 LITIGATION

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Kim, J.	10/01/12	T/C w/ D. Herrington and L. Schweitzer (partial) re: litigation (.6), work re: litigation (.8), e-mails to M. Kostov re: same (.2).	1.60	1,136.00	32800407
Kim, J.	10/02/12	Work re: employee litigation (4.5).	4.50	3,195.00	32801337
Kim, J.	10/03/12	E-mails to M. Alcock re: employee litigation (.4), e-mail to R. Ryan re: employee litigation (.1), work re: employee litigation (.8).	1.30	923.00	32808606
Kim, J.	10/04/12	Team mtg re: employee litigation (partial) (.8), work re: employee litigation (3.8).	4.60	3,266.00	32801469
Kim, J.	10/05/12	E-mail to L. Schweitzer re: litigation (.1), e-mail to P. McDonald re: same (.1), e-mails to A. Gilbert re: same (.3), work re: employee litigation (1.2).	1.70	1,207.00	32808684
Kim, J.	10/08/12	Review correspondence re: litigation (.3), work re: employee litigation (1.5).	1.80	1,278.00	32801828
Kim, J.	10/09/12	Work re: litigation.	1.50	1,065.00	32802896
Kim, J.	10/10/12	Work re: litigation (.9).	.90	639.00	32808758
Kim, J.	10/11/12	Prep re: meeting w/ D. Herrington (.5), Mtg w/ D. Herrington re: litigation (.6), T/C w/ J. Vanacore re: litigation (.3), e-mail to Nortel re: same (.1), e-mails to L. Schweitzer re: employee litigation (.4), e-mails to J. Ray re: employee litigation (.3), work re: employee litigation (.9), work re: litigation (1.2).	4.30	3,053.00	32804250
Kim, J.	10/12/12	Work re: litigation (.4).	.40	284.00	32804287
Kim, J.	10/15/12	T/C w/ L. Beckerman, T. Matz, D. Herrington re: employee litigation and follow-up e-mail re: same (.6), work re: employee litigation (.4), e-mail to J. Vanacore re: litigation (.1).	1.10	781.00	32804319
Kim, J.	10/16/12	Work re: employee litigation (1.5), work re: litigation (.3).	1.80	1,278.00	32804402
Kim, J.	10/17/12	E-mail to L. Malone re: employee litigation (.1), work re: litigation (1.7).	1.80	1,278.00	32804474
Kim, J.	10/18/12	Work re: employee litigation (1.0), e-mails with J. Ray, L. Schweitzer, D. Herrington, L. Beckerman, T. Matz, R. Keach re: employee litigation (1.2).	2.20	1,562.00	32804539
Kim, J.	10/19/12	Work re: litigation (.4).	.40	284.00	32804924
Kim, J.	10/22/12	Work re: employee litigation.	1.20	852.00	32807486
Kim, J.	10/23/12	T/C w/ L. Beckerman, L. Schweitzer, T. Matz re:	3.20	2,272.00	32807536

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
		litigation (.4), follow-up work re: employee litigation (2.5), e-mail to J. Ray re: same (.2), e-mail to L. Beckerman & T. Matz re: same (.1).			
Kim, J.	10/24/12	E-mails to C. Ezie re: employee litigation (.3), work re: employee litigation (.6).	.90	639.00	32807576
Kim, J.	10/25/12	E-mail to R. Keach re: employee litigation (.1), work re: employee litigation (.6).	.70	497.00	32807612
Kim, J.	10/26/12	Work re: litigation document.	4.50	3,195.00	32807636
Kim, J.	10/29/12	E-mails re: litigation issues (.4).	.40	284.00	32808771
Kim, J.	10/30/12	Review agenda re: meeting (.1), e-mail to D. Herrington re: litigation document (.1).	.20	142.00	32808789
Kim, J.	10/31/12	E-mails re: employee litigation (.5), e-mails re: litigation (.4).	.90	639.00	32808820
Kim, J.	11/01/12	T/C w/ D. Herrington re: litigation (.3), t/c w/ Nortel re: litigation (1.6), follow-up e-mails to D. Herrington, J. Vanacore (.3), e-mails to D. Herrington, B. Keach re: employee litigation (.2), t/c w/ D. Herrington, J. Vanacore, J. Wood re: litigation (.3), work re: litigation (.4), e-mails to D. Herrington, Nortel re: call (.4), e-mails to H. Chaiton re: meeting (.1), work re: employee litigation (2.0)	5.60	3,976.00	32821289
Herrington, D.	11/01/12	conference call with counsel for NNL and monitor re litigation issues and prep in advance (1.90); call with Jane Kim and with counsel for litigant re litigation issues (.30) and emails re same (0.50).	2.70	2,443.50	32616357
Herrington, D.	11/01/12	emails re litigation issues.	.30	271.50	32616468
Anderson, J.	11/01/12	Revisions to litigation document; email to L Schweitzer re same.	.90	508.50	32670614
Kim, J.	11/02/12	Prep work re: litigation meeting (1.1), work re: employee litigation (2.2), e-mail to J. Ray re: employee litigation (.2)	3.50	2,485.00	32821316
Herrington, D.	11/02/12	Emails re litigation issues.	.40	362.00	32616941
Kim, J.	11/04/12	E-mails to J. Wood re: agenda (.3), e-mails to attendees re: meeting (.6), e-mails to B. Gibbon re: litigation (.2)	1.10	781.00	32821327

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Kim, J.	11/05/12	Prep for litigation meeting (.8), work on litigation document (3.2), t/c w/ L. Beckerman, D. Herrington, L. Schweitzer, T. Matz re: employee litigation (1.0), follow-up work re: same (.2), e-mail to J. Ray re: same (.3)	5.50	3,905.00	32821332
Herrington, D.	11/05/12	emails regarding strategy for litigation issues and call with counsel to UCC and bondholders regarding same (0.90).	.90	814.50	32635223
Herrington, D.	11/05/12	Emails regarding litigation issues.	.40	362.00	32635227
Anderson, J.	11/05/12	Email to J. Ray re litigation issues.	.30	169.50	32694327
Anderson, J.	11/05/12	Emails re litigation issues.	.40	226.00	32694392
Kim, J.	11/06/12	Meeting w/ litigant and break-out meetings w/ Nortel (8.0), e-mails to B. Keach re: employee litigation (.2), e-mail to J. Ray re: same (.1)	8.30	5,893.00	32821890
Herrington, D.	11/06/12	meeting with litigant and NNL and preparation in advance.	6.90	6,244.50	32855236
Anderson, J.	11/06/12	Emails re litigation issues with Nortel and J. Kolodner.	.90	508.50	32694722
Kim, J.	11/06/12	Assist J. Roll in preparing Caselaw binders to distribute.	1.00	255.00	32678947
Kim, J.	11/07/12	Revise litigation document (.1), e-mail to B. Keach re: same (.1), e-mail to L. Beckerman & T. Matz re: employee litigation (.1), e-mail to J. Ray re: meeting (.8), e-mail to G. Storr re: litigation (.2), e-mails and t/c w/ M. Kostov and R. Ryan re: employee litigation (.5), work re: employee litigation (3.5), e-mail to B. Keach re: employee litigation (.2)	5.50	3,905.00	32821894
Herrington, D.	11/07/12	Emails regarding draft litigation document.	1.00	905.00	32857070
Herrington, D.	11/07/12	emails regarding follow-up steps from meeting with litigant.	.90	814.50	32857202
Anderson, J.	11/07/12	Email with D. Parker (Nortel) re: litigation issues.	.10	56.50	32694969
Kostov, M.N.	11/07/12	Communication w J. Kim, R. Ryan and paralegals re litigation issues (2.3)	2.30	1,299.50	32698957
Kim, J.	11/07/12	Work on document per M. Kostov.	.90	229.50	32679026
Roll, J.	11/07/12	Searched for documents & corr. w/ M. Kostov & R. Ryan re same (1.2); Cross-checked documents per M. Kostov & R. Ryan (2.2).	3.40	867.00	32691248

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Kim, J.	11/08/12	Work re: employee litigation document (4.9), work re: employee litigation issues (1.5), review subpoena (.2), e-mails to T. Ross re: same (.2), t/c w/ R. Sewell re: subpoena (.2), e-mails to L. Schweitzer re: same (.3), e-mails to L. Schweitzer & D. Herrington re: litigation (.2)	7.50	5,325.00	32821900
Herrington, D.	11/08/12	Emails re litigation issues.	.50	452.50	32857488
Anderson, J.	11/08/12	Emails with D. Stein and M. Fleming re litigation issues.	.40	226.00	32698573
Kim, J.	11/09/12	T/c w/ D. Herrington re: litigation (.4), emails to R. Ryan, M. Kostov, C. Brown re: employee litigation (.7), email to J. Ray re: litigation (.5), work re: employee litigation (1.8).	3.40	2,414.00	32817490
Herrington, D.	11/09/12	Emails re litigation issues (.4) and call w/ J. Kim re same.	.80	724.00	32858461
Herrington, D.	11/09/12	Emails re litigation issues.	.30	271.50	32858759
Anderson, J.	11/09/12	Comms from counsel for litigant; email to J. Kolodner re same.	.10	56.50	32698713
Anderson, J.	11/09/12	Email with G. White (litigant's counsel) re document request.	.20	113.00	32698725
Anderson, J.	11/09/12	Meeting with J. Kolodner re litigation issues; email to G. White re same.	.60	339.00	32698735
Kostov, M.N.	11/09/12	Communication w J. Kim and R. Ryan re litigation issues (.4)	.40	226.00	32678514
Roll, J.	11/09/12	Pulled documents chart per M. Kostov.	.10	25.50	32696583
Kim, J.	11/11/12	Email re: litigation (.1)	.10	71.00	32817514
Anderson, J.	11/12/12	Email to M. Fleming and D. Parker re litigation issues.	.60	339.00	32770208
Forrest, N.	11/13/12	Email exchange M. Vanek re litigation issues.	.50	420.00	32707653
Kim, J.	11/13/12	T/c w/ T. Matz re: employee litigation (.1), work re: employee litigation (3.7), emails re: litigation (.2), t/c w/ S. Dearing re: employee litigation (.4), email to L. Schweitzer re: employee litigation (.3), emails to L. Beckerman, T. Matz re: same (.2), email to D. Herrington re: same (.3)	5.20	3,692.00	32817679
Gibbon, B.H.	11/13/12	Communications with Jane Kim re next steps.	.40	284.00	32698809
Anderson, J.	11/13/12	Preparation for call w D Parker re litigation issues; call w D Parker; emails to J Kolodner and J Moak re same.	1.00	565.00	32733209

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Dearing, S. C.	11/13/12	Conversation with J. Kim about research assignment (.30); Research and draft memo re case issues (4.2).	4.50	1,867.50	32691815
Kim, J.	11/14/12	Review research re: litigation (.4), email to S. Dearing re: research (.2)	.60	426.00	32817730
Gibbon, B.H.	11/14/12	Em to D. Herrington re litigation issues.	.50	355.00	32711887
Anderson, J.	11/14/12	Emails w G White, J Moak, and D Parker re litigation issues.	.90	508.50	32729192
Kostov, M.N.	11/14/12	Research re case issues (4.8)	4.80	2,712.00	32799915
Dearing, S. C.	11/14/12	Update J. Kim on research (.6); Research and draft memo on case issues (7.7).	8.30	3,444.50	32700055
Forrest, N.	11/15/12	T/c and emails S. Sado re litigation issues and read emails between D Herrington and S. Sado re same.	1.50	1,260.00	32720371
Kim, J.	11/15/12	T/c w/ L. Schweitzer, L. Beckerman, A. Lilling. T. Matz re: employee litigation (.9) and follow-up re same (.1). Review research re: case issue and email to M. Kostov re: same (1.3), work re: employee litigation (2.8), emails to B. Gibbon & D. Abbott re: employee litigation (.4)	5.50	3,905.00	32817903
Herrington, D.	11/15/12	Emails regarding litigation issues.	.80	724.00	32847877
Herrington, D.	11/15/12	Emails regarding litigation issues.	.70	633.50	32847888
Anderson, J.	11/15/12	Email to J Kolodner re litigation issues.	.10	56.50	32727838
Kostov, M.N.	11/15/12	Research and summary re litigation issues (2); communication w J. Kim re same, revision to litigation document (1.2)	3.20	1,808.00	32799922
Dearing, S. C.	11/15/12	Research and draft memo on case issues.	5.10	2,116.50	32706939
Kim, J.	11/16/12	E-mails w/ D. Abbott, L. Schweitzer re: employee litigation (.4), t/c w/ D. Abbott re: same (.2), work re: employee litigation (.3)	.90	639.00	32821971
Herrington, D.	11/16/12	Emails regarding research on case issues (0.80); calls and emails regarding litigation issues (0.80).	1.60	1,448.00	32852895
Gibbon, B.H.	11/16/12	Work on litigation document.	3.50	2,485.00	32729019
Gibbon, B.H.	11/16/12	Ems and calls re litigation issues.	.50	355.00	32729029
Roll, J.	11/16/12	Pulled and printed cases per B. Gibbon.	1.50	382.50	32742064
Gibbon, B.H.	11/18/12	Work on litigation document for D. Herrington.	9.00	6,390.00	32820259
Kostov, M.N.	11/18/12	Circulated info re litigation document.	.30	169.50	32750205

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Kim, J.	11/19/12	E-mail to B. Gibbon re: employee litigation (.2), e-mail to D. Herrington re: litigation (.1), e-mail to J. Wood re: litigation (.1), e-mail to S. Watson re: litigation (.1), review correspondence re: litigation (.4)	.90	639.00	32821991
Herrington, D.	11/19/12	Review of materials (.1) and meeting with L. Lipner re litigation issues (.8), research case issues (.1)	1.00	905.00	32737890
Herrington, D.	11/19/12	Calls and emails re litigation issues.	.70	633.50	32737980
Gibbon, B.H.	11/19/12	Work on litigation document for D. Herrington.	6.00	4,260.00	32747394
Anderson, J.	11/19/12	Email to T Ross (Nortel) re litigation issues; follow-up call w D Parker (Nortel).	.60	339.00	32738745
Kostov, M.N.	11/19/12	Review of litigation document.	1.20	678.00	32750189
Forrest, N.	11/20/12	Various emails and t/cs re litigation issues.	1.00	840.00	32777208
Sado, S.	11/20/12	Respond to request to produce documents.	1.30	858.00	32800846
Sado, S.	11/20/12	Telephone call with L. Schweitzer and D. Herrington regarding document production request.	.30	198.00	32800930
Kim, J.	11/20/12	E-mail to D. Herrington re: employee litigation (.1), review e-mails re: employee litigation (.5)	.60	426.00	32822002
Herrington, D.	11/20/12	Emails regarding litigation issues.	.90	814.50	32777763
Anderson, J.	11/20/12	Emails w J Kolodner and D Parker re litigation issues.	.20	113.00	32747728
Kostov, M.N.	11/20/12	Review of communication (.4); prepare litigation document; communicate w team re same (.8)	1.20	678.00	32799978
Kim, J.	11/21/12	E-mail to S. Dearing re: litigation (.1), review e-mails re: litigation (.2)	.30	213.00	32822017
Herrington, D.	11/21/12	Emails regarding litigation issues .	.30	271.50	32853106
Anderson, J.	11/21/12	Email to J. Kolodner re litigation issues.	.10	56.50	32771632
Kim, J.	11/24/12	Review correspondence re: litigation (.6), e-mails to team re: same (.3)	.90	639.00	32822042
Dearing, S. C.	11/25/12	Researched and drafted memo on case issues for J. Kim.	4.80	1,992.00	32760952
Kim, J.	11/26/12	Review research re: litigation (.8), email to team re: same (.3), t/c w/ D. Abbott, L. Schweitzer, A. Cordo re: employee litigation and follow-up re: same (.6), t/c w/ M. Kostov re: employee litigation (.1), work re: employee litigation (2.6).	4.40	3,124.00	32817960

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Herrington, D.	11/26/12	Review and comment on draft litigation document.	.70	633.50	32777859
Kostov, M.N.	11/26/12	Call w/ S. Dearing (re DCP) (.2); review filing (.1); work on litigation document, comm w J. Kim re same, e-mail to team re same (2.4)	2.70	1,525.50	32807341
Kim, J.	11/26/12	Work on litigation document per M. Kostov.	.30	76.50	32841172
Dearing, S. C.	11/26/12	Researched and wrote memo for J. Kim re: case issues.	5.90	2,448.50	32774919
Roll, J.	11/26/12	Updated litigation document per M. Kostov.	1.40	357.00	32849982
Lipner, L.	11/27/12	Correspondence re litigation issues (.2); internal discussions re litigation issues (1.5); correspondence w/Matt Bunda re same (.3).	2.00	1,320.00	32851574
Kim, J.	11/27/12	E-mail to L. Schweitzer & D. Herrington re: employee litigation (.3), T/C w/ D. Herrington re: employee litigation (.3), e-mail to S. Dearing re: same (.1), review research re: case issue (.8), t/c w/ S. Dearing re: research (.2), Mtg with team re: employee litigation and follow-up call with L. Beckerman re: same (1.5), follow-up e-mails re: employee litigation (.3), Work O/C with M. Fleming re: LTD issues (0.6) re: employee litigation (0.6), review work product re: litigation (.3), e-mails to D. Herrington, J. Wood, Nortel re: litigation (.4)	5.40	3,834.00	32819610
Herrington, D.	11/27/12	review of research regarding case issues and meeting with team regarding same (2.10).	2.10	1,900.50	32855147
Anderson, J.	11/27/12	Emails re litigation document.	.20	113.00	32790736
Anderson, J.	11/27/12	Emails re litigation document.	.10	56.50	32790742
Dearing, S. C.	11/27/12	Researched and wrote memo for J. Kim re: case issues (3); Follow up with J. Kim on research (.1); Preparation for meeting with team (1); Meeting with team (2.5).	6.60	2,739.00	32783259
Schweitzer, L.	11/28/12	Telephone call Coleman, Hailey regarding litigation issues.	.50	520.00	32848849
Kim, J.	11/28/12	E-mails to L. Schweitzer, D. Herrington re: employee litigation (.2), T/C w/ P. McDonald, L. Beckerman, T. Matz and team re: employee litigation (1.0), Follow-up e-mails re: same (1.2), T/C w/ D. Abbott re: same and follow-up e-mail (.7), e-mail to Nortel re: litigation (.1)	3.20	2,272.00	32819644
Herrington, D.	11/28/12	call with litigant's counsel regarding litigation issues and emails regarding same (0.90); emails regarding litigation issues (0.30).	1.20	1,086.00	32854983

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Gibbon, B.H.	11/28/12	Emails and calls with D. Herrington et al re litigation issues.	.30	213.00	32821868
Anderson, J.	11/28/12	Emails re litigation issues with Nortel and opposing counsel.	.70	395.50	32820753
Kostov, M.N.	11/28/12	Research re case issues (1)	1.00	565.00	32846711
Dearing, S. C.	11/28/12	Reviewed request for research re: case issues from L. Schweitzer.	.40	166.00	32800920
Uziel, J.L.	11/29/12	Email to J. Croft and R. Eckenrod re: litigation issues (0.1); Email to T. Minott re: same (0.1); Update case calendar (0.2); Draft calendar email to team (0.2); Email to L. Scwheitzer and J. Bromley re: litigation issues (0.1)	.70	343.00	32851154
Schweitzer, L.	11/29/12	E-mails regarding lit issues, follow-up work regarding same.	.30	312.00	32839733
Kim, J.	11/29/12	E-mails with L. Schweitzer, D. Herrington and A. Cordo re: litigation issues (.7), t/c w/ A. Cordo re: same (.1).	.80	568.00	32843353
Anderson, J.	11/29/12	Email with D. Parker re litigation issues.	.10	56.50	32823184
Kim, J.	11/30/12	E-mails to L. Schweitzer & D. Herrington re: employee litigation (.4), T/Cs and communications with D. Herrington, A. Cordo, P. McDonald and others re: conference (.5), t/c w/ P. McDonald re: conference (.1), e-mail to D. Herrington & L. Schweitzer re: same (.1), work re: employee litigation (1.5).	2.60	1,846.00	32843598
Herrington, D.	11/30/12	Calls and emails regarding litigation issues	1.00	905.00	32854240
Anderson, J.	11/30/12	Drafting email to J. Bordolon re litigation issues (0.9); meeting with J. Kolodner re same (0.3); call with J. Bordolon re same. (.6)	1.80	1,017.00	32851923
Anderson, J.	11/30/12	Call with T. Ross (Nortel) re litigation issues	.40	226.00	32851979
MATTER TOTALS:			240.10	157,434.50	

MATTER: 17650-025 REAL ESTATE

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
Cerceo, A. R.	11/01/12	E-mail to J. Panas regarding condemnation action at leased site	.20	126.00	32852710
Cerceo, A. R.	11/06/12	Review of e-mail from A. Lane	.30	189.00	32750049
Cerceo, A. R.	11/06/12	Review of lease documents	.20	126.00	32750054
Cerceo, A. R.	11/07/12	review of e-mail from T. Ross (Nortel) re: subtenant financial reports and preparation for call w/ Nortel on same.	.30	189.00	32858346
Cerceo, A. R.	11/13/12	Call with T. Ross and A. Lane regarding divestiture tenant security deposit issues	.50	315.00	32750796
Schweitzer, L.	11/15/12	A. Cerceo e-mails, K. Blacklow telephone call regarding leased site issue.	.30	312.00	32718244
Croft, J.	11/15/12	Call with A Cerceo and K Blacklow re action (.3); follow-up emails with same and L Schweitzer re same (.3); reviewing documents re same (.3); call with Megan Fleming re ordinary course professionals (.1).	1.00	690.00	32722983
Cerceo, A. R.	11/15/12	Draft e-mail to subtenant regarding security deposit requirement	1.50	945.00	32750864
Cerceo, A. R.	11/15/12	Review of condemnation action	1.70	1,071.00	32750873
Schweitzer, L.	11/16/12	Work on answer including multiple telephone calls, e-mails J. Ferguson, J. Croft, etc. regarding same.	1.60	1,664.00	32842116
Croft, J.	11/16/12	Emails with A Cerceo re action (.2); meeting with L Schweitzer re same (.4); call with A Lane and A Cerceo re same (.5); emails with opposing counsel and local counsel re same (.5); emails with L Schweitzer, K Blacklow and A Cerceo re same (.4).	2.00	1,380.00	32728663
Cerceo, A. R.	11/16/12	Prep for meeting (.2). Meeting with J. Croft and A. Lane regarding condemnation proceeding (.5).	.70	441.00	32750907
Cerceo, A. R.	11/16/12	Review of underlying transaction documents	1.30	819.00	32750919
Cerceo, A. R.	11/16/12	E-mail to K. Blacklow regarding condemnation	.50	315.00	32750932
Cerceo, A. R.	11/16/12	Draft letter agreement regarding sublease of space	.80	504.00	32750940
Cerceo, A. R.	11/19/12	Miscellaneous e-mails regarding condemnation	.30	189.00	32751141
Schweitzer, L.	11/20/12	J. Croft, A. Cerceo e-mails regarding proceeding, review letter regarding same.	.40	416.00	32779379
Croft, J.	11/20/12	Call with A. Cerceo and J. Ferguson (.5). Follow up emails with same, L. Schweitzer and K.	2.10	1,449.00	32768426

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
		Blacklow, including reviewing relevant agreements (1.2). Reviewing agreement (.2). Reviewing notices (.2).			
Cerceo, A. R.	11/20/12	Call regarding condemnation with J. Ferguson and J. Croft	.50	315.00	32853386
Cerceo, A. R.	11/20/12	Review of purchase and sale agreement for leased site and other documents in connection with same	.80	504.00	32853403
Cerceo, A. R.	11/20/12	Preparation of e-mail to subtenant regarding security deposit requirements	.40	252.00	32853431
Cerceo, A. R.	11/20/12	Miscellaneous e-mails	.60	378.00	32853446
Schweitzer, L.	11/26/12	Meeting Croft, Cerceo regarding leased site (.4); prep re:same (.1)	.50	520.00	32846286
Croft, J.	11/26/12	Meeting with L. Schweitzer and A. Cerceo re action (.4); prep for same (.2); follow-up emails with local counsel and clients re same (.5); follow-up emails with L. Schweitzer and A. Cerceo re same (.3).	1.40	966.00	32777774
Cerceo, A. R.	11/26/12	Review of summary of case issues from A. Kelly	.30	189.00	32853659
Cerceo, A. R.	11/26/12	Mtg with L. Schweitzer and J. Croft(.4); follow up re: same (.3).	.70	441.00	32853746
Cerceo, A. R.	11/26/12	Prep for call with L. Schweitzer and J. Croft	.30	189.00	32853765
Cerceo, A. R.	11/26/12	Review of lease documents	.20	126.00	32853786
Cerceo, A. R.	11/26/12	Miscellaneous e-mails with A. Lane and T. Ross regarding subtenant security deposits	.30	189.00	32853822
Croft, J.	11/28/12	Call with opposing counsel, local counsel, team (.6). Follow-up call with K. Blacklow and A. Cerceo (.2). Follow-up emails with L. Schweitzer, A. Cerceo and K. Blacklow (.7).	1.50	1,035.00	32801673
Cerceo, A. R.	11/28/12	Call regarding condemnation.	1.00	630.00	32849140
Cerceo, A. R.	11/28/12	E-mail to A. Lane and T. Ross regarding sublease	.30	189.00	32849155
Cerceo, A. R.	11/28/12	Miscellaneous e-mails regarding condemnation with J. Croft, K. Blacklow and L. Schweitzer	.30	189.00	32849178
Schweitzer, L.	11/29/12	Croft e-mails regarding condemnation litigation.	.60	624.00	32838600
Schweitzer, L.	11/29/12	Review draft answer.	.30	312.00	32838624
Croft, J.	11/29/12	Calls and emails with local counsel re answer to action (.5 hours). Reviewing answer (1 hour). Reviewing underlying documents (.5). Emails with L. Schweitzer, A. Cerceo, K. Blacklow, J.	2.50	1,725.00	32816393

<u>NAME</u>	<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>INDEX</u>
		Ray, T. Ross, A. Lane re same (.5).			
Cerceo, A. R.	11/29/12	E-mail regarding subtenant financial information	.10	63.00	32849614
Cerceo, A. R.	11/29/12	E-mails from local counsel regarding condemnation	.20	126.00	32849642
Croft, J.	11/30/12	Call with J Ferguson (.2); emails re action with L Schweitzer, K Blacklow, A Cerceo, J Ray, T Ross (.6)	.80	552.00	32845132
		MATTER TOTALS:	29.30	20,654.00	